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OVER
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

MARCH 2026 AUCTION RESULTS

BOARD SALE RESULTS

FSC®

106552 TIGER STRIPES Clallam OLY 2962 $1,168,544.46 $394.51 3.00$686,000.00 Murphy Company70%

109533 Q BIG HORN 

SORTS

Ferry NE 1732 ($347,801.36) ($200.81) 1.25($397,437.50) See Sort Sales Results-12%

107253 BISCUITS Grays Harbor, 

Thurston

SP 4255 $1,948,582.00 $457.95 3.00$1,287,000.00 Sierra Pacific Industries51%

108466 MAPLE GROUNDS Jefferson OLY 7384 $1,589,859.00 $215.31 2.00$1,027,000.00 Sierra Pacific Industries55%

109135 SYNERGIZE Lewis PC 4111 $1,715,484.67 $417.29 4.00$1,165,000.00 Murphy Company47%

107327 ATONAL Skagit NW 2307 $867,392.13 $375.98 2.00$652,000.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.33%

110002 Q CROWN CREEK 

FIRE SALVAGE

Stevens NE 11874 $1,199,400.52 $101.01 1.00$1,132,000.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.6%

105209 CHAI Thurston, Grays 

Harbor

SP 7046 $2,962,768.00 $420.49 3.00$2,334,000.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.27%

107989 FLEA FLICKER Wahkiakum PC 7946 $2,301,221.71 $289.61 2.00$985,000.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.134%

SALES

OFFERED

9

SALES

SOLD

9

SALES

NO BID

0

VOLUME

OFFERED

49,617

VOLUME

SOLD

49,516

VOLUME

NO BID

101

% VOL

SOLD

100%

TOTAL MIN

BID SOLD SALES

$8,879,147.82

BID PRICE

SOLD SALES

$13,405,451.13

PRICE

/MBF

$270.73

%

OVER

51%

AVG #

BIDS

2.36

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

March 2026

SALES

PENDING

0

VOLUME

PENDING

0

51 48 3 244,163 229,392 14,771 95% $51,881,449.84 $72,593,156.42 $316.46 40% 2.70YTD FY 2026 0 0

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

VOLUME

AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT

 MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER

108472 DOWN UNDI Clallam OLY 1283 $60,000.00 $64,210.80 $50.05 7% 2.00 Harbor Timber

109736 Q HOPE FIRE Stevens NE 2289 $36,000.00 $54,501.20 $23.81 51% 2.00 C & C Timber, Inc.

SALVAGE 

REOFFER

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #

BIDSOFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER

March 2026 2 2 0 0 3,572 3,572 0 0 100% $96,000.00 $118,712.00 $33.23 24% 2.00

YTD FY 2026 18 17 0 1 24,876 23,284 0 1,592 94% $1,656,000.00 $2,540,828.71 $109.12 53% 1.88

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

VOLUME

11 0 0 100% $13,524,163.13

SALES

NO BID

2.30

OVER

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

VOLUME PRICE

/MBFSOLD

SALES

OFFERED

SALES

SOLD OFFERED

VOLUME

NO BID SOLD

%

11

VOLUME % VOL BID PRICE

SOLD SALES

AVG #

BIDSPENDING

SALES

PENDING

TOTAL MIN

BID SOLD SALES

March 2026 0 53,189 53,088 101 $8,975,147.82 $254.75 51%

69 65 0 4 269,039 252,676 0 16,363 $53,537,449.84 $75,133,985.13 $297.3595% 40%YTD FY 2026 2.48

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

MENT

APPARENTPRICE # OF

Stumpage Determination (Projected)

AGREE- OFFERED MINIMUM 

TOTAL 

BID NAME OF SALE MINIMUM 

Delivered Values

FSC TOTAL BID 

VOLUME

($60,094.80)

($84,539.45)

691

HIGH BIDDER

109893

Q BIG HORN SORT 01

LLC.

Boise Cascade Wood Products, 

$530.00109891

Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.

$528.00

BIDS

Boise Cascade Wood Products, 

Q BIG HORN SORT 03

PRICE / MBF BID MBF

Q BIG HORN SORT 02

LLC.

$375.23

($269.95)$565.02 2

DF/WL 7-10" dib

BID / MBF

109890 ($186,536.20)

442 ($75,564.80) ($135.96)

/MBFPRICE 

$565.00

($212,117.02)

$375.23

1

DF/WL 11"+

109 ($84,539.45)109892 ($775.59) 1

PP 6-12" dib

34 ($9,909.17) NO BIDS

PP 13"+ dib

Q BIG HORN SORT 05 389 $320.05 ($16,630.91) ($16,630.91) ($42.75) 1

Q BIG HORN SORT 04 $407.00

$320.05

0

109894 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.

DF/WL 5-6" dib

109895 Q BIG HORN SORT 06 067 $1,323.85

All conifer species except WRC 2"+ u

$234.00 NO BIDS




