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%
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

FEBRUARY 2026 AUCTION RESULTS

BOARD SALE RESULTS

FSC®

104869 LOST GLOVE Lewis SPS 4560 $985,070.59 $216.02 1.00$842,000.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.17%*
108855 CLOSER Lewis PC 8648 $3,774,661.00 $436.48 4.00$2,348,000.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.61%
109053 LEGO MY LOGGO Lewis PC 2889 $1,358,923.64 $470.38 6.00$922,000.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.47%
106706 WOOD WASP CH 

Sorts
Skagit NW 1034 $63,848.70 $61.75 1.50$56,761.42 See Sort Sales Results12%

109736 Q HOPE FIRE 
SALVAGE

Stevens NE 2289 $217,000.00 NO BIDS

105207 GHOST Thurston, Grays 
Harbor

SPS 6841 $4,335,344.17 $633.73 5.00$2,482,000.00 Stella-Jones Corporation75%

SALES
OFFERED

6

SALES
SOLD

5

SALES
NO BID

1

VOLUME
OFFERED

26,261

VOLUME
SOLD

23,972

VOLUME
NO BID

2,289

% VOL
SOLD

91%

TOTAL MIN
BID SOLD SALES

$6,650,761.42

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

$10,517,848.10

PRICE
/MBF

$438.76

%
OVER

58%

AVG #
BIDS

3.50

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

February 2026

SALES
PENDING

0

VOLUME
PENDING

0
42 39 3 194,546 179,876 14,670 93% $43,002,302.02 $59,187,705.29 $329.05 38% 2.74YTD FY 2026 0 0

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS
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/MBF

# OF
BIDS
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FSC®

109131 Q SWISS Okanogan NE 2532 $302,063.26 $119.30$145,000.00 2.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, 
LLC.

108%

SALES
OFFERED

1

SALES
SOLD

1

SALES
NO BID

0

VOLUME
OFFERED

2,532

VOLUME
SOLD

2,532

VOLUME
NO BID

0

% VOL
SOLD

100%

TOTAL MIN
BID SOLD SALES

$145,000.00

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

$302,063.26

PRICE
/MBF

$119.30

%
OVER

108%

AVG #
BIDS

2.00

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

February 2026

SALES
PENDING

0

VOLUME
PENDING

0
16 15 1 21,304 19,712 1,592 93% $1,560,000.00 $2,422,116.71 $122.88 55% 1.87YTD FY 2026 0 0



7 6 1 28,793 26,504 2,289 92%
58 54 4 215,850 199,588 16,262 93% $44,562,302.02 $61,609,822.00 $308.69 38% 2.50

$6,795,761.42 $10,819,911.36 $408.24 59% 3.25

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

February 2026
YTD FY 2026

0
0

SALES
OFFERED

SALES
SOLD

SALES
NO BID

VOLUME
OFFERED

VOLUME
SOLD

VOLUME
NO BID

% VOL
SOLD

TOTAL MIN
BID SOLD SALES

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

PRICE
/MBF

%
OVER

AVG #
BIDS

SALES
PENDING

VOLUME
PENDING

0
0

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

AGREE-
MENT

NAME OF SALE
VOLUME
OFFERED

 MBF
MINIMUM 
BID / MBF

PRICE
/MBF

# OF
BIDS

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

BID 
PRICE / MBF

TOTAL 
MINIMUM 

BID
TOTAL BID 

PRICE 

Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)

FSC

108043 1,010 $625.00 1 Sierra Pacific Industries$56.31$632.00 $49,801.00 $56,871.00

108044 24 $625.00 2 Great Western Sawmill, LLC.$290.74$625.72 $6,960.42 $6,977.70

WOOD WASP Sort 02
DF 12"-19"
WOOD WASP Sort 03
DF 20"+




