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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

JANUARY 2026 AUCTION RESULTS

BOARD SALE RESULTS

FSC®

107564 ROCKY ROAD Clallam OLY 3057 $856,700.00 $280.24 1.00$854,000.00 Alaska Pacific Trucking, Inc.0%
106781 COPPER HEAD 

VRH
Clark PC 3683 $1,766,612.00 $479.67 3.00$1,218,000.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.45%

108187 DENDROPHOBIA Clark PC 2233 $1,187,225.00 $531.67 5.00$867,000.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.37%
107565 BOULDER Jefferson OLY 9457 $1,778,779.58 $188.09 2.00$1,279,000.00 Harbor Timber39%
105263 HOLD ON Mason SPS 1323 $536,666.66 $405.64 6.00$323,000.00 Grose Construction Co., Inc.66%
108348 SINCERELY 

LISTENING
Pacific PC 3521 $1,304,894.00 $370.60 3.00$875,000.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.49%

106706 WOOD WASP CH 
Sorts

Skagit NW 1818 $122,936.89 $67.62 1.00$121,244.29 See Sort Sales Results1%

107250 BEETS Thurston SPS 2333 $908,476.96 $389.40 2.00$770,000.00 Murphy Company18%
109134 HAMSKI Wahkiakum PC 4918 $1,468,034.00 $298.50 3.00$655,000.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.124%

SALES
OFFERED

9

SALES
SOLD

9

SALES
NO BID

0

VOLUME
OFFERED

32,343

VOLUME
SOLD

32,327

VOLUME
NO BID

16

% VOL
SOLD

100%

TOTAL MIN
BID SOLD SALES

$6,963,186.89

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

$9,930,325.09

PRICE
/MBF

$307.18

%
OVER

43%

AVG #
BIDS

2.89

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

January 2026

SALES
PENDING

0

VOLUME
PENDING

0
37 35 2 169,295 156,914 12,381 93% $36,308,243.60 $49,393,805.81 $314.78 36% 2.63YTD FY 2026 0 0

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)
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REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

FSC®

108341 TOP NOTCH VRH 
SWT

Snohomish NW 1680 $226,464.72 $134.80 1.00$170,000.00 C & C Timber, Inc.33%

109991 CARPENTER 
CONNECTION 
UNIT 2

Snohomish NW 503 $145,952.25 $290.16 2.00$103,000.00 C & C Timber, Inc.42%

SALES
OFFERED

2

SALES
SOLD

2

SALES
NO BID

0

VOLUME
OFFERED

2,183

VOLUME
SOLD

2,183

VOLUME
NO BID

0

% VOL
SOLD

100%

TOTAL MIN
BID SOLD SALES

$273,000.00

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

$372,416.97

PRICE
/MBF

$170.60

%
OVER

36%

AVG #
BIDS

1.50

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

January 2026

SALES
PENDING

0

VOLUME
PENDING

0
15 14 1 18,772 17,180 1,592 92% $1,415,000.00 $2,120,053.45 $123.40 50% 1.86YTD FY 2026 0 0



11 11 0 34,526 34,510 16 100%
52 49 3 188,067 174,094 13,973 93% $37,723,243.60 $51,513,859.26 $295.90 37% 2.41

$7,236,186.89 $10,302,742.06 $298.54 42% 2.64

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

January 2026
YTD FY 2026
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0
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%
OVER
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PENDING

VOLUME
PENDING

0
0

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

AGREE-
MENT

NAME OF SALE
VOLUME
OFFERED

 MBF
MINIMUM 
BID / MBF

PRICE
/MBF

# OF
BIDS

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

BID 
PRICE / MBF

TOTAL 
MINIMUM 

BID
TOTAL BID 

PRICE 

Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)

FSC

108042 591 $625.00 1 Sierra Pacific Industries$269.07$625.00 $159,018.78 $159,018.78

108043 1,010 $700.00 1 Sierra Pacific Industries($59.50)$700.00 ($60,097.00) ($60,097.00)

108044 24 $700.00 1 Sierra Pacific Industries($6.19)$700.00 ($148.62) ($148.62)

108045 48 $500.00 1 Sierra Pacific Industries$131.36$500.00 $6,305.15 $6,305.15

108046 110 $525.00 1 Sierra Pacific Industries$169.07$525.00 $18,597.40 $18,597.40

108047 19 $339.47 1 Port Angeles Hardwood($38.89)$378.95 ($1,488.82) ($738.82)

108048 16 $225.00 0 NO BIDS($942.60)

WOOD WASP Sort 01
DF 5"-11"
WOOD WASP Sort 02
DF 12"-19"
WOOD WASP Sort 03
DF 20"+
WOOD WASP Sort 04
WW 5"-11"
WOOD WASP Sort 05
WW 12"-19"
WOOD WASP Sort 06
RA  5"+
WOOD WASP Sort 07
DF Pulp 2"+




