AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY
108462 CHARLIE QUEBEC Clallam
108186 MERLIN Grays Harbor
105533 LEAPING Lewis

THESPIAN SORTS
108347 EMANCIPATOR Lewis
108113 SALMONBERRY Pacific
107299 HONEST ABE Skagit
108112 RICOCHET Skamania
108336 CARPENTER Snohomish
CONNECTION
VRH BLOWDOWN
SALVAGE
107578 MALUA Whatcom
SALES SALES  SALES SALES
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID
December 2025 9 8 1
YTD FY 2026 29 26 3

AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY
109242 MERIT BADGE Snohomish
BLOWDOWN
SALVAGE
SALES SALES SALES SALES
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID
December 2025 1 1 0
YTD FY 2026 13 12 1

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DECEMBER 2025 AUCTION RESULTS

BOARD SALE RESULTS
VOLUME
REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
OLY 9918 $1,144,000.00 $1,745,687.00 $176.01 53% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
PC 5757 $1,676,000.00 $2,337,488.00 $406.03 39% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
PC 940 $398,231.10 $398,231.10 $423.65 0% 1.50 See Sort Sales Results
PC 3805 $1,136,000.00 $1,737,793.00 $456.71 53% 4.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
PC 4831 $702,000.00 $1,158,305.99 $239.77 65% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
NW 2030 $485,000.00 $513,738.00 $253.07 6% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
PC 2718 $437,000.00 $486,152.41 $178.86 11% 1.00 NW Timber, LLC.
NW 2199 $353,000.00 $508,233.00 $231.12 44% 4.00 Erickson Logging, Inc.
NW 2467 $388,000.00 NO BIDS
SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES
VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS
34,665 32,198 0 2,467 93% $6,331,231.10 $8,885,628.50 $275.97 40% 2.44
147,275 124,588 0 22,687 85% $29,345,056.71 $39,463,480.72 $316.75 34% 2.50
REGIONAL SALE RESULTS
VOLUME
REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
NW 1445 $231,000.00 $348,770.00 $241.36 51% 3.00 Erickson Logging, Inc.
SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES
VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS
1,445 1,445 0 0 100% $231,000.00 $348,770.00 $241.36 51% 3.00
16,589 14,997 0 1,592 90% $1,142,000.00 $1,747,636.48 $116.53 53% 1.92

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)



December 2025
YTD FY 2026

AGREE- FSC
MENT

109117

109124

SALES
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NOBID OFFERED

SALES  SALES

10 9 0
42 38 0

NAME OF SALE

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 1
DF 5"-11"

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 8
RC 5"+

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

SALES

4

VOLUME
OFFERED
MBF

931

36,110
163,864

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN
SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES
33,643 0 2,467 93% $6,562,231.10
139,585 0 24,279 86% $30,487,056.71
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)
Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)
TOTAL
MINIMUM BID MINIMUM TOTAL BID PRICE
BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE /MBF
$600.00 $600.00 $391,798.30 $391,798.30 $420.84
$1,000.00 $1,000.00 $6,432.80 $6,432.80 $714.76

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

$9,234,398.50
$41,211,117.20

PRICE %
/MBF OVER

AVG #
BIDS

$274.48 41% 2.50
$295.24 35% 2.32

# OF APPARENT
BIDS HIGH BIDDER
2 Sierra Pacific Industries
1 Port Angeles Hardwood





