DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
NOVEMBER 2025 AUCTION RESULTS

BOARD SALE RESULTS
VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE IMBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
107566 SOOEY Clallam oLY 3344 $748,000.00 $1,138,847.28 $340.56 52% 3.00 Murphy Company
107976 TURNOVER Clark PC 6133 $1,903,000.00 $2,204,955.48 $359.52 16% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
109169 SMYKOWSKIVRH  Cowlitz pPC 8460 $1,639,000.00 $2,513,663.36 $297.12 53% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
VDT
107252 SCHRUTE Grays Harbor SP 4062 $1,292,000.00 $1,875,197.97 $461.64 45% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
107829 SUZIE Q Grays Harbor PC 2878 $936,000.00 $989,974.23 $343.98 6% 2.00 Murphy Company
108473 WALLEYE Jefferson oLy 8741 $1,854,000.00 $1,903,134.00 $217.72 3% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
105533 LEAPING Lewis pPC 6055 $3,591,489.04 $3,410,991.04 $563.33 -5% 2.13 See Sort Sales Results
THESPIAN SORTS
107774 AUGER IN Pacific PC 2584 $695,000.00 $991,354.00 $383.65 43% 3.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products,
L.P.
107266 *  WINGSUIT SWT Pierce SP 2524 $597,000.00 $853,765.50 $338.26 43% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
108548 Q LINDSAY ROAD  Stevens NE 4543 $1,262,000.00 $1,359,940.72 $299.35 8% 1.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products,
LLC.
SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES
SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #

OFFERED SOLD PENDING NOBID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BIDSOLD SALES SOLD SALES /IMBF  OVER BIDS

November 2025 10 10 0 0 49,324 48,384 0 940  100% $13,903,339.04 $17,241,823.58 $356.35 24% 2.31
YTD FY 2026 22 19 0 3 116,017 92,390 0 23,627 80% $23,516,339.04 $31,080,365.65 $336.40 32% 2.53

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION  OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE IMBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
108483 Q TIDYMAN Klickitat SE 341 $42,000.00 $52,599.15 $154.25 25% 1.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
107990 STREUSEL SWT Snohomish NW 1637 $73,000.00 $104,731.02 $63.98 43% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
VRH
108541 SQUIRE SWT VDT  Snohomish NW 1705 $96,000.00 $271,395.03 $159.18 183% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES
SALES SALES  SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #

OFFERED SOLD PENDING NOBID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /IMBF  OVER BIDS

November 2025 3 3 0 0 3,683 3,683 0 0 100% $211,000.00 $428,725.20 $116.41 103% 1.00
YTD FY 2026 12 11 0 1 15,144 13,552 0 1,592 89% $911,000.00 $1,398,866.48 $103.22 54% 1.82

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)



November 2025
YTD FY 2026
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SALES
OFFERED SOLD PENDING

SALES  SALES

13 13 0
34 30 0
NAME OF SALE

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 1
DF 5"-11"

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 2
DF 12"-19"

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 3
DF 20"+

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 4
DF HQ 12"+

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 5
DF POLES 40'+

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 6
WW 5"+

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 7

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 8
RC 5"+

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 9
DF/TF Pulp 2"+

LEAPING THESPIAN SORT 10
Hardwood Pulp 2"+

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME
NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING
0 53,007 52,067 0
4 131,161 105,942 0
Delivered Values
VOLUME
OFFERED MINIMUM BID
MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF
931 $650.00
1,673 $675.00 $700.00
1,646 $650.00 $685.00
1,414 $725.00 $933.00
221 $900.00 $1,075.00
61 $450.00 $450.00
83 $360.84 $360.84
9 $1,000.00
11 $338.00 $390.00
6 $338.00 $481.00

VOLUME
NO BID

940
25,219

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

% VOL
SOLD

100%
81%

$14,114,339.04
$24,427,339.04

TOTAL MIN
BID SOLD SALES

Stumpage Determination (Projected)

TOTAL
MINIMUM
BID

$605,150.00

$955,794.91

$899,219.65

$878,526.66

$198,900.00

$21,124.67

$21,343.40

$9,000.00

$1,572.19

$857.56

TOTAL BID
PRICE

$997,619.91

$956,829.65

$1,172,638.66

$237,575.00

$21,124.67

$21,343.40

$2,144.19

$1,715.56

PRICE
/MBF

$596.31

$581.31

$829.31

$1,075.00

$346.31

$257.15

$194.93

$285.93

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

$17,670,548.78
$32,479,232.13

# OF
BIDS

PRICE % AVG #
/IMBF  OVER BIDS

$339.38 25% 2.01
$306.58 33% 2.27

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

NO BIDS

Murphy Company

Swanson Brothers Lumber
Company, Inc.

Canyon Lumber Company, Inc.

Stella-Jones Corporation

Sierra Pacific Industries

Port Angeles Hardwood

NO BIDS

Willis Enterprises

Cascade Hardwood, LLC.





