AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY
107512 TYEE WEST Clallam
108970 PLACE STATION Clallam
107565 BOULDER Jefferson
107265 *  PUFFIN Lewis
104867 *  RAILROAD Pierce

CREEK VRH &
VDT
108377 FRAILEY SURE Skagit,
Snohomish
SALES SALES  SALES SALES
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID
October 2025 6 4 2
YTD FY 2026 12 9 3
AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY
109415 Q NAVARRE Chelan
108666 Q COLEMAN Kittitas
108483 Q TIDYMAN Klickitat
109742 Q CRESCENT Lincoln
ROAD SALVAGE

109742 Q CRESCENT Lincoln
ROAD SALVAGE

108180 Q SOUTH Okanogan
TILLMAN

106450 SMALL FRY SWT Snohomish

108587 SULTAN BASIN Snohomish
BLOWDOWN
SALVAGE VRH

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
OCTOBER 2025 AUCTION RESULTS

BOARD SALE RESULTS
VOLUME
REGION  OFFERED MINIMUM BID
MBF BID PRICE

OLY 9898 $1,510,000.00

OLY 1371 $428,000.00 $465,000.00
OLY 10322 $1,927,000.00

SP 5559 $1,205,000.00 $1,820,214.17
SP 3341 $1,147,000.00 $1,811,437.88
NW 3388 $1,135,000.00 $1,146,501.00

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME

OFFERED SOLD PENDING
33,879 13,659 0
66,693 44,006 0

% VOL

NO BID SOLD

20,220
22,687

40%
66%

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

VOLUME
REGION OFFERED MINIMUM
MBF BID
SE 367 $13,000.00
SE 1490 $59,000.00
SE 341 $64,000.00
NE 730 $73,000.00
NE 730 $43,000.00
NE 3390 $159,000.00
NwW 1592 $99,000.00
NwW 967 $156,000.00

BID
PRICE

$59,252.55
$65,333.00

$53,424.30

$263,268.64

$210,620.99

PRICE
/MBF

$339.17

$327.44
$542.18

$338.40

TOTAL MIN

BID SOLD SALES

$3,915,000.00

$9,613,000.00

PRICE
/MBF

$161.45
$43.85

$73.18

$77.66

$217.81

AVG #
BIDS

3.00
2.78

% # OF APPARENT
OVER  BIDS HIGH BIDDER
NO BIDS
9% 2.00 Northwest Busheling, LLC.
NO BIDS
51% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
58% 5.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
1% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
BID PRICE PRICE
SOLD SALES /MBF OVER
$5,243,153.05 $383.86
$13,838,542.07 $314.47
% # OF APPARENT
OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
356% 5.00 C & C Timber, Inc.
11% 1.00 Gibson and Son Road Building, Inc.
NO BIDS
NO BIDS
24% 2.00 Icicle Ridge, LLC.
66% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
NO BIDS
35% 2.00 C & C Timber, Inc.



October 2025
YTD FY 2026

October 2025
YTD FY 2026

SALES

SALES

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE

OFFERED SOLD PENDING NOBID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES

10

SALES

SALES

0 3 9,607 6,944 0 2,663 72% $430,000.00 $651,899.48
0 2 11,802 9,869 0 1,933 84% $700,000.00 $970,141.28

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE

OFFERED SOLD PENDING NOBID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD  BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES

14
22

0 5 43,486 20,603 0 22,883 47% $4,345,000.00 $5,895,052.53
0 5 78,495 53,875 0 24,620 69% $10,313,000.00 $14,808,683.35
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PRICE
/MBF

$93.88
$98.30

PRICE
/MBF

$286.13
$274.87

%
OVER

52%
39%

%
OVER

36%
44%

AVG #
BIDS

2.20
2.13

AVG #
BIDS

2.56
2.47





