
COUNTYAGREEMENT  NAME OF SALE REGION
VOLUME
OFFERED

 MBF
MINIMUM 

BID
BID

PRICE
%

OVER
PRICE
/MBF

# OF
BIDS

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

SEPTEMBER 2025 AUCTION RESULTS

BOARD SALE RESULTS

FSC®

108097 HAPPY HEMLOCK 
VRH

Pacific PC 6,680 $1,438,565.99 $215.35 4.00$728,000.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.98%

SALES
OFFERED

1

SALES
SOLD

1

SALES
NO BID

0

VOLUME
OFFERED

6,680

VOLUME
SOLD

6,680

VOLUME
NO BID

0

% VOL
SOLD

100%

TOTAL MIN
BID SOLD SALES

$728,000.00

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

$1,438,565.99

PRICE
/MBF

$215.35

%
OVER

98%

AVG #
BIDS

4.00

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

September 2025

SALES
PENDING

0

VOLUME
PENDING

0
6 5 1 32,814 30,347 2,467 92% $5,698,000.00 $8,595,389.02 $283.24 51% 2.60YTD FY 2026 0 0

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS
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%

OVER
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# OF
BIDS

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

FSC®

3 3 0 2,925 2,925 0 100% $270,000.00 $318,241.80 $108.80 18% 2.00YTD FY 2026 0 0

1 1 0 6,680 6,680 0 100%
9 8 1 35,739 33,272 2,467 93% $5,968,000.00 $8,913,630.82 $267.90 49% 2.38

$728,000.00 $1,438,565.99 $215.35 98% 4.00

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

September 2025
YTD FY 2026

0
0

SALES
OFFERED

SALES
SOLD

SALES
NO BID

VOLUME
OFFERED

VOLUME
SOLD

VOLUME
NO BID

% VOL
SOLD

TOTAL MIN
BID SOLD SALES

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

PRICE
/MBF

%
OVER

AVG #
BIDS

SALES
PENDING

VOLUME
PENDING

0
0




