DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES TIMBER AUCTION RESULTS - APRIL 2024

BOARD SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT	FSC® NA	AME OF S	ALE CO	DUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID		BID RICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS		RENT BIDDER	
104236	FRUITFUL		Co	wlitz	PC	3053 \$985,000.00		\$1,444,313.27		\$473.08	47%	5.00	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.		
105823	Q V	Q VULCAN		ry	NE	3852	\$519,000.00	\$790,272.02		\$205.16	52% 2.00		Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC		
99064		* TIGERILLA VRH & VDT		wis	SP 2655		\$802,000.00 \$951,885.64		\$358.53	19% 4.00		Murphy Company			
105125	RA	RAPID CREEK		Lewis PC		1980	\$786,000.00	\$1,247,483.00		\$630.04	59%	8.00	Sierra Pacific Inc	lustries	
104126		STEPPING STONE SORTS		rific	PC	7429	\$3,286,689.92 \$2,070,792.87		\$278.74	-37%	1.80	See Sort Sales Results			
104449	KIO VD	CK STAND T	VRH Sno	ohomish	NW	5349	\$780,000.00	\$1,836,8	6,828.04 \$343.40		35%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries		
105477	QO	CHEWEKA	Ste	vens	NE	2785	\$687,000.00	\$906,5	\$906,595.58 \$325.53		32%	2.00	Boise Cascade Wood Products,		icts, LLC
105831	DA	ISY GOLD) Ste	vens	NE	4056	\$771,000.00	\$1,109,7	764.26	\$273.61	44%	2.00	Boise Cascade W	ood Produ	icts, LLC
SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #															
	OFFERED		PENDING	NO BID	OFFERED	SOLD	PENDING	NO BID	SOLD	BID SOLD SALE	s s	SOLD SALES		OVER	BIDS
April 2024	8	8	0	0	31,159	28,771	0	2,388	92%	\$6,951,559.92	\$1	10,357,934.68	\$360.01	49%	3.35
YTD FY 2024	75	75	0	0	313,468	310,651	0	2,817	99%	\$77,207,230.38	\$11	12,969,475.25	\$363.65	46%	3.22
						SUN	MMARY OF RI	EGION SAL	ES						
	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALE	s s	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
YTD FY 2024	13	12	0	1	24,764	24,450	0	314	99%	\$1,721,000.0	0	\$3,103,968.69	\$126.95	80%	2.33
					S	UMMARY O	F ALL BOARD	AND REGIO	ONAL SAI	LES					
	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALI	ES	BID PRICE SOLD SALE		%	AVG # BIDS
April 2024	8	8	0	0	31,159	28,771	0	2,388	92%	\$6,951,559.9	2 \$	10,357,934.68	3 \$360.01	49%	3.35
YTD FY 2024	88	87	0	1	338,232	335,101	0	3,131	99%	\$78,928,230.3	3 \$1	16,073,443.94	\$346.38	47%	3.10

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

April 2024

				ed Values	Stumpa	ge Determination (Pro			
AGREE-	FSC NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED	MINIMUM	BID	TOTAL MINIMUM	TOTAL BID	PRICE	# OF	APPARENT
MENT	rsc Name Of Sale	MBF	BID / MBF	PRICE / MBF	BID	PRICE	/MBF	# OF	HIGH BIDDER
104631	STEPPING STONE SORT 1	1,010	\$675.00	\$744.92	\$334,141.32	\$404,760.52	\$400.75	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
	DF 5"-11"								
104632	STEPPING STONE SORT 2	1,221	\$700.00	\$800.00	\$492,017.81	\$614,117.81	\$502.96	3	Sierra Pacific Industries
	DF 12"-19"								
104633	STEPPING STONE SORT 3	2,320	\$710.00		\$1,647,200.00			0	NO BIDS
	DF 20"+								
104634	STEPPING STONE SORT 4	819	\$775.00	\$800.00	\$400,108.52	\$420,583.52	\$513.53	3	Sierra Pacific Industries
	DF HQ 12"+								
104635	STEPPING STONE SORT 5	301	\$357.07	\$357.07	\$1,174.19	\$1,174.19	\$3.90	1	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
	RA 5"-7"								
104636	STEPPING STONE SORT 6	1,100	\$514.98	\$690.06	\$202,411.29	\$395,007.04	\$359.10	1	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
	RC 8"+, MA 8"+								
104637	STEPPING STONE SORT 7	141	\$1,350.00	\$1,501.00	\$135,629.73	\$156,920.73	\$1,112.91	1	Alta Forest Products, LLC
	RC 5"+								
104638	STEPPING STONE SORT 8	403	\$500.00	\$550.00	\$65,706.32	\$85,856.32	\$213.04	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
	WW 5"+								
104639	STEPPING STONE SORT 9	68	\$263.68		\$17,930.00			0	NO BIDS
	SS 12"+								
104640	STEPPING STONE SORT 10	32	\$325.00	\$325.00	(\$6,895.58)	(\$6,895.58)	(\$215.49)	1	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
	DF SS Pulp 2"+								
104641	STEPPING STONE SORT 11	3	\$325.00	\$325.00	(\$646.46)	(\$646.46)	(\$215.49)	1	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
	WH Pulp 2"+								
104642	STEPPING STONE SORT 12	11	\$325.00	\$507.00	(\$2,087.22)	(\$85.22)	(\$7.75)	3	Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC
	Hardwood Pulp 2"+								