DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

NOVEMBER 2024 AUCTION RESULTS

BOARD SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT FS	C® NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
				MIDI	DID	TRICE	/NIDF	OVER	ырз	HIGH BIDDEK
106483	SILVER VISTA	Clark	PC	3169	\$494,000.00	\$531,084.74	\$167.59	8%	1.00	High Cascade, Inc.
106361	JACKIE PAPER	Grays Harbor	PC	5977	\$1,876,000.00	\$2,358,777.71	\$394.64	26%	3.00	Harbor Timber
103625	NEXT CONTESTANT	Mason	SPS	3549	\$1,698,000.00	\$3,227,737.19	\$909.48	90%	4.00	Stella-Jones Corporation
107099	INTENT	Pacific	PC	3907	\$1,095,000.00	\$1,613,603.00	\$413.00	47%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
104866	JECKLE VRH & VDT	Pierce	SPS	7572	\$2,856,000.00	\$3,945,688.00	\$521.09	38%	4.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
106101	CRACKERBOX	Skagit	NW	5516	\$2,044,000.00	\$3,086,866.34	\$559.62	51%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
104443	CLUTCH VRH VD	T Snohomish	NW	5900	\$1,114,000.00	\$2,116,077.00	\$358.66	90%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
106238	Q GOLD RUSH	Spokane	NE	3393	\$632,000.00	\$891,751.87	\$262.82	41%	4.00	IFG Timber, LLC
106536	YEWTUBE	Wahkiakum	PC	8803	\$1,118,000.00	\$2,916,892.00	\$331.35	161%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
106363	LITTLE LILLY	Whatcom	NW	4005	\$1,592,000.00	\$2,504,261.00	\$625.28	57%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG# BIDS
November 2024	10	10	0	0	51,791	51,791	0	0	100%	\$14,519,000.00	\$23,192,738.85	\$447.81	60%	2.70
YTD FY 2025	29	28	0	1	135,856	130,067	0	5,789	96%	\$33,483,581.20	\$49,306,368.13	\$379.08	47%	2.65

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT F	SC® NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
107742	NEXT LEVEL CEDAR SALVAGE	Jefferson	OLY	15	\$20,000.00	\$22,251.00	\$1,483.40	11%	3.00	JBC Cedar LLC
104215	Bear Creek Cedar Salvage	Skagit	NW	18	\$17,000.00	\$25,155.00	\$1,397.50	48%	2.00	Salvage Monster LLC

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG# BIDS
November 2024	4 2	2	0	0	33	33	0	0	100%	\$37,000.00	\$47,406.00	\$1,436.55	28%	2.50
YTD FY 2025	6	4	0	2	5,813	5,683	0	130	98%	\$319,000.00	\$492,508.07	\$86.66	54%	2.25

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG# BIDS
November 2024	4 12	12	0	0	51,824	51,824	0	0	100%	\$14,556,000.00	\$23,240,144.85	\$448.44	60%	2.67
YTD FY 2025	35	32	0	3	141,669	135,750	0	5,919	96%	\$33,802,581.20	\$49,798,876.20	\$366.84	47%	2.60