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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

JULY 2024 TIMBER AUCTION RESULTS

BOARD SALE RESULTS

FSC®

104814 PISTOL PETE 

SORTS

Clallam OLY 3639 $1,312,927.05 $360.79 1.67$1,102,964.69 See Sort Sales Results19%

106084 Q KLONDIKE Ferry NE 3738 $641,102.67 $171.51 1.00$641,000.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC0%

106142 Q COPPER SWAN Ferry NE 2391 $477,000.00 NO BIDS

93860 STILLY REVISITED Snohomish NW 7930 $3,325,730.00 $419.39 2.00$2,036,000.00 Sierra Pacific Industries63%

106665 LICKETY SPLIT 

SORTS

Wahkiakum PC 2375 $804,620.51 $338.79 1.67$748,216.51 See Sort Sales Results8%

SALES
OFFERED

5

SALES
SOLD

4

SALES
NO BID

1

VOLUME
OFFERED

20,073

VOLUME
SOLD

17,674

VOLUME
NO BID

2,399

% VOL
SOLD

88%

TOTAL MIN
BID SOLD SALES

$4,524,581.20

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

$6,084,380.23

PRICE
/MBF

$344.26

%
OVER

34%

AVG #
BIDS

1.58

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

July 2024

SALES
PENDING

0

VOLUME
PENDING

0

5 4 1 20,073 17,674 2,399 88% $4,524,581.20 $6,084,380.23 $344.26 34% 1.58YTD FY 2025 0 0

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

COUNTYAGREEMENT  NAME OF SALE REGION
VOLUME
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BID

PRICE
%

OVER
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/MBF

# OF
BIDS

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

FSC®

103762 BLUE VIEW Clallam OLY 3162 $123,000.00 NO BIDS

SALES
OFFERED

1

SALES
SOLD

0

SALES
NO BID

1

VOLUME
OFFERED

3,162

VOLUME
SOLD

0

VOLUME
NO BID

3,162

% VOL
SOLD

0%

TOTAL MIN
BID SOLD SALES

$0.00

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

$0.00

PRICE
/MBF

$0.00

%
OVER

0%

AVG #
BIDS

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

July 2024

SALES
PENDING

0

VOLUME
PENDING

0

1 0 1 3,162 0 3,162 0% $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0%YTD FY 2025 0 0

6 4 2 23,235 17,674 5,561 76%

6 4 2 23,235 17,674 5,561 76% $4,524,581.20 $6,084,380.23 $344.26 34% 1.58

$4,524,581.20 $6,084,380.23 $344.26 34% 1.58

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

July 2024
YTD FY 2025

0

0

SALES
OFFERED

SALES
SOLD

SALES
NO BID

VOLUME
OFFERED

VOLUME
SOLD

VOLUME
NO BID

% VOL
SOLD

TOTAL MIN
BID SOLD SALES

BID PRICE
SOLD SALES

PRICE
/MBF

%
OVER

AVG #
BIDS

SALES
PENDING

VOLUME
PENDING

0

0



AGREE-
MENT

NAME OF SALE
VOLUME
OFFERED

 MBF
MINIMUM 
BID / MBF

PRICE
/MBF

# OF
BIDS

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

BID 
PRICE / MBF

TOTAL 
MINIMUM 

BID
TOTAL BID 

PRICE 

Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)

FSC

106408 PISTOL PETE SORT 01 643 $700.00 1 Western Forest Products US LLC$257.49$700.00 $165,567.02 $165,567.02

DF High Quality  B Sort  12" to 19" d

106409 PISTOL PETE SORT 02 1,396 $550.00 2 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.$342.24$600.00 $407,969.11 $477,769.11

DF Sawlog 5" to 11" dib

106410 PISTOL PETE SORT 03 349 $575.00 2 Sierra Pacific Industries$310.10$675.00 $73,325.42 $108,225.42

DF Sawlog 12" to 19" dib

106411 PISTOL PETE SORT 04 72 $550.00 2 Fritch Forest Products, Inc.$399.90$730.00 $15,832.91 $28,792.91

DF Sawlog 20" + dib

106412 PISTOL PETE SORT 05 148 $1,350.00 2 Alta Forest Products, LLC$1,059.43$1,400.00 $149,395.86 $156,795.86

RC Camprun 5" + dib

106413 PISTOL PETE SORT 06 257 $475.00 1 Sierra Pacific Industries$120.42$475.00 $30,948.32 $30,948.32

Whitewood Sawlog 5" to 11" dib

106414 PISTOL PETE SORT 07 46 $475.00 3 Fritch Forest Products, Inc.$204.74$520.00 $7,348.11 $9,418.11

Whitewood Sawlog 12"+ dib

106415 PISTOL PETE SORT 08 199 $450.00 1 Port Angeles Hardwood$294.78$550.00 $38,761.52 $58,661.52

Red  Alder SL 6" + dib

106416 PISTOL PETE SORT 09 4 $225.00 1 Evergreen Fibre($37.82)$227.34 ($160.63) ($151.27)

Conifer Pulp  2" + dib

106417 PISTOL PETE SORT 10 97 $225.00 2 Port Angeles Hardwood($31.16)$234.00 ($3,895.38) ($3,022.38)

Hardwood Pulp 2"+ dib

106418 PISTOL PETE SORT 11 393 $850.00 1 Stella-Jones Corporation$568.60$950.00 $184,160.38 $223,460.38

DF Poles 35'+

106419 PISTOL PETE SORT 12 35 $1,350.00 2 Stella-Jones Corporation$1,613.20$2,000.00 $33,712.05 $56,462.05

Red cedar Poles 35'+

106672 LICKETY SPLIT SORT 1 60 $700.00 1 Sierra Pacific Industries$461.39$700.00 $27,683.21 $27,683.21

DF 5"-19"

106673 LICKETY SPLIT SORT 2 96 $550.00 4 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc.$587.43$755.00 $36,712.98 $56,392.98

DF 20"+

106674 LICKETY SPLIT SORT 3 440 $525.00 1 Sierra Pacific Industries$287.85$535.00 $122,252.60 $126,652.60

WW 5"-11"

106675 LICKETY SPLIT SORT 4 1,735 $525.00 2 Sierra Pacific Industries$325.38$545.00 $529,828.80 $564,528.80

WW 12"+

106676 LICKETY SPLIT SORT 5 24 $1,350.00 1 Alta Forest Products, LLC$1,229.54$1,401.00 $28,284.88 $29,508.88

RC 5"+

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

106677 8 $450.00 0 NO BIDS$3,600.00

106678 12 $325.00 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.($12.16)$325.00 ($145.96) ($145.96)

LICKETY SPLIT SORT 6

RA 5"+

LICKETY SPLIT SORT 7

Pulp 2"+




