DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES SEPTEMBER 2024 AUCTION RESULTS

BOARD SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT	FSC® NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
105955	PENNY PINCHER VRH THIN	Clark	PC	4023	\$1,240,000.00	\$1,633,791.50	\$406.11	32%	5.00	Murphy Company
105537	WEATHERMAN	Grays Harbor	PC	4554	\$1,158,000.00	\$1,451,714.00	\$318.78	25%	3.00	Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
106237	Q CONK	Okanogan	NE	2376	\$353,000.00	\$566,383.93	\$238.38	60%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
106089	RUE BEE	Pacific	PC	7595	\$1,733,000.00	\$2,798,574.94	\$368.48	61%	3.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
106239	Q WANLESS CREEK	Pend Oreille	NE	5781	\$1,505,000.00					NO BIDS
106097	SHADY GROVE VDT	Skamania	PC	4257	\$1,084,000.00	\$1,710,982.52	\$401.92	58%	7.00	NW Timber LLC

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES	SALES	SALES	SALES	VOLUME	VOLUME	VOLUME	VOLUME	% VOL	TOTAL MIN	BID PRICE	PRICE	%	AVG #
	OFFERED	SOLD	PENDING	NO BID	OFFERED	SOLD	PENDING	NO BID	SOLD	BID SOLD SALES	SOLD SALES	/MBF	OVER	BIDS
September 2024 YTD FY 2025	6 14	5 11	0	1 3	28,586 58,793	22,805 47,220	0	5,781 11,573	80% 80%	\$5,568,000.00 \$11,512,581.20	\$8,161,446.89 \$15,782,489.12	\$357.88 \$334.23	47% 37%	4.00 2.58

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG# BIDS
September 2024	6	5	0	1	28,586	22,805	0	5,781	80%	\$5,568,000.00	\$8,161,446.89	\$357.88	47%	4.00
YTD FY 2025	14	11	0	3	58,793	47,220	0	11,573	80%	\$11,512,581.20	\$15,782,489.12	\$334.23	37%	2.58