DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

AUGUST 2024 AUCTION RESULTS

BOARD SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT F	SC® NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
103767	DOC HOLLIDAY	Clallam	OLY	2309	\$594,000.00	\$623,700.00	\$270.12	5%	1.00	Webster Logging
106462	SALMONBERRY SURPRISE	Clallam	OLY	4432	\$826,000.00	\$912,962.00	\$205.99	11%	1.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
106238	Q GOLD RUSH	Spokane	NE	3393	\$780,000.00					NO BIDS

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
August 2024	3	2	0	1	10,134	6,741	0	3,393	67%	\$1,420,000.00	\$1,536,662.00	\$227.96	8%	1.00
YTD FY 2025	8	6	0	2	30,207	24,415	0	5,792	81%	\$5,944,581.20	\$7,621,042.23	\$312.15	28%	1.39

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
August 2024	3	2	0	1	10,134	6,741	0	3,393	67%	\$1,420,000.00	\$1,536,662.00	\$227.96	8%	1.00
YTD FY 2025	9	6	0	3	33,369	24,415	0	8,954	73%	\$5,944,581.20	\$7,621,042.23	\$312.15	28%	1.39