

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

March 2020

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
97642		FOOT TRAIL	Clallam	OLY	6473	\$1,269,000.00	\$1,734,478.00	\$267.96	37%	2.00	Interfor U.S., Inc.
99250		DEAN CREEK DIVIDE VRH	Clallam	OLY	2824	\$894,000.00	\$1,146,649.00	\$406.04	28%	2.00	Interfor U.S., Inc.
98580		PICK UP STICKS	Clark, Skamania	PC	9861	\$2,545,000.00	\$2,903,666.78	\$294.46	14%	1.00	Western Forest Products
98037		MCGONAGALL MANEUVER	Cowlitz	PC	2053	\$552,000.00	\$692,312.10	\$337.22	25%	3.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
99196		OL STRINGER	Jefferson	OLY	4921	\$812,000.00					NO BIDS
95917	*	DINGO DANCE	Lewis	SP	1570	\$413,000.00					NO BIDS
98630		TIDE PODZ SORTS	Lewis, Grays Harbor	PC	111	\$9,688.14					See Sort Sales Results
94094	*	TIP TOP	Mason	SP	4424	\$1,362,000.00					NO BIDS
97377	*	HURDLE	Mason	SP	5684	\$1,842,000.00	\$2,050,540.00	\$360.76	11%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
85082	*	SCATTERED	Pierce	SP	5714	\$1,565,000.00	\$1,904,600.30	\$333.32	22%	4.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
99221		NO BEAR	Skagit	NW	2811	\$603,000.00	\$690,026.06	\$245.47	14%	1.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
98288		BRUSHCRASHER VRH VDT RMZ WMZ	Snohomish	NW	5243	\$1,198,000.00	\$1,415,089.08	\$269.90	18%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
98217		Q SHERRY RIDGE	Stevens, Pend Oreille	NE	5544	\$726,000.00					NO BIDS
98884		ARGOSY	Whatcom	NW	3436	\$1,297,000.00	\$1,478,019.00	\$430.16	14%	3.00	Nielsen Brothers, Inc.
98543		CICADA EGG ROLL RMZ Sorts	Whatcom, Skagit	NW	206	(\$40,810.46)	(\$3,125.94)	(\$15.17)	-92%	2.00	See Sort Sales Results

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
March 2020	15	10	0	4	60,875	44,127	0	16,748	73%	\$11,761,874.06	\$14,012,254.38	\$317.54	19%	2.30
YTD FY 2020	91	81	0	10	406,610	366,087	0	40,523	90%	\$87,815,481.79	\$115,724,774.28	\$316.11	32%	2.60

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
99415		TACOMA CREEK PIT EXPANSION	Jefferson	OLY	326	\$68,000.00					NO BIDS

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
March 2020	1	0	0	1	326	0	0	326	0%	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	0%	
YTD FY 2020	5	4	0	1	5,986	5,660	0	326	95%	\$645,000.00	\$981,706.08	\$173.45	52%	2.75

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES**

March 2020

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
March 2020	16	10	0	5	61,201	44,127	0	17,074	72%	\$11,761,874.06	\$14,012,254.38	\$317.54	19%	2.30
YTD FY 2020	96	85	0	11	412,596	371,747	0	40,849	90%	\$88,460,481.79	\$116,706,480.36	\$313.94	32%	2.60

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	Delivered Values			Stumpage Determination (Projected)				APPARENT HIGH BIDDER	
			VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	# OF BIDS		
98636		TIDE PODZ SORT 6	111	\$300.00		\$9,688.14				0	NO BIDS
99623		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 11	178	\$0.00		(\$37,684.52)				0	NO BIDS
99624		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 12	28	\$175.00	\$175.00	(\$3,125.94)	(\$3,125.94)	(\$111.64)		2	Fritch Mill, Inc.