

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

**August 2023**

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
103770		UPPER SALMON CREEK	Clallam, Jefferson	OLY	6956	\$2,103,000.00	\$3,245,147.47	\$466.52	54%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
104129		DEANS DELIGHT SORTS	Grays Harbor	PC	3151	\$626,754.58	\$1,014,237.76	\$321.88	62%	2.57	See Sort Sales Results
102107	*	LITTLE WRANGLER	Mason	SP	2454	\$705,000.00	\$1,032,041.81	\$420.55	46%	3.00	Murphy Company
103982		FIDDLEHEAD VRH VDT	Skamania	PC	3656	\$691,000.00	\$1,223,383.40	\$334.62	77%	4.00	Murphy Company
104702		BLACK HOLE SALVAGE	Skamania	PC	3789	\$1,041,000.00	\$1,692,747.50	\$446.75	63%	3.00	Chehalis Valley Timber, Inc.
104148		HOG WILD VRH VDT	Snohomish	NW	6292	\$1,174,000.00	\$2,688,950.00	\$427.36	129%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
104583		EXTRA CHRISTIE	Whatcom	NW	734	\$287,000.00	\$410,093.00	\$558.71	43%	5.00	Sierra Pacific Industries

**SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>August 2023</b>	7	7	0	0	27,032	26,871	0	161	100%	\$6,623,242.32	\$11,306,600.94	\$420.77	71%	3.22
<b>YTD FY 2024</b>	10	10	0	0	34,657	34,496	0	161	100%	\$8,358,242.32	\$13,860,753.25	\$401.81	66%	3.26

**REGIONAL SALE RESULTS**

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
104353		ALDERAAN	Clallam	OLY	1130	\$213,000.00	\$295,852.00	\$261.82	39%	2.00	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.

**SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>August 2023</b>	1	1	0	0	1,130	1,130	0	0	100%	\$213,000.00	\$295,852.00	\$261.82	39%	2.00
<b>YTD FY 2024</b>	5	4	0	1	10,453	5,759	0	4,694	55%	\$621,000.00	\$1,034,509.55	\$179.63	67%	2.25

**SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>August 2023</b>	8	8	0	0	28,162	28,001	0	161	100%	\$6,836,242.32	\$11,602,452.94	\$414.36	70%	3.07
<b>YTD FY 2024</b>	15	14	0	1	45,110	40,255	0	4,855	90%	\$8,979,242.32	\$14,895,262.80	\$370.02	66%	2.97

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

August 2023

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)				
				MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
104509		DEANS DELIGHT SORT 1 DF 5"-11"	214	\$550.00	\$843.51	\$21,906.21	\$84,717.35	\$395.88	4	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
104510		DEANS DELIGHT SORT 2 DF 12"-19"	670	\$625.00	\$842.85	\$139,082.26	\$285,041.76	\$425.44	4	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
104511		DEANS DELIGHT SORT 3 DF 20"+	1,314	\$625.00	\$700.00	\$278,272.96	\$376,822.96	\$286.78	2	Buse Timber & Sales, Inc.
104512		DEANS DELIGHT SORT 4 DF HQ 12"+	257	\$750.00	\$950.00	\$109,694.14	\$161,094.14	\$626.83	2	Canyon Lumber Company, Inc.
104513		DEANS DELIGHT SORT 5 RA 5"-7"	124	\$340.00		\$4,793.90			0	NO BIDS
104514		DEANS DELIGHT SORT 6 RA 8"+	313	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$51,837.64	\$51,837.64	\$165.62	1	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
104515		DEANS DELIGHT SORT 7 RC 5"+	18	\$1,250.00	\$1,351.00	\$15,315.76	\$17,133.76	\$951.88	2	Alta Forest Products, LLC
104516		DEANS DELIGHT SORT 8 WW 5"+	204	\$450.00	\$604.20	\$6,133.35	\$37,590.15	\$184.27	3	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
104517		DEANS DELIGHT SORT 9 SS 12"+	10	\$150.00		(\$759.15)			0	NO BIDS
104518		DEANS DELIGHT SORT 10 Conifer Pulp 2"+	25	\$364.00		\$442.14			0	NO BIDS
104519		DEANS DELIGHT SORT 11 Hardwood Pulp 2"+	2	\$364.00		\$35.37			0	NO BIDS