

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

November 2022

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
102081		DELTA CHARLIE	Grays Harbor	SP	4322	\$1,764,000.00	\$2,210,320.00	\$511.41	25%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
103264		LA LA LAND	Grays Harbor	PC	3958	\$1,099,000.00	\$1,293,146.00	\$326.72	18%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
103564		ADAMS FLATS	Grays Harbor	PC	7188	\$2,248,000.00	\$2,919,418.91	\$406.15	30%	2.00	Murphy Company
102029		T3 C-1200	Jefferson	OLY	4243	\$444,000.00	\$1,238,345.00	\$291.86	179%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
102176	*	PUPPERS	Lewis	SP	4261	\$1,736,000.00					NO BIDS
102793		BROWNS CORNER	Pacific	PC	1227	\$396,000.00	\$461,025.93	\$375.73	16%	3.00	Murphy Company
100425		ORION	Skagit	NW	2485	\$697,000.00	\$1,181,652.42	\$475.51	70%	6.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
103158		MIDGE Sorts	Skagit	NW	13	(\$1,756.53)	(\$1,756.53)	(\$135.12)	0%	1.00	See Sort Sales Results
102965		BEEHIVE	Skamania, Clark	PC	6271	\$2,145,000.00	\$2,741,012.71	\$437.09	28%	4.00	Western Forest Products US LLC
102732		Q WALKER	Spokane	NE	4454	\$1,350,000.00	\$1,447,200.00	\$324.92	7%	1.00	PotlatchDeltic Land & Lumber, LLC
102942	*	SPRINTER	Thurston	SP	4266	\$1,754,000.00	\$2,333,582.67	\$547.02	33%	3.00	Stella-Jones Corporation

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
November 2022	11	10	0	1	42,688	38,427	0	4,261	90%	\$11,895,243.47	\$15,823,947.11	\$411.79	33%	2.80
YTD FY 2023	42	40	0	2	177,078	168,122	0	8,956	95%	\$52,140,078.34	\$70,954,432.53	\$422.04	36%	2.73

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
103207		Q BUCK CENTRAL	Okanogan	NE	1976	\$231,000.00	\$448,727.91	\$227.09	94%	3.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
104082		FAVORABLE CEDAR SALVAGE	Wahkiakum	PC	30	\$40,000.00					NO BIDS
104131		Q WENAS FIRE SALVAGE	Yakima, Kittitas	SE	1020	\$7,014.00	\$8,907.78	\$8.73	27%	1.00	Timbered Rangeland Management, LLC

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
November 2022	3	2	0	1	3,026	2,996	0	30	99%	\$238,014.00	\$457,635.69	\$152.75	92%	2.00
YTD FY 2023	11	9	0	2	12,541	12,315	0	226	98%	\$1,096,890.00	\$2,397,229.48	\$194.66	119%	2.44

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
November 2022	14	12	0	2	45,714	41,423	0	4,291	91%	\$12,133,257.47	\$16,281,582.80	\$393.06	34%	2.67
YTD FY 2023	53	49	0	4	189,619	180,437	0	9,182	95%	\$53,236,968.34	\$73,351,662.01	\$406.52	38%	2.68

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)				APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
				MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	# OF BIDS	
103364		MIDGE Sort 10 CW Sawlog 12"+ SED	13	\$120.00	\$120.00	(\$1,756.53)	(\$1,756.53)	(\$135.12)	1	Fritch Forest Products, Inc.

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)