

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

May 2022

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
102027		MT PLEASANT	Clallam	OLY	1138	\$308,000.00	\$573,161.00	\$503.66	86%	2.00	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
102802		OUTFIELD	Clallam	OLY	5559	\$1,537,000.00	\$1,827,170.00	\$328.69	19%	2.00	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
102123		LOWER SPEELYAI SORTS	Cowlitz	PC	2087	\$456,685.25	\$1,041,170.75	\$498.88	128%	3.14	See Sort Sales Results
100659		T3 SNAP TO IT	Jefferson	OLY	11481	\$2,754,000.00	\$3,746,163.00	\$326.29	36%	2.00	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
100669	*	COUG FLATS	King	SP	5243	\$1,953,000.00	\$1,982,408.96	\$378.11	2%	3.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101818		COWLITZ VALLEY CURRENCY	Lewis	PC	4387	\$2,032,000.00	\$2,706,487.61	\$616.93	33%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101108		CARBONARA	Mason	SP	5652	\$2,229,000.00	\$2,729,222.00	\$482.88	22%	4.00	Manke Timber Company, Inc.
102002		Q BOYER EAST SORTS	Pend Oreille	NE	5847	\$2,990,745.14	\$2,749,343.74	\$470.21	-8%	2.38	See Sort Sales Results
101415		CASKEY THIN	Skagit	NW	1131	\$291,000.00	\$291,401.85	\$257.65	0%	1.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
100007		Q COUSINS SORTS	Stevens	NE	4425	\$1,630,473.82	\$1,441,444.54	\$325.75	-12%	1.71	See Sort Sales Results
100999		SENTINEL	Thurston	SP	5598	\$2,034,000.00	\$2,375,723.00	\$424.39	17%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
May 2022	11	11	0	0	52,548	51,845	0	703	100%	\$17,432,539.21	\$21,463,696.45	\$414.00	23%	2.29
YTD FY 2022	81	79	0	2	363,775	357,915	0	5,860	99%	\$117,738,390.43	\$157,937,076.08	\$441.27	34%	2.84

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
May 2022	11	11	0	0	52,548	51,845	0	703	100%	\$17,432,539.21	\$21,463,696.45	\$414.00	23%	2.29
YTD FY 2022	93	90	0	3	383,168	375,434	0	7,734	98%	\$118,704,600.43	\$159,752,512.98	\$425.51	35%	2.72

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) Continued**

May 2022

Delivered Values

Stumpage Determination (Projected)

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)			# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
				MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF		
103143		Q BOYER EAST SORT 07 WRC Poles 35'+	234	\$1,872.82		\$438,240.00			0	NO BIDS
103144		Q BOYER EAST SORT 08 WRC 5"+ dib	1,405	\$1,672.00	\$1,755.60	\$1,968,338.27	\$2,085,796.27	\$1,484.55	1	Alta Forest Products, LLC
103145		Q BOYER EAST SORT 09 DF/WL/GF/WH/WP/LP 5-6" dib	413	\$332.77	\$461.09	(\$26,923.54)	\$26,068.61	\$63.12	3	IFG Timber, LLC
103167		Q BOYER EAST SORT 10 Conifer Utility 2"+	91	\$225.00	\$225.00	\$661.80	\$661.80	\$7.27	1	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.