
VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFEREDMINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID * PRICE * /MBF OVER BIDS
77139 Ferry NE 3,122 $764,000 ########## ###### 67% 3
77136 Grays Harbor PC 2,979 ######### ########## ###### 24% 7
76005 King SPS 3,665 $501,000 $654,777.00 ###### 31% 4
77116 King SPS 1,708 $363,000 $482,958.00 ###### 33% 4
77018 Lewis PC 2,653 $793,000 ########## ###### 33% 4
77316 Okanogan NE 1,614 $250,610 $424,725.00 ###### 69% 4
77317 Okanogan NE 740 $147,358 $217,914.00 ###### 48% 5
77318 Okanogan NE 2,775 $319,737 $645,450.00 ###### 102% 3
77319 Okanogan NE 790 $116,961 $139,676.00 ###### 19% 3
77320 Okanogan NE 1,295 $103,986 $145,894.00 ###### 40% 2
77321 Okanogan NE 369 $59,232 $140,157.00 ###### 137% 2
77322 Okanogan NE 186 $29,811 $75,311.00 ###### 153% 1
77323 Okanogan NE 814 $2,237 $3,956.00 $4.86 77% 3
77022 Pacific PC 2,429 $794,000 ########## ###### 30% 2
76430 Skagit NW 3,257 ######### ########## ###### 10% 3
76640 Skagit NW 1,989 $287,000 $287,910.00 ###### 0% 1
76829 Snohomish NW 2,747 $688,000 ########## ###### 49% 7
77088 Thurston, Grays Hb PC 6,358 ######### ########## ###### 37% 5

* Contract Harvesting Sort bid values converted from delivered value to estimated stumpage rate.

VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFEREDMINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77287 Jefferson OLY 545 $117,000 $155,855.00 ###### 33% 6
77019 Pacific PC 1,050 $181,000 $230,162.00 ###### 27% 3
77045 Skagit NW 829 $119,000 $123,929.00 ###### 4% 2
76833 Snohomish NW 576 $128,000 $203,710.00 ###### 59% 3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results

July 25-28, 2005

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

TROUT CREEK Boise Building Solutions,
DOUBLE TROUBLE Forest Marketing Enterp
SODERMAN SLOPE Miller Shingle Co., Inc.
RAPSCALLION Hampton Tree Farms, In
KEYSTONE RSG Forest Products, In
SKULL SORT #1 Vaagen Brothers Lumbe
SKULL SORT #2 Vaagen Brothers Lumbe
SKULL SORT #3 Vaagen Brothers Lumbe
SKULL SORT #4 Zosel Lumber Co.
SKULL SORT #5 Vaagen Brothers Lumbe
SKULL SORT #6 Western Woods, Inc
SKULL SORT #7 Edgewood Log Structure
SKULL SORT #8 Double A Logging
SHENANIGANS Quinault Logging 
CASTAWAY Miller Shingle Co., Inc.
PRAIRIE DOWNS PC Janicki Logging & Const
STIMSON SLOPES A.L.R.T. Corporation
GOULASH Quinault Logging 

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Region Sales Results

July 25-28, 2005

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

G-2000 STRIP Allen Logging Co.
ASCEND BLOWDOWN Hampton Tree Farms, In
UNCLE CHARLIE HARDWO Hauenstein Logging
HARDWOOD PARTS Forest Land Services, Inc



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF
NUMBER MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS

76117 Grays Harbor PC 1,071 $276,000 $346,636.00 $323.66 26% 6
77023 Grays Harbor PC 4,228 $1,626,000 $1,763,611.00 $417.13 8% 4
77407 Grays Harbor OLY 4,607 $1,395,000 $1,815,000.00 $393.97 30% 1
77412 Kittitas/Chelan SE 2,286 $755,535 All Sorts Sold
77270 Lewis PC 4,000 $370,000 $780,333.62 $195.08 111% 8
77326 Pacific PC 2,863 $907,000 $980,500.00 $342.47 8% 4
74731 Skagit NW 6,255 $1,660,000 $1,822,232.25 $291.32 10% 3
77126 Skagit NW 2,337 $668,000 $768,230.00 $328.72 15% 2
76487 Snohomish NW 3,747 $1,492,000 $1,670,560.00 $445.84 12% 6
77056 Stevens NE 5,251 $1,037,000 $1,399,419.00 $266.51 35% 3
77237 Stevens NE 4,571 $1,277,000 $1,351,527.00 $295.67 6% 2
76831 Whatcom NW 2,728 $853,000 $1,025,127.00 $375.78 20% 2
77046 Whatcom NW 3,116 $628,000 $930,500.00 $298.62 48% 5
77063 Whatcom NW 4,564 $1,548,000 $1,639,135.48 $359.14 6% 2
77128 Whatcom NW 4,696 $1,467,000 $1,719,807.00 $366.23 17% 2
77224 Whatcom NW 2,124 $728,000 $878,229.33 $413.48 21% 4

VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF
NUMBER MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS

76200 Skagit NW 1,013 $231,000 $239,910.00 $236.83 4% 3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results
August 22-25, 2005

APPARENT HIGH BIDDERNAME OF SALE

PUZZLE PC Stimson Lumber Co.
PALL MALL Merrill & Ring Forest Products, 
BUSTIN HUMP Sierra Pacific Industries
NANEUM RIDGE FI SORTS #1
LUMBERJACK SONG THINNING Rayonier Forest Operations
WILD BEAN Quinault Logging
FM TOOL Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
HARMONY Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc.
STOCKWAGON Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc.
FRISCO Ponderay Valley Fibre
BAD ROOTS Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
FLAPJACK A.L.R.T. Corporation
DAVES BOBCAT HARDWOOD Bow Hill Mill Company
SPACE WRANGLER Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
SILVER STAR A.L.R.T. Corporation
RABBIT HUTCH Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Region Sales Results
August 22-25, 2005

APPARENT HIGH BIDDERNAME OF SALE

ROSESHIP HARDWOOD C & G Timber, Inc.



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77061 NUMBER SIX Clark PC 4,760 $1,265,000 ########### ###### 3% 3
77234 EAST SHIN THIN Cowlitz PC 2,339 $299,000 $859,599.00 ###### 187% 3
75790 LETTER GO King SPS 1,653 $478,000 NO BIDS
70729 MANATEE Mason SPS 2,298 $869,000 ########### ###### 25% 3
76809 Mason SPS 3,478 $1,305,000 ########### ###### 31% 4
76842 Mason SPS 2,830 $1,074,000 ########### ###### 7% 3
76364 Snohomish NW 2,491 $602,000 $802,650.00 ###### 33% 3
77047 Snohomish NW 3,025 $788,000 $824,183.00 ###### 5% 3

VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77226 Snohomish NW 972 $233,000 $363,100.00 ###### 56% 3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results

September 26-29, 2005

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

RSG Forest Products, Inc.
Northwest Log Marketing, Inc.

Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
TENAS TWO Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
SQUARE PLOT Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
RECALL Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc.
PASSING LANE Miller Shingle Company, Inc.

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Region Sales Results

September 26-29, 2005

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

RANGER HARDWOOD Forest Land Services, Inc.



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
76969 Clallam OLY 3,774 $1,299,000 ########## ###### 29% 7
77233 Clark PC 1,947 $515,000 $570,363.96 ###### 11% 3
71810 Kittitas SE 1,875 $367,000 $516,522.00 ###### 41% 6
77294 Lewis PC 1,648 $342,000 $447,527.63 ###### 31% 3
77369 Okanogan NE 5,488 $1,184,000 ########## ###### 34% 1
77239 Thurs/G.H. PC 3,454 $1,001,000 ########## ###### 24% 4

VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77343 Clallam OLY 312 $68,000
76764 Okanogan NE 646 $125,000 $180,180.00 ###### 44% 3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results
October 24-27, 2005

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

CATAMOUNT C & G Timber
AIRSTREAM THINNING & CC Rayonier Forest Operations
IN THE MIDDLE Yakima Resources, LLC
SIR WINSTON THINNING D Painter
NO SWEAT Bosie Home Solutions
SWAN Quinault Logging

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Region Sales Results
October 24-27, 2005

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

D-300 THINNING NO BIDS
FOX MOUNTAIN Boise Home Solutions



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77370 Clark PC 1,730 $705,000 $790,381.22 ###### 12% 4
77138 Cowlitz PC 2,219 $416,000 $857,494.26 ###### 106% 8
76976 Klickitat SE 1,284 $388,000 $397,619.00 ###### 2% 2
76808 Mason SPS 5,924 $2,115,000 ########### ###### 2% 2
77503 Okanogan NE 2,613 $565,000 $628,121.40 ###### 11% 3
77395 HOT SAW Pacific PC 3,334 $875,000 ########### ###### 25% 3
77127 LOST HORIZONS Skagit NW 4,142 $959,000 ########### ###### 26% 5
77244 BUTLER HILL Skagit NW 1,501 $523,000 $551,101.00 ###### 5% 4
74540 BACK NINE Snohomish NW 1,113 $397,000 $454,745.00 ###### 15% 3
75744 Snohomish NW 3,027 $1,004,000 ########### ###### 25% 3

VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77343 Clallam OLY 312 $37,063 $61,388 ###### 66% 2

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results

November 14-17, 2005

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

COAT & TIE RSG Forest Products, Inc.
CASEY OUTBREAK THINNING & CC NW Log Marketing, Inc.
MICROBREWER High Cascade, Inc.
OLD TIE GRADE Boise Building Solutions Mfg., Inc.
KATASA Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.

Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc.
Janicki Logging & Construction Co.
Miller Shingle Company, Inc.

BLACK EYE Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc.

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Region Sales Results
November 14-17, 2005

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

D-300 THINNING Portac, Inc.



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77232 Cowlitz PC 1,648 $761,000
77240 Grays Harbor PC 3,864 $1,233,000
77514 Lewis PC 4,439 $1,567,000
76846 Snohomish NW 4,516 $899,000 $1,135,787.73 $251.50 26% 3
77243 Snohomish NW 2,204 $792,000 $890,793.00 $404.17 12% 4
77235 CORRAL Thurston PC 7,717 $3,630,000
77515 WATCH Thurston PC 4,084 $1,432,000
76839 CLUTCH Wahkiakum PC 3,426 $1,255,000
77133 SANTA MARIA Whatcom NW 2,914 $934,000 $1,056,000.00 $362.39 13% 4 Nielsen Brothers, Inc.

VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77219 Thurston SPS 990 $148,000 $238,777.00 $241.19 61% 5

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results

December 12-15, 2005

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

BURRIS CREEK
GPC
4TH OF JULY
SISU Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
SALISH VIEW A.L.R.T. Corporation

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Region Sales Results

December 12-15, 2005

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

ALDER OVERLOOK TL Fitzer Logging



DRAFT

VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77355 Cowlitz PC 5,783 $2,376,000 $3,276,887.00 $566.64 38% 6
77453 Cowlitz PC 1,975 $609,000 $615,550.00 $311.67 1% 1
76110 Klickitat SE 1,217 $496,000 $845,613.00 $694.83 70% 3
77606 Lewis PC 3,137 $1,205,000 $1,468,188.00 $468.02 22% 5
77495 Mason SPS 1,805 $670,000 $915,863.00 $507.40 37% 8
77137 SPACEBALLS Pacific PC 8,741 $2,619,000 $2,955,125.75 $338.08 13% 1
77218 U.D.R. Snohomish SPS 3,468 $1,270,000 $1,308,500.00 $377.31 3% 4
77421 RESERVATION LINE Stevens NE 4,394 $807,000 $1,492,204.00 $339.60 85% 6
77410 POINT BLANK Thurston PC 6,555 $2,083,000 $3,504,217.00 $534.59 68% 7
77569 Wahkiakum PC 4,399 $1,019,000 $1,020,285.35 $231.94 0% 1
77262 Yakima SE 1,184 $277,000 $403,080.96 $340.44 46% 3

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 11 11 0 42,658 42,658 0 100% $13,431,000 $17,805,514 $417 33% 4.09

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 77 75 2 241,065 235,986 5,079 97.9% $68,202,932 $85,659,503 $363 26% 3.81

McKLICK
KING OF QUEENS
LIGHTS OUT

MILL CREEK #3

Yakima Resources, LLC

Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
Yakima Resources, LLC

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results
January 23-26, 2006

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FOR THE MONTH OF JANUARY 2006

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FOR FY 06

Fundtime Logging

Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
Munro, LLC
Stimson Lumber Co.
Bow Hill Mill Co.

SPUR 2 FOREST HEALTH

J D Lumber, Inc.
Boise Building Solutions Mfg., Inc.

DECIDUOUS DELIGHT

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.

NAME OF SALE

RUSTY NAIL

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time. jan06results6/27/20061:18 PM



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
71847 Chelan SE 637 $72,000 $86,968.00 $136.53 21% 2
77831 DEAD END Clallam OLY 395 $69,000 $77,423.00 $196.01 12% 2 Chinook Resources Inc.
77231 NEEDLE TREE THINNING WTD King SPS 556 $82,000 $116,640.43 $209.78 42% 6 Erickson Logging, Inc.
76838 MISSION POLE Mason SPS 389 $138,000 $205,164.00 $527.41 49% 3 McFarland Cascade Pole & Lumber Co.
77497 Pacific PC 620 $145,000 $193,301.81 $311.78 33% 4

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 5 5 0 2,597 2,597 0 100% $506,000 $679,497 $262 34% 3.40

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 15 14 1 9,842 9,530 312 96.8% $1,825,063 $2,476,509 $260 36% 3.36

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 16 16 0 45,255 45,255 0 100% $13,937,000 $18,485,011 $408 33% 3.88

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 92 89 3 250,907 245,516 5,391 97.9% $70,027,995 $88,136,012 $359 26% 3.74

C-DORY

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Region Sales Results
January 23-26, 2006

SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FOR THE MONTH OF JANUARY 2006

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FOR FY 06

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FOR THE MONTH OF JANUARY 2006

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FOR FY 06

OPTION 2 Stimson Lumber Company

Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time. jan06results6/27/20061:18 PM



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77609 CLARK PC 6,852 $2,829,000 $3,412,118.00 $497.97 21% 3
77601 COWLITZ PC 5,316 $1,987,000 $2,037,263.00 $383.23 3% 1
76104 KLICKITAT SE 3,588 $1,444,000 $1,848,506.00 $515.19 28% 3
77283 KLICKITAT SE 2,219 $581,000 $805,730.00 $363.11 39% 3
77236 LEWIS PC 4,707 $1,400,000 $1,989,731.00 $422.72 42% 4
77516 LEWIS PC 9,158 $3,744,000 $3,925,027.00 $428.59 5% 1
76807 MASON SPS 2,173 $776,000 $982,685.00 $452.23 27% 6
77849 OKANOGAN NE 4,014 $980,000
77584 SKAGIT NW 4,999 $1,310,000 $1,692,389.43 $338.55 29% 4
77260 SNOHOMISH NW 2,205 $451,000 $617,229.48 $279.92 37% 9
77502 SNOHOMISH NW 4,666 $1,164,000 $1,343,120.00 $287.85 15% 3
76839 WAHKIAKUM PC 3,426 $1,128,000 $1,437,785.44 $419.67 27% 4
77266 WHATCOM NW 4,000 $1,278,000 $1,760,700.61 $440.18 38% 7

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 13 12 1 57,323 53,309 4,014 93% $18,092,000 $21,852,285 $410 21% 4.00

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 90 87 3 298,388 289,295 9,093 97.0% $86,294,932 $107,511,788 $372 25% 3.84

NO BIDS

6690 FINAL

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results
February 21-23, 2006

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

NAME OF SALE

LOG DOG
RSG Forest Products, Inc.

MILLER X3
SOUTH RIM

Western Timber, Inc.

Yakima Resources, LLC
SDS Lumber Company
RSG Forest Products, Inc.

FRONTLINE
LOOP
LOST N FOUND

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FOR FY 06

CORNER BEAR Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc.

COWBOY UP RSG Forest Products, Inc.

TEDDY R Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
VACILLATE Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

CLUTCH

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FOR THE MONTH OF FEBRUARY 2006

RSG Forest Products, Inc.
NORTH OLSEN Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time. feb 06 results6/27/20061:12 PM



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
76834 MASON SPS 293 $150,000 $205,275.00 $700.60 37% 3
77610 SKAGIT NW 975 $207,000 $261,875.01 $268.59 27% 5

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 2 2 0 1,268 1,268 0 100% $357,000 $467,150 $368 31% 4.00

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 17 16 1 11,110 10,798 312 97.2% $2,182,063 $2,943,659 $273 35% 3.44

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 15 14 1 58,591 54,577 4,014 93% $18,449,000 $22,319,435 $409 21% 4.00

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 107 103 4 309,498 300,093 9,405 97.0% $88,476,995 $110,455,447 $368 25% 3.78

Scale Sale Bid Value Calculation:   *  indicates biddable species

Clutch
30-76839 Volume (mbf) Min. Bid Value/mbf Min. Bid Species Bid Total Value

MUDDY CREEK THIN
HOWELL POLE

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FOR FY 06

SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FOR THE MONTH OF FEBRUARY 2006

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

JH Baxter & Co.
Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FOR THE MONTH OF FEBRUARY 2006

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FOR FY 06

Region Sales Results
February 21-23, 2006

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time. feb 06 results6/27/20061:12 PM



Value Bid Value/mbf
* Douglas fir 1,982 $396.00 $784,872.00 $552.17 $1,094,400.94

Hemlock 1,431 $236.50 $338,431.50 $236.50 $338,431.50
Red Alder 13 $381.00 $4,953.00 $381.00 $4,953.00
Sale Total 3,426 $1,128,256.50 $1,437,785.44

Muddy Creek Thin
30-77610 Volume (mbf) Min. Bid Value/tomMin. Bid Species Bid Total Value

Value Bid Value/ton
* Douglas fir 971 7332 $28.00 $205,296.00 $35.47 $260,066.04
* Red Alder 2 38 $28.00 $1,064.00 $35.47 $1,347.86
* Hemlock 2 13 $28.00 $364.00 $35.47 $461.11

Sale Total 975 7,383 $206,724.00 $261,875.01

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time. feb 06 results6/27/20061:12 PM





VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77777 KING RAT Cowlitz PC 9,187 $3,239,000
77860 DESCENT Cowlitz PC 4,334 $1,894,000 $2,210,064.00 $509.94 17% 4
77409 RED BARON Grays Harbor PC 4,447 $1,194,000 $1,476,986.00 $332.13 24% 7
78531 HARD DRIVE Grays Harbor PC 4,024 $1,317,000 $1,817,463.00 $451.66 38% 9
75790 LETTER GO King SPS 1,237 $354,000 $522,703.00 $422.56 48% 7
77263 DIPPIN VAT Kittitas/Yakim SE 2,047 $434,000 $462,665.00 $226.02 7% 1
78110 FISHBONE Klickitat SE 1,704 $1,046,000
78111 DIABLO Klickitat SE 2,974 $708,000 $1,172,504.20 $394.25 66% 6
78514 PATRIOT POLE Lewis PC 566 $395,000 $489,704.00 $865.20 24% 2
78716 Lewis SPS 362 $76,915 $118,672.18 $327.82 54% 1
78717 Lewis SPS 519 $171,313 $217,528.57 $419.13 27% 2
78718 Lewis SPS 699 $255,023 $287,629.15 $411.49 13% 2
78719 Lewis SPS 942 $375,699 $476,506.20 $505.85 27% 3
78720 Lewis SPS 348 ($18,510) $41,956.46 $120.56 327% 1
78721 Lewis SPS 973 $135,064 $214,998.19 $220.96 59% 1
78528 Lewis SPS 107 $20,820 $25,521.25 $238.52 23% 2
78722 Lewis SPS 31 $13,776 $21,271.31 $686.17 54% 1
78723 Lewis SPS 174 ($1,661) $13,225.82 $76.01 896% 2
78724 Lewis SPS 176 $27,215 $51,926.15 $295.03 91% 2
78725 Lewis SPS 77 $2,321 $5,700.39 $74.03 146% 3
78680 Pierce SPS 7,901 $2,146,000 $2,678,976.00 $339.07 25% 3
77644 Snohomish NW 3,472 $985,000 $1,448,560.00 $417.21 47% 8
77879 Stevens NE 704 $49,218 104,257.00 148.09 112% 4
77880 Stevens NE 2,785 $28,713 177,305.00 63.66 518% 2
77881 Stevens NE 200 ($27,956) (17,576.00) (87.88) 37% 1
77890 Stevens NE 1,609 $416,000 $589,395.00 $366.31 42% 3
77692 Wahkiakum PC 2,305 $779,000 $854,021.00 $370.51 10% 2
78109 Yakima SE 1,019 $267,000 $404,943.00 $397.39 52% 4

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 25 23 2 46,826 35,935 10,891 77% $10,889,000 $14,127,984 $393 30% 3.30

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 135 130 5 411,061 391,077 19,984 95% $117,735,016 $150,669,054 $385 28% 3.88

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results
April 24-27, 2006

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

No Bids
Stimson Lumber Co.
Sierra Pacific Industries
John E. Meek Logging
Portac, Inc.
Yakima Resources, LLC
No Bids
Butte Timberlands, LLC
North Fork Timber Co., Inc.

COUGARILLA SORT #1B Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
COUGARILLA SORT #2B Rainier Veneer, Inc.
COUGARILLA SORT #3B Portac, Inc.
COUGARILLA SORT #4B Olympic Panel Products, LLC
COUGARILLA SORT #5B Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
COUGARILLA SORT #6B Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
COUGARILLA SORT #7B Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
COUGARILLA SORT #8B Tubafor Mill, Inc.
COUGARILLA SORT #9B Edman Company
COUGARILLA SORT #10B Washington Alder, LLC
COUGARILLA SORT #11B Edman Company
UP WIND Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
STIMSON TOES Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc.
SHERRYLOCK FI SORT #1 Stimson Lumber Co.
SHERRYLOCK FI SORT #2 Ponderay Valley Fibre
SHERRYLOCK FI SORT #3 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
WHISKEY Boise Building Solutions Mfg., Inc.
PELOTON High Cascade, Inc.
PINO Yakima Resources, LLC

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FOR THE MONTH OF APRIL 2006

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FOR FY 06



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
78320 Kittitas SE 1,421 $158,000 $226,239.00 $159.21 43% 2
78450 Lewis PC 430 $190,000 $241,313.00 $561.19 27% 5

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 2 2 0 1,851 1,851 0 100% $348,000 $467,552 $253 34% 3.50

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 22 21 1 15,469 15,157 312 98% $2,907,063 $3,823,774 $252 32% 3.29

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 27 25 2 48,677 37,786 10,891 78% $11,237,000 $14,595,536 $386 30% 3.32

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 157 151 6 426,530 406,234 20,296 95% $120,642,079 $154,492,828 $380 28% 3.79

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Region Sales Results

April 24-27, 2006

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

PUMPERNICKEL FIRE SALV Yakima Resources, LLC
NEWAUKUM AGAIN John E. Meek Logging

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FOR THE MONTH OF APRIL 2006

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FOR FY 06

SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FOR THE MONTH OF APRIL 2006

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FOR FY 06



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77449 Clallam OLY 3,869 $1,144,000 $1,723,103.00 $445.36 51% 7
78518 Clark/Skamania PC 2,003 $422,000
77531 Cowlitz PC 1,950 $599,000 $639,735.26 $328.07 7% 1
77955 Ferry NE 2,186 $698,000 $805,266.00 $368.37 15% 2
77217 King SPS 2,939 $1,097,000 $1,381,280.00 $469.98 26% 8
77215 Kitsap SPS 2,600 $605,000 $722,673.00 $277.95 19% 3
78574 Pend Oreille NE 5,488 $1,789,000 $1,888,028.16 $344.03 6% 1
77921 Stevens NE 4,200 $1,278,000 $1,452,605.00 $345.86 14% 1
77291 Wahkiakum PC 4,314 $913,000 $1,202,332.00 $278.70 32% 3
78530 Wahkiakum PC 5,929 $861,000 $1,684,191.60 $284.06 96% 2
77267 Whatcom NW 1,628 $550,000 $655,770.00 $402.81 19% 5
78793 Yakima SE 2,991 $297,292 $297,496.41 $99.46 0% 3
78794 Yakima SE 2,134 $463,996 $962,023.05 $450.81 107% 3
78795 Yakima SE 574 $72,856 $97,988.94 $170.71 34% 5
78796 Yakima SE 1,755 $302,535 $486,887.13 $277.43 61% 6
78803 Yakima SE 496 ($9,204) $15,710.00 $31.67 271% 2
78779 Yakima SE 204 ($20,576) ($6,492.77) ($31.83) 68% 6
78780 Yakima SE 523 $72,485 $91,097.78 $174.18 26% 6
78781 Yakima SE 1,361 $61,900 $155,822.37 $114.49 152% 4

Notes:

2. FI sorts do not contribute to month or year-end summary totals.

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 16 #REF! 1 45,056 43,053 2,003 96% $10,661,475 $14,015,090 $326 31% #REF!

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 151 #REF! 6 456,117 434,130 21,987 95% $128,396,491 $164,684,144 $379 28% #REF!

Updated 6/28/2006

VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OFNAME OF SALE APPARENT

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FOR FY 06

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Region Sales Results

May 22-25, 2006

RATTLESNAKE FI SORT #3 Yakama Forest Products

1. Contract Harvesting Sorts; bid values converted from delivered value to estimated stumpage rate.  

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FOR THE MONTH OF MAY 2006

RATTLESNAKE FI SORT #1 Yakama Forest Products
RATTLESNAKE FI SORT #2 Boise Building Solutions Mfg., Inc.

BIRD CREEK SORT #4 High Cascade, Inc.
BIRD CREEK SORT #5 Boardman Chip Co., Inc.

BIRD CREEK SORT #2 D R Johnson Lumber Co.
BIRD CREEK SORT #3 Yakama Forest Products

WD 40 Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc.
BIRD CREEK SORT #1 SDS Lumber Co.

SMOOTH RSG Forest Products, Inc.
FALK RIDGE ALDER HELICOPTER Fundtime Logging

TUNDUROY Riley Creek Lumber Co.
DUNN ON TOP Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.

NORTH SLOPE Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc.
GOLDEN Rayonier Forest Operations, LLC

FREDRICKSON THINNING & CC RSG Forest Products, Inc.
LONE RANCH Boise Building Solutions Mfg., Inc.

KING'S GOLD Miller Shingle Company, Inc.
2000 THINNING No Bids

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results

May 22-25, 2006



MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
72838 Chelan SE 2,827 $166,000
78513 Lewis PC 698 $242,000 $307,743.00 $440.89 27% 7

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 2 #REF! 1 3,525 698 2,827 20% $242,000 $307,743 $441 27% #REF!

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 24 #REF! 2 18,994 15,855 3,139 83% $3,149,063 $4,131,517 $261 31% #REF!

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 18 #REF! 2 48,581 43,751 4830 90% $10,903,475 $14,322,833 $327 31% #REF!

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 175 #REF! 8 475,111 449,985 25,126 95% $131,545,554 $168,815,661 $375 28% #REF!

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FOR FY 06

SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FOR THE MONTH OF MAY 2006

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FOR FY 06

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FOR THE MONTH OF MAY 2006

PENNING TO GO John E. Meek Logging

HIGH BIDDER
MOONSUN AERIAL No Bids



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

(MBF) BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
77448 Clallam OLY 4,158 $1,197,000 $1,821,253.00 $438.01 52% 7
78639 Clark PC 3,720 $1,344,000 $1,344,444.00 $361.41 0% 1
77777 Cowlitz PC 9,187 $2,954,000 $3,177,300.84 $345.85 8% 3
77862 Cowlitz PC 3,582 $1,671,000 $1,874,183.76 $523.22 12% 3 Stimson Lumber Company
78654 Cowlitz PC 7,168 $2,701,000 $2,755,946.00 $384.48 2% 3
77386 Jefferson OLY 3,231 $981,000 $1,321,625.00 $409.05 35% 9
77419 King SPS 7,733 $707,000 $761,119.92 $98.42 8% 4
78583 Kitsap SPS 905 $501,000 $603,255.00 $666.58 20% 2
77264 Kittitas SE 952 $269,000 NO BIDS
77265 Kittitas SE 3,549 $840,000 NO BIDS
78110 Klickitat SE 1,704 $822,000 $829,700.00 $486.91 1% 1 SDS Lumber Co.
78314 Klickitat SE 1,548 $391,000 $494,430.00 $319.40 26% 4
77849 Okanogan NE 4,002 $993,000 NO BIDS
78599 Pacific PC 3,056 $615,000 $1,035,850.00 $338.96 68% 6 Quinault Logging
78697 Pacific PC 3,204 $990,000 $1,404,160.00 $438.25 42% 5 RSG Forest Products, Inc.
77083 Pierce SPS 8,916 $2,412,000 $2,807,638.16 $314.90 16% 4 Portac, Inc.
77761 Skagit NW 3,254 $947,000 $1,401,000.00 $430.55 48% 7 Sierra Pacific Industries
78623 Skagit NW 4,626 $1,564,000 $2,520,000.00 $544.75 61% 6 Sierra Pacific Industries
75031 Snohomish NW 2,584 $831,000 $1,038,393.00 $401.85 25% 6 A.L.R.T. Corporation
77951 Spokane / Stevens NE 257 ($9,731) ($443) ($1.72) 95% 1
77952 Spokane / Stevens NE 533 $43,513 $80,639 $151.29 85% 3
77953 Spokane / Stevens NE 34 $4,405 $5,905 $173.69 34% 1
78737 Spokane / Stevens NE 42 ($11,454) ($11,454) ($272.72) 0% 1
78861 Spokane / Stevens NE 20 ($1,046) ($1,046) ($52.30) 0% 2
77608 Wahkiakum PC 6,306 $1,405,000 $1,424,650.00 $225.92 1% 2 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
77383 Yakima SE 4,388 $978,000 NO BIDS

Notes:

2. FI sorts do not contribute to month or year-end summary totals.

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 21 17 4 87,773 74,882 12,891 85% $22,033,000 $26,614,949 $355 21% 4.29

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 172 151 10 543,890 509,012 34,878 94% $150,429,491 $191,299,094 $376 27% 4.03

Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

Boise Building Solutions Mfg., Inc.

North Fork Timber Co., Inc.

Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
Ponderay Valley Fibre

Boise Building Solutions Mfg., Inc.
Chattawood FI Sort #2 Ponderay Valley Fibre
Chattawood FI Sort #3 Ponderay Valley Fibre

Extra Innings
South Slope VDT
Bob's Big Boy
Wild Bill

Ewewho
Derailleur

Chattawood FI Sort #1

Lucky 13
Merit

Chattawood FI Sort #4
Chattawood FI Sort #5

Scramblin
Fishbone
Brownie Points
South Rim

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results

June 19-22, 2006

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

Wattley

Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.

NAME OF SALE

West Kelly
Mythlender
King Rat
Sea Biscuit
Dollar Bill

Rayonier Forest Operations, LLC
RSG Forest Products, Inc.

RSG Forest Products, Inc.
Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FOR THE MONTH OF JUNE 2006

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FOR FY 06

1. Contract Harvesting Sort; bid values converted from delivered value to estimated stumpage rate.

Little Quil
Bear Creek VDT
Simon Pole

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time. Results FY 20067/19/20062:10 PM



VOLUME
AGREEMENT COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

(MBF) BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
78572 Pacific PC 810 $148,000 $181,436.10 $224.00 23% 2

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 1 1 0 810 810 0 100% $148,000 $181,436 $224 23% 2.00

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 25 23 2 19,804 16,665 3,139 84% $3,297,063 $4,312,953 $259 31% 3.39

SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FOR THE MONTH OF JUNE 2006

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FOR FY 06

Adipose Thinning Rayonier Forest Operations, LLC

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

Region Sales Results
June 19-22, 2006

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time. Results FY 20067/19/20062:10 PM



SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 22 18 4 88,583 75,692 12891 85% $22,181,000 $26,796,385 $354 21% 4.17

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 197 174 12 563,694 525,677 38,017 93% $153,726,554 $195,612,047 $372 27% 3.95

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FOR THE MONTH OF JUNE 2006

YEAR TO DATE SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FOR FY 06

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time. Results FY 20067/19/20062:10 PM
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