

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

October 2015

| AGREEMENT | FSC® | NAME OF SALE | COUNTY | REGION | VOLUME OFFERED MBF | MINIMUM BID | BID PRICE | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | # OF BIDS | APPARENT HIGH BIDDER |
|-----------|------|-------------------------|-----------|--------|--------------------|----------------|----------------|------------|--------|-----------|---------------------------|
| 90289 | | BOUNDARY BASCULE | Clallam | OI | 7017 | \$1,597,000.00 | | | | | NO BIDS |
| 92252 | | DRY BIKE | Clallam | OI | 4969 | \$1,409,000.00 | \$1,901,151.00 | \$382.60 | 35% | 3.00 | Interfor U.S., Inc. |
| 92047 | | CHOTCHKIES VRH AND THIN | Cowlitz | PC | 3023 | \$271,000.00 | \$538,911.22 | \$178.27 | 99% | 5.00 | Sierra Pacific Industries |
| 92282 | | BLUE BARNES | Cowlitz | PC | 1987 | \$609,000.00 | \$715,089.86 | \$359.88 | 17% | 3.00 | Murphy Company |
| 92559 | | ROARING MEN | Jefferson | OI | 3891 | \$658,000.00 | \$945,697.00 | \$243.05 | 44% | 3.00 | Interfor U.S., Inc. |
| 92637 | | ELK CITY | Jefferson | OI | 6055 | \$1,237,000.00 | \$1,670,816.00 | \$275.94 | 35% | 2.00 | Interfor U.S., Inc. |
| 91787 | | HUZZA | King | SP | 1771 | \$257,000.00 | | | | | NO BIDS |
| 91788 | | ANNA LOG | King | SP | 3151 | \$533,000.00 | \$564,814.00 | \$179.25 | 6% | 1.00 | Sierra Pacific Industries |
| 91794 | * | HARRINGTON HEIGHTS | Lewis | SP | 4163 | \$695,000.00 | \$708,499.64 | \$170.19 | 2% | 1.00 | Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. |
| 92373 | | LIBERTY SORTS | Lewis | PC | 54 | \$22,950.00 | | | | | See Sort Sales Results |
| 91976 | | ZOOM | Okanogan | NE | 3395 | \$259,000.00 | \$730,250.90 | \$215.10 | 182% | 3.00 | Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. |
| 92196 | | DAY LAKE VRH & VDT | Skagit | NW | 1742 | \$416,000.00 | \$452,505.35 | \$259.76 | 9% | 2.00 | Sierra Pacific Industries |
| 90069 | | SEA BASS VRH & VDT | Snohomish | NW | 6700 | \$1,699,000.00 | \$2,410,476.64 | \$359.77 | 42% | 2.00 | Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. |
| 92203 | | LOST HORSE VRH & VDT | Snohomish | NW | 4247 | \$1,075,000.00 | \$1,552,159.62 | \$365.47 | 44% | 2.00 | Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. |
| 92164 | | BRONC | Thurston | SP | 5995 | \$1,976,000.00 | \$2,112,976.72 | \$352.46 | 7% | 1.00 | Murphy Company |
| 92388 | | POST CARD VRH & VDT | Whatcom | NW | 4300 | \$1,224,000.00 | \$1,614,857.00 | \$375.55 | 32% | 2.00 | Sierra Pacific Industries |

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

| | SALES OFFERED | SALES SOLD | SALES PENDING | SALES NO BID | VOLUME OFFERED | VOLUME SOLD | VOLUME PENDING | VOLUME NO BID | % VOL SOLD | TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES | BID PRICE SOLD SALES | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | AVG # BIDS |
|---------------------|---------------|------------|---------------|--------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|---------------|------------|--------------------------|----------------------|------------|--------|------------|
| October 2015 | 16 | 13 | 0 | 2 | 62,460 | 53,618 | 0 | 8,842 | 86% | \$12,061,000.00 | \$15,918,204.95 | \$296.88 | 32% | 2.31 |
| YTD FY 2016 | 30 | 26 | 0 | 4 | 106,591 | 95,529 | 0 | 11,062 | 90% | \$21,902,045.37 | \$30,395,225.41 | \$318.18 | 39% | 2.49 |

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

| AGREEMENT | FSC | NAME OF SALE | COUNTY | REGION | VOLUME OFFERED MBF | MINIMUM BID | BID PRICE | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | # OF BIDS | APPARENT HIGH BIDDER | | | |
|---------------------|-----|--------------|--------|--------|--------------------|-------------|-----------|------------|--------|--------------|----------------------|----------|-----|------|
| None offered | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| YTD FY 2016 | 5 | 5 | 0 | 0 | 6,546 | 6,546 | 0 | 0 | 100% | \$540,000.00 | \$986,060.99 | \$150.64 | 83% | 2.00 |

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

| | SALES OFFERED | SALES SOLD | SALES PENDING | SALES NO BID | VOLUME OFFERED | VOLUME SOLD | VOLUME PENDING | VOLUME NO BID | % VOL SOLD | TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES | BID PRICE SOLD SALES | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | AVG # BIDS |
|---------------------|---------------|------------|---------------|--------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|---------------|------------|--------------------------|----------------------|------------|--------|------------|
| October 2015 | 16 | 13 | 0 | 2 | 62,460 | 53,618 | 0 | 8,842 | 86% | \$12,061,000.00 | \$15,918,204.95 | \$296.88 | 32% | 2.31 |
| YTD FY 2016 | 35 | 31 | 0 | 4 | 113,137 | 102,075 | 0 | 11,062 | 90% | \$22,442,045.37 | \$31,381,286.40 | \$307.43 | 40% | 2.41 |

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

October 2015

Delivered Values

Stumpage Determination (Projected)

| AGREE- MENT | FSC | NAME OF SALE | VOLUME OFFERED MBF | Delivered Values | | Stumpage Determination (Projected) | | | | |
|----------------|-----|---------------------|--------------------------|----------------------|--------------------|------------------------------------|--------------------|---------------|--------------|-------------------------|
| | | | | MINIMUM BID / MBF | BID PRICE / MBF | TOTAL MINIMUM BID | TOTAL BID PRICE | PRICE /MBF | # OF BIDS | APPARENT HIGH BIDDER |
| 90969 | | PLUMBACK FIT SORT 1 | 964 | \$225.00 | \$456.68 | (\$209,380.80) | \$10,700.40 | \$11.10 | 3 | Interfor U.S., Inc. |
| 92383 | | LIBERTY SORT 10 | 54 | \$425.00 | | \$22,950.00 | | | 0 | NO BIDS |

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS**

October 2015

| NAME OF SALE | COUNTY | REGION | TREATMENT ACRES | VOLUME OFFERED MBF | Delivered Values | | Stumpage Determination (Projected) | |
|---------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|--------------------|------------------------|-----------------------|-----------------------|------------------------------------|--------------|
| | | | | | TOTAL MINIMUM BID | TOTAL BID PRICE | TOTAL REVENUE | NET \$ / MBF |
| PLUMBACK FIT SORTS | Kittitas | SE | 570 | 2,380 | \$841,688.00 | \$1,142,209.81 | \$231,214.71 | \$97.15 |
| | PROJECTS OFFERED | PROJECTS AWARDED | NOT AWARDED | TREATMENT ACRES | VOLUME OFFERED | VOLUME AWARDED | | |
| October 2015 | 1 | 1 | 0 | 570 | 2,380 | 2,380 | | |
| YTD FY 2016 | 2 | 2 | 0 | 871 | 3,082 | 3,082 | | |

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)