

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

July 2021

AGREEMENT FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
101104	ALBUS	Grays Harbor	SP	4729	\$1,922,000.00	\$2,690,039.00	\$568.84	40%	4.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
101625	SPITTOON SORTS	Grays Harbor	PC	166	\$50,861.84	\$69,761.84	\$420.25	37%	1.25	See Sort Sales Results
101111	SCHOOL BUS VRH & WMZ THIN	King	SP	6775	\$2,793,000.00	\$3,302,371.00	\$487.43	18%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
101695	BIG HOLLOW SALVAGE	Skamania	PC	1874	\$433,000.00					NO BIDS
101651	ELOCHOMOTIVE SORTS	Wahkiakum	PC	4837	\$1,924,640.14	\$2,412,091.01	\$498.68	25%	2.30	See Sort Sales Results
101956	UNIBROW	Wahkiakum	PC	1103	\$498,000.00					NO BIDS
101186	ACME OVERLOOK	Whatcom	NW	3035	\$1,433,000.00	\$1,958,224.22	\$645.21	37%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101217	PUCKWUDGIE	Whatcom	NW	2611	\$1,047,000.00	\$1,201,341.00	\$460.11	15%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
July 2021	8	6	0	2	25,130	22,129	0	3,001	88%	\$9,160,593.15	\$11,633,828.07	\$525.73	27%	2.59
YTD FY 2022	8	6	0	2	25,130	22,129	0	3,001	88%	\$9,160,593.15	\$11,633,828.07	\$525.73	27%	2.59

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
July 2021	8	6	0	2	25,130	22,129	0	3,001	88%	\$9,160,593.15	\$11,633,828.07	\$525.73	27%	2.59
YTD FY 2022	8	6	0	2	25,130	22,129	0	3,001	88%	\$9,160,593.15	\$11,633,828.07	\$525.73	27%	2.59

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

July 2021

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)				APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
				MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	# OF BIDS	
101739		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 1 DF 5-11"	642	\$675.00	\$785.00	\$296,609.21	\$367,229.21	\$572.01	3	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
101740		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 2 DF 12-19"	887	\$725.00	\$827.50	\$463,908.19	\$554,825.69	\$625.51	3	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
101741		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 3 DF 20"+	650	\$700.00	\$850.00	\$326,916.27	\$424,416.27	\$652.95	3	Stimson Lumber Company, Inc.
101742		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 4 WW* 5-11"	596	\$525.00	\$608.27	\$158,677.91	\$208,306.83	\$349.51	3	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101743		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 5 WW* 12-19"	1,362	\$550.00	\$655.46	\$419,411.70	\$563,048.22	\$413.40	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101744		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 6 WW* 20"+	559	\$480.00	\$512.84	\$107,986.56	\$126,344.12	\$226.02	1	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101745		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 7 RA 5"+	24	\$600.00		\$9,908.83			0	NO BIDS
101746		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 8 RC 5"+	95	\$1,700.00	\$1,945.00	\$141,179.32	\$164,454.32	\$1,731.10	2	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
101747		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 9 WH Pulp 2"+	4	\$364.00	\$469.30	\$67.51	\$488.71	\$122.18	2	Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC
101748		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 10 DF, SS, TF Pulp 2"+	14	\$286.00	\$442.00	(\$196.87)	\$1,987.13	\$141.94	2	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
101749		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 11 Hardwood Pulp 2"+	4	\$390.00	\$594.75	\$171.51	\$990.51	\$247.63	2	Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC
101877		SPITTOON SORTS ROW SORT 12 DF 5"+ ROW	135	\$650.00	\$790.00	\$41,034.84	\$59,934.84	\$443.96	2	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
101878		SPITTOON SORTS ROW SORT 13 MA 8"+ ROW	12	\$325.00	\$325.00	\$274.58	\$274.58	\$22.88	1	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
101879		SPITTOON SORTS ROW SORT 14 RC 5"+ ROW	3	\$1,700.00	\$1,700.00	\$4,007.59	\$4,007.59	\$1,335.86	1	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
101880		SPITTOON SORTS ROW SORT 15 RA 5"+ ROW	16	\$650.00	\$650.00	\$5,544.83	\$5,544.83	\$346.55	1	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)