

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS
February 2020**

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
99249		FALLS CREEK	Clallam	OLY	6432	\$705,000.00	\$859,877.00	\$133.69	22%	3.00	Alta Forest Products, LLC
97429		SLEDGEHAMMER VRH RMZ	Cowlitz	PC	3190	\$753,000.00	\$1,199,160.00	\$375.91	59%	4.00	Interfor U.S., Inc.
99681		CHUPACABRA SORTS	Cowlitz	PC	5720	\$1,858,929.46	\$2,629,636.29	\$459.73	41%	2.50	See Sort Sales Results
97291		YOUBETCHA	Grays Harbor, Thurston	SP	7931	\$2,180,000.00	\$2,561,021.00	\$322.91	17%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
95915	*	BASALTAMUCH	King	SP	5785	\$1,849,000.00	\$2,588,577.00	\$447.46	40%	6.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
98224		WOLVERINE	Lewis	PC	3703	\$1,302,000.00	\$1,474,752.00	\$398.26	13%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
98509		RAIL SPLITTER	Lewis	PC	4212	\$1,070,000.00	\$1,437,660.00	\$341.32	34%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
98630		TIDE PODZ SORTS	Lewis, Grays Harbor	PC	3442	\$886,860.97	\$1,287,251.93	\$373.98	45%	3.33	See Sort Sales Results
97430		SKY RIDER VDT VRH	Snohomish	NW	4684	\$555,000.00	\$1,578,208.00	\$336.94	184%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
99574		KITTEN KABOODLE WMZ VRH RMZ	Snohomish	NW	3559	\$782,000.00	\$1,518,832.00	\$426.76	94%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
97290		CHAMELEON	Thurston	SP	9473	\$3,346,000.00	\$4,135,775.48	\$436.59	24%	2.00	Murphy Company
99492		BUCKINGHAM GREEN	Whatcom	NW	2111	\$488,000.00	\$783,591.00	\$371.19	61%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
98543		CICADA EGG ROLL RMZ Sorts	Whatcom, Skagit	NW	4203	\$1,414,189.29	\$1,875,312.86	\$446.18	33%	2.58	See Sort Sales Results

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
February 2020	13	13	0	0	64,445	64,115	0	330	100%	\$17,151,017.00	\$23,929,654.56	\$373.23	40%	2.80
YTD FY 2020	80	72	0	8	353,166	321,960	0	31,206	91%	\$76,053,607.73	\$101,712,519.90	\$315.92	34%	2.64

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
99298		Q NEON	Okanogan	NE	3030	\$119,000.00	\$241,859.54	\$79.82	103%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
February 2020	1	1	0	0	3,030	3,030	0	0	100%	\$119,000.00	\$241,859.54	\$79.82	103%	2.00
YTD FY 2020	4	4	0	0	5,660	5,660	0	0	100%	\$645,000.00	\$981,706.08	\$173.45	52%	2.75

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES
February 2020**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
February 2020	14	14	0	0	67,475	67,145	0	330	100%	\$17,270,017.00	\$24,171,514.10	\$359.99	40%	2.74
YTD FY 2020	84	76	0	8	358,826	327,620	0	31,206	92%	\$76,698,607.73	\$102,694,225.98	\$313.46	34%	2.64

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	Delivered Values			Stumpage Determination (Projected)					APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
			VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	# OF BIDS		
98631		TIDE PODZ SORT 1	682	\$550.00	\$615.00	\$220,252.25	\$264,582.25	\$387.95	3	Sierra Pacific Industries	
98632		TIDE PODZ SORT 2	564	\$550.00	\$655.00	\$160,418.81	\$219,638.81	\$389.43	3	RSG Forest Products, Inc.	
98633		TIDE PODZ SORT 3	362	\$550.00	\$655.00	\$106,522.31	\$144,532.31	\$399.26	5	Swanson Brothers Lumber Company, Inc.	
98634		TIDE PODZ SORT 4	1,122	\$600.00	\$772.00	\$338,631.40	\$531,615.40	\$473.81	7	Canyon Lumber Company, Inc.	
98635		TIDE PODZ SORT 5	151	\$500.00	\$528.00	\$40,443.92	\$44,671.92	\$295.84	2	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.	
98636		TIDE PODZ SORT 6	111	\$350.00		\$15,238.14			0	NO BIDS	
98637		TIDE PODZ SORT 7	112	\$450.00	\$452.55	\$8,300.38	\$8,585.98	\$76.66	1	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.	
98638		TIDE PODZ SORT 8	23	\$800.00	\$1,105.00	\$12,227.50	\$19,242.50	\$836.63	2	RSG Forest Products, Inc.	
98639		TIDE PODZ SORT 9	279	\$260.00	\$487.50	(\$15,648.96)	\$47,823.54	\$171.41	4	Cascade Hardwood, LLC	
98640		TIDE PODZ SORT 10	36	\$325.00	\$494.00	\$475.22	\$6,559.22	\$182.20	3	DaPaul Chip	
99613		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 01	695	\$700.00	\$774.00	\$314,396.60	\$365,826.60	\$526.37	4	Canyon Lumber Company, Inc.	
99614		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 02	216	\$700.00	\$774.00	\$97,711.75	\$113,695.75	\$526.37	4	Canyon Lumber Company, Inc.	
99615		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 03	862	\$575.00	\$700.00	\$304,052.58	\$411,802.58	\$477.73	2	Great Western Lumber Co.	
99616		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 04	601	\$600.00	\$681.00	\$226,227.95	\$274,908.95	\$457.42	4	Sierra Pacific Industries	
99617		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 05	247	\$550.00	\$643.00	\$77,701.07	\$100,672.07	\$407.58	2	Sierra Pacific Industries	
99618		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 06	305	\$450.00	\$607.43	\$55,363.36	\$103,379.51	\$338.95	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.	
99619		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 07	361	\$950.00	\$1,300.00	\$159,937.16	\$286,287.16	\$793.04	3	Columbia Cedar, Inc.	
99620		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 08	150	\$950.00	\$951.00	\$103,780.38	\$103,930.38	\$692.87	2	The Oeser Company	
99621		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 09	50	\$1,100.00	\$1,863.00	\$41,292.46	\$79,442.46	\$1,588.85	2	Stella-Jones Corporation	
99622		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 10	263	\$450.00	\$475.00	\$53,870.08	\$60,445.08	\$229.83	2	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.	
99623		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 11	178	\$325.00		\$20,165.48			0	NO BIDS	
99624		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 12	28	\$200.00		(\$327.90)			0	NO BIDS	
99625		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 13	92	\$180.00	\$342.00	(\$22,914.51)	(\$8,010.51)	(\$87.07)	2	DaPaul Chip	
99626		CICADA EGG ROLL Sort 14	155	\$180.00	\$180.00	(\$17,067.17)	(\$17,067.17)	(\$110.11)	2	MTS Enterprises	
99682		CHUPACABRA SORT 1	511	\$550.00	\$692.22	\$186,456.47	\$259,130.89	\$507.11	3	Interfor U.S., Inc.	
99683		CHUPACABRA SORT 2	558	\$550.00	\$702.25	\$194,343.28	\$279,298.78	\$500.54	3	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.	
99684		CHUPACABRA SORT 3	1,554	\$625.00	\$763.00	\$697,241.66	\$911,693.66	\$586.68	4	Western Forest Products	
99685		CHUPACABRA SORT 4	243	\$950.00	\$1,017.75	\$165,489.19	\$181,952.44	\$748.78	1	Stella-Jones Corporation	
99686		CHUPACABRA SORT 5	541	\$450.00	\$575.00	\$117,886.85	\$185,511.85	\$342.91	4	Stimson Lumber Company, Inc.	
99687		CHUPACABRA SORT 6	2,131	\$450.00	\$584.86	\$452,273.75	\$739,660.41	\$347.10	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.	
99688		CHUPACABRA SORT 7	25	\$525.00	\$525.00	\$8,608.89	\$8,608.89	\$344.36	1	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.	
99689		CHUPACABRA SORT 8	13	\$325.00		\$3,887.00			0	NO BIDS	
99690		CHUPACABRA SORT 9	47	\$800.00	\$1,090.00	\$29,851.84	\$43,481.84	\$925.15	2	RSG Forest Products, Inc.	
99691		CHUPACABRA SORT 10	84	\$325.00	\$494.00	\$3,805.66	\$18,001.66	\$214.31	2	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.	
99692		CHUPACABRA SORT 11	13	\$260.00	\$507.00	(\$915.13)	\$2,295.87	\$176.61	3	Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC	

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)