

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

May 2023

| AGREEMENT | FSC® | NAME OF SALE           | COUNTY       | REGION | VOLUME OFFERED MBF | MINIMUM BID    | BID PRICE      | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | # OF BIDS | APPARENT HIGH BIDDER                     |
|-----------|------|------------------------|--------------|--------|--------------------|----------------|----------------|------------|--------|-----------|------------------------------------------|
| 101652    |      | CEDARVILLE SORTS       | Grays Harbor | PC     | 7042               | \$2,898,463.40 |                |            |        |           | Project Pending - See Sort Sales Results |
| 102087    |      | HIGHTOWER              | Grays Harbor | SP     | 8569               | \$1,980,000.00 | \$3,317,755.88 | \$387.18   | 68%    | 4.00      | Harbor Timber                            |
| 102110    | *    | SURE WOOD              | Mason        | SP     | 5343               | \$2,182,000.00 | \$3,622,843.50 | \$678.05   | 66%    | 6.00      | Stella-Jones Corporation                 |
| 102171    | *    | FERDA VRH & VDT        | Pierce       | SP     | 5544               | \$1,161,000.00 | \$2,026,236.64 | \$365.48   | 75%    | 2.00      | Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.                 |
| 103863    |      | GRAY JAY               | Skamania     | PC     | 6787               | \$1,334,000.00 | \$1,374,978.72 | \$202.59   | 3%     | 1.00      | Murphy Company                           |
| 104000    |      | Q NORTH                | Stevens      | NE     | 3300               | \$306,562.93   | \$364,588.81   | \$110.48   | 19%    | 1.71      | See Sort Sales Results                   |
|           |      | WILLIAMS SORTS         |              |        |                    |                |                |            |        |           |                                          |
| 104032    |      | Q COUSINS SORTS PART 2 | Stevens      | NE     | 3149               | \$330,111.38   | \$528,380.24   | \$167.79   | 60%    | 1.83      | See Sort Sales Results                   |
| 103880    |      | CUTTER                 | Whatcom      | NW     | 3057               | \$1,218,000.00 | \$2,229,048.00 | \$729.16   | 83%    | 5.00      | Bell Timber, Inc.                        |

**SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES**

|                    | SALES OFFERED | SALES SOLD | SALES PENDING | SALES NO BID | VOLUME OFFERED | VOLUME SOLD | VOLUME PENDING | VOLUME NO BID | % VOL SOLD | TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES | BID PRICE SOLD SALES | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | AVG # BIDS |
|--------------------|---------------|------------|---------------|--------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|---------------|------------|--------------------------|----------------------|------------|--------|------------|
| <b>May 2023</b>    | 8             | 7          | 1             | 0            | 42,791         | 35,531      | 6,794          | 466           | 84%        | \$8,501,609.62           | \$13,463,831.79      | \$378.93   | 58%    | 3.08       |
| <b>YTD FY 2023</b> | 89            | 88         | 1             | 0            | 398,013        | 390,753     | 6,794          | 466           | 99%        | \$110,905,725.05         | \$159,627,626.59     | \$408.51   | 44%    | 3.02       |

**REGIONAL SALE RESULTS**

| AGREEMENT | FSC® | NAME OF SALE                 | COUNTY    | REGION | VOLUME OFFERED MBF | MINIMUM BID | BID PRICE   | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | # OF BIDS | APPARENT HIGH BIDDER |
|-----------|------|------------------------------|-----------|--------|--------------------|-------------|-------------|------------|--------|-----------|----------------------|
| 104047    |      | SPRUCE TOWER CEDAR SALVAGE   | Jefferson | OLY    | 15                 | \$10,000.00 | \$28,000.00 | \$1,866.67 | 180%   | 2.00      | NJL Inc.             |
| 105156    |      | HIGHER GROUNDS CEDAR SALVAGE | Jefferson | OLY    | 15                 | \$10,000.00 | \$61,000.18 | \$4,066.68 | 510%   | 3.00      | NJL Inc.             |
| 103842    |      | Q OVERLOOK                   | Okanogan  | NE     | 1941               | \$86,000.00 |             |            |        |           | NO BIDS              |

**SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES**

|                    | SALES OFFERED | SALES SOLD | SALES PENDING | SALES NO BID | VOLUME OFFERED | VOLUME SOLD | VOLUME PENDING | VOLUME NO BID | % VOL SOLD | TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES | BID PRICE SOLD SALES | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | AVG # BIDS |
|--------------------|---------------|------------|---------------|--------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|---------------|------------|--------------------------|----------------------|------------|--------|------------|
| <b>May 2023</b>    | 3             | 2          | 0             | 1            | 1,971          | 30          | 0              | 1,941         | 2%         | \$20,000.00              | \$89,000.18          | \$2,966.67 | 345%   | 2.50       |
| <b>YTD FY 2023</b> | 24            | 20         | 0             | 4            | 31,099         | 28,622      | 0              | 2,477         | 92%        | \$2,666,890.00           | \$6,087,452.69       | \$212.68   | 128%   | 2.70       |

**SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES**

|                    | SALES OFFERED | SALES SOLD | SALES PENDING | SALES NO BID | VOLUME OFFERED | VOLUME SOLD | VOLUME PENDING | VOLUME NO BID | % VOL SOLD | TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES | BID PRICE SOLD SALES | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | AVG # BIDS |
|--------------------|---------------|------------|---------------|--------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|---------------|------------|--------------------------|----------------------|------------|--------|------------|
| <b>May 2023</b>    | 11            | 9          | 1             | 1            | 44,762         | 35,561      | 6,794          | 2,407         | 80%        | \$8,521,609.62           | \$13,552,831.97      | \$381.12   | 59%    | 2.95       |
| <b>YTD FY 2023</b> | 113           | 108        | 1             | 4            | 429,112        | 419,375     | 6,794          | 2,943         | 98%        | \$113,572,615.05         | \$165,715,079.28     | \$395.15   | 46%    | 2.96       |

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

\* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

May 2023

| AGREE-<br>MENT | FSC | NAME OF SALE                                                       | Delivered Values         |                      |                    | Stumpage Determination (Projected) |                    |               |              | APPARENT<br>HIGH BIDDER             |
|----------------|-----|--------------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------------|----------------------|--------------------|------------------------------------|--------------------|---------------|--------------|-------------------------------------|
|                |     |                                                                    | VOLUME<br>OFFERED<br>MBF | MINIMUM<br>BID / MBF | BID<br>PRICE / MBF | TOTAL<br>MINIMUM<br>BID            | TOTAL BID<br>PRICE | PRICE<br>/MBF | # OF<br>BIDS |                                     |
| 102482         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 1<br>DF 5"-11"                                     | 509                      | \$625.00             | \$700.00           | \$149,718.05                       | \$187,893.05       | \$369.14      | 2            | Sierra Pacific Industries           |
| 102483         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 2<br>DF 12"-19"                                    | 914                      | \$700.00             | \$710.00           | \$327,542.46                       | \$336,682.46       | \$368.36      | 2            | Sierra Pacific Industries           |
| 102484         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 3<br>DF 20"+                                       | 961                      | \$650.00             | \$827.00           | \$265,429.70                       | \$435,526.70       | \$453.20      | 3            | Stimson Lumber Company, Inc.        |
| 102485         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 4<br>DF HQ 12"+                                    | 1,553                    | \$750.00             | \$895.00           | \$552,637.47                       | \$777,822.47       | \$500.85      | 1            | Western Forest Products US LLC      |
| 102486         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 5<br>WW 5"+                                        | 165                      | \$490.00             |                    | \$29,845.46                        |                    |               | 0            | NO BIDS                             |
| 102487         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 6<br>RA 5"-11"                                     | 435                      | \$540.00             | \$540.00           | \$88,209.98                        | \$88,209.98        | \$202.78      | 2            | Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.           |
| 102488         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 7<br>RA 12"+                                       | 287                      | \$600.00             | \$675.00           | \$78,661.41                        | \$100,186.41       | \$349.08      | 2            | Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.           |
| 102489         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 8<br>MA 8"+                                        | 446                      | \$300.00             | \$300.00           | (\$76,738.07)                      | (\$76,738.07)      | (\$172.06)    | 1            | Port Angeles Hardwood               |
| 102490         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 9<br>RC 5"+                                        | 1,230                    | \$1,300.00           | \$1,555.00         | \$1,125,636.41                     | \$1,439,286.41     | \$1,170.15    | 3            | Alta Forest Products, LLC           |
| 102491         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 10<br>RC Poles 35"+                                | 229                      | \$2,000.00           | \$2,852.10         | \$367,215.60                       | \$562,346.50       | \$2,455.66    | 2            | Bell Timber, Inc.                   |
| 102492         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 11<br>BC 12"+                                      | 73                       | \$270.00             |                    | \$2,575.55                         |                    |               | 0            | NO BIDS                             |
| 102493         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 12<br>RA/MA Pulp 2"+                               | 222                      | \$390.00             | \$390.00           | (\$11,901.07)                      | (\$11,901.07)      | (\$53.61)     | 1            | Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.        |
| 102494         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 13<br>BC Pulp 2"+                                  | 3                        | \$260.00             | \$338.00           | (\$550.83)                         | (\$316.83)         | (\$105.61)    | 1            | Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.        |
| 102495         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 14<br>DF/TF Pulp 2"+                               | 5                        | \$260.00             | \$325.00           | (\$918.04)                         | (\$593.04)         | (\$118.61)    | 1            | Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.        |
| 102496         |     | CEDARVILLE SORT 15<br>WH Pulp 2"+                                  | 10                       | \$390.00             |                    | \$1,099.32                         |                    |               | 0            | NO BIDS                             |
| 104068         |     | Q COUSINS PART 2 SORT 01<br>DF/WL 7-10" dib                        | 783                      | \$480.00             | \$505.62           | \$68,831.04                        | \$88,891.50        | \$113.53      | 2            | Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.           |
| 104069         |     | Q COUSINS PART 2 SORT 02<br>DF/WL 11"+ dib                         | 553                      | \$500.00             | \$690.00           | (\$7,279.24)                       | \$97,790.76        | \$176.84      | 3            | PotlatchDeltic Land & Lumber, LLC   |
| 104070         |     | Q COUSINS PART 2 SORT 03<br>GF/AF/ES/LP non-chuckable DF/WL 7-     | 270                      | \$415.40             | \$424.33           | \$3,326.62                         | \$5,737.18         | \$21.25       | 2            | Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.           |
| 104071         |     | Q COUSINS PART 2 SORT 04<br>GF/AF/ES/LP non-chuckable DF/WL        | 291                      | \$423.92             | \$424.19           | (\$11,404.99)                      | (\$11,324.99)      | (\$38.92)     | 1            | IFG Timber, LLC                     |
| 104072         |     | Q COUSINS PART 2 SORT 05<br>WRC 5"+ dib                            | 516                      | \$699.48             | \$846.01           | \$157,174.70                       | \$232,788.40       | \$451.14      | 2            | IFG Timber, LLC                     |
| 104073         |     | Q COUSINS PART 2 SORT 06<br>DF/WL/GF/AF/ES/LP 5-6" dib             | 575                      | \$332.80             | \$332.89           | \$114,445.39                       | \$114,497.39       | \$199.13      | 1            | Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.           |
| 104074         |     | Q COUSINS PART 2 SORT 07<br>all conifer species except WRC 2"+ dib | 161                      | \$270.00             |                    | \$5,017.86                         |                    |               | 0            | NO BIDS                             |
| 104415         |     | Q NORTH WILLIAMS SORT 01<br>DF/WL 7-10" dib                        | 528                      | \$480.00             | \$529.98           | \$102,274.06                       | \$128,663.50       | \$243.68      | 3            | Boise Cascade Wood Products,<br>LLC |
| 104416         |     | Q NORTH WILLIAMS SORT 02<br>DF/WL 11"+ dib                         | 403                      | \$500.00             | \$530.00           | \$102,781.47                       | \$114,871.47       | \$285.04      | 3            | Boise Cascade Wood Products,<br>LLC |

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES**

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

\* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

**May 2023**

| AGREE-<br>MENT | FSC | NAME OF SALE                                                   | VOLUME<br>OFFERED<br>MBF | Delivered Values     |                    | Stumpage Determination (Projected) |                    |               |              |                           |
|----------------|-----|----------------------------------------------------------------|--------------------------|----------------------|--------------------|------------------------------------|--------------------|---------------|--------------|---------------------------|
|                |     |                                                                |                          | MINIMUM<br>BID / MBF | BID<br>PRICE / MBF | TOTAL<br>MINIMUM<br>BID            | TOTAL BID<br>PRICE | PRICE<br>/MBF | # OF<br>BIDS | APPARENT<br>HIGH BIDDER   |
| 104417         |     | Q NORTH WILLIAMS SORT 03<br>GF/LP/WP non-chuckable DF/WL       | 20                       | \$424.00             | \$424.00           | \$1,311.36                         | \$1,311.36         | \$65.57       | 1            | IFG Timber, LLC           |
| 104418         |     | Q NORTH WILLIAMS SORT 04<br>PP 6-10" dib                       | 872                      | \$397.50             | \$397.50           | (\$81,823.35)                      | (\$81,823.35)      | (\$93.83)     | 1            | IFG Timber, LLC           |
| 104419         |     | Q NORTH WILLIAMS SORT 05<br>PP 11"+ dib                        | 967                      | \$418.04             | \$418.02           | \$45,987.05                        | \$45,964.23        | \$47.53       | 1            | IFG Timber, LLC           |
| 104420         |     | Q NORTH WILLIAMS SORT 06<br>WRC 5"+ dib                        | 168                      | \$699.41             | \$845.94           | \$66,430.48                        | \$91,046.57        | \$541.94      | 2            | IFG Timber, LLC           |
| 104421         |     | Q NORTH WILLIAMS SORT 07<br>DF/WL/GF/LP/WP 5-6" dib            | 285                      | \$332.80             | \$332.80           | \$64,555.03                        | \$64,555.03        | \$226.51      | 1            | Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. |
| 104422         |     | Q NORTH WILLIAMS SORT 08<br>All conifer species except WRC 2"+ | 57                       | \$270.00             |                    | \$5,046.83                         |                    |               | 0            | NO BIDS                   |