

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

February 2017

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
93648		CALYPSO	Clallam	OI	4679	\$1,194,000.00	\$1,642,652.04	\$351.07	38%	1.00	Murphy Company
94319		TOUTLE TYPHOON	Cowlitz	PC	2757	\$713,000.00	\$1,022,098.78	\$370.73	43%	4.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
93904		MILL WRIGHT	Cowlitz, Wahkiakum	PC	3378	\$1,113,000.00	\$1,365,511.10	\$404.24	23%	5.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94318		GRAVY TRAIN	Grays Harbor	PC	4724	\$1,415,000.00	\$1,507,231.00	\$319.06	7%	2.00	Western Timber, Inc.
94534		FANCY NANCY	Jefferson	OI	2951	\$534,000.00	\$804,932.00	\$272.77	51%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
93936		BRIGHTY	Lewis	PC	2064	\$444,000.00	\$636,163.00	\$308.22	43%	2.00	A & W Timber Brokers, Inc.
94291		CARSON CRK	Lewis	PC	3274	\$994,000.00	\$1,495,657.00	\$456.83	50%	5.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
94253		UPPER SALMON	Pacific	PC	2904	\$660,000.00	\$1,116,605.48	\$384.51	69%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
93483		COLD SPRINGS SORTS	Skagit	NW	23	\$160.00	\$160.00	\$6.96	0%	2.00	See Sort Sales Results
94063		STEBBINS VRH VDT	Skamania	PC	7692	\$1,958,000.00	\$2,067,503.34	\$268.79	6%	1.00	Murphy Company
93898		LUGNUT	Snohomish	NW	5684	\$1,500,000.00	\$2,328,424.00	\$409.65	55%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
93477	*	LOLLYPOP VRH & VDT	Thurston	SP	6720	\$2,368,000.00	\$2,859,381.00	\$425.50	21%	3.00	Western Timber, Inc.
94431		SHARP EDGE SORTS	Wahkiakum	PC	3701	\$1,248,218.59	\$1,577,899.92	\$426.34	26%	3.00	See Sort Sales Results
93611		ZEPPELIN	Whatcom	NW	5809	\$1,901,000.00	\$2,217,265.00	\$381.69	17%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
94599		TWAYBLADE SWT	Whatcom	NW	593	\$64,000.00					NO BIDS

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
February 2017	15	14	0	1	56,953	56,360	0	593	99%	\$16,042,378.59	\$20,641,483.66	\$366.24	29%	2.57
YTD FY 2017	76	75	0	1	292,599	292,006	0	593	100%	\$74,543,895.62	\$99,654,987.34	\$341.28	34%	2.75

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
February 2017	15	14	0	1	56,953	56,360	0	593	99%	\$16,042,378.59	\$20,641,483.66	\$366.24	29%	2.57
YTD FY 2017	76	75	0	1	292,599	292,006	0	593	100%	\$74,543,895.62	\$99,654,987.34	\$341.28	34%	2.75

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

February 2017

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)				APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
				MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	# OF BIDS	
94374		COLD SPRINGS Sort 11	23	\$208.00	\$208.00	\$160.00	\$160.00	\$6.96	2	Fritch Mill, Inc.
94432		SHARP EDGE SORT 1	548	\$550.00	\$630.00	\$212,404.80	\$256,244.80	\$467.60	4	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
94433		SHARP EDGE SORT 2	571	\$610.00	\$653.00	\$263,031.15	\$287,584.15	\$503.65	4	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
94434		SHARP EDGE SORT 3	142	\$540.00	\$553.25	\$56,731.84	\$58,613.34	\$412.77	2	Swanson Brothers Lumber Company, Inc.
94435		SHARP EDGE SORT 4	628	\$640.00	\$680.00	\$309,151.84	\$334,271.84	\$532.28	3	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
94436		SHARP EDGE SORT 5	566	\$425.00	\$536.33	\$123,099.34	\$186,112.12	\$328.82	5	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94437		SHARP EDGE SORT 6	363	\$445.00	\$584.35	\$81,613.29	\$132,197.34	\$364.18	5	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94438		SHARP EDGE SORT 7	800	\$445.00	\$584.35	\$175,096.00	\$286,576.00	\$358.22	5	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94439		SHARP EDGE SORT 8	24	\$1,000.00	\$1,383.75	\$20,023.92	\$29,233.92	\$1,218.08	2	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
94440		SHARP EDGE SORT 9	37	\$325.00	\$325.00	\$3,958.63	\$3,958.63	\$106.99	1	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
94441		SHARP EDGE SORT 10	18	\$364.00	\$364.00	\$2,627.82	\$2,627.82	\$145.99	1	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
94442		SHARP EDGE SORT 11	4	\$338.00	\$338.00	\$479.96	\$479.96	\$119.99	1	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
94645		COOGANS BLUFF FIT SORT 01	402	\$410.00	\$435.00	\$56,195.75	\$66,245.75	\$164.79	2	Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
94646		COOGANS BLUFF FIT SORT 02	1,966	\$402.00	\$433.02	\$167,110.82	\$228,096.14	\$116.02	2	Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
94647		COOGANS BLUFF FIT SORT 03	988	\$320.04		\$316,200.00			0	NO BIDS
94648		COOGANS BLUFF FIT SORT 04	29	\$297.38		\$8,624.00			0	NO BIDS
94649		COOGANS BLUFF FIT SORT 05	66	\$207.00	\$297.00	(\$18,514.29)	(\$12,574.29)	(\$190.52)	1	Home Fires Wood Company

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS**

February 2017

NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	TREATMENT ACRES	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)	
					TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	TOTAL REVENUE	NET \$ / MBF
COOGANS BLUFF FIT	Okanogan	NE	554	3,451	\$1,293,638.00			Sale Pending
	PROJECTS OFFERED	PROJECTS AWARDED	NOT AWARDED	TREATMENT ACRES	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME AWARDED		
February 2017	1	1	0	554	3,451	2,434		
YTD FY 2017	1	1	0	554	3,451	2,434		