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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 

 February 2022 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102045 TAYLOR  Jefferson OLY 5245 $994,374.93 $2,930,572.07 $558.74 195% 3.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 DOWNHILL SORTS 
 100499 SEATTLE RIDGE Mason SP 5440 $2,151,000.00 $3,208,009.60 $589.71 49% 4.00 Stella-Jones Corporation 
 101110 MASTER LINK Mason SP 3106 $1,318,000.00 $2,463,231.00 $793.06 87% 5.00 Manke Timber Company, Inc. 
 102503 Q BALD GOAT Okanogan NE 3721 $569,000.00 $639,471.70 $171.85 12% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 83240 BULL WACKER Pacific PC 5851 $1,467,000.00 $1,981,258.00 $338.62 35% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92187 HULLIN FIR Pacific PC 4040 $1,065,000.00 $1,404,234.00 $347.58 32% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 101112 HIGH CALIBER Snohomish NW 3144 $929,000.00 $2,766,608.00 $879.96 198% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 101101 RHONE Thurston SP 3128 $1,138,000.00 $1,988,844.00 $635.82 75% 4.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

February 2022 8 8 0 0 33,675 33,675 0 0 100% $9,631,374.93 $17,382,228.37 $516.18 80% 3.13 
YTD FY 2022 61 59 0 2 267,873 262,716 0 5,157 98% $85,196,399.92 $113,951,293.79 $433.74 34% 2.78  

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

February 2022 8 8 0 0 33,675 33,675 0 0 100% $9,631,374.93 $17,382,228.37 $516.18 80% 3.13 
YTD FY 2022 71 68 0 3 281,589 274,558 0 7,031 98% $85,973,609.92 $115,559,185.93 $420.89 34% 2.69 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

 February 2022 

 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102897 TAYLOR DOWNHILL SORT 01 1,312 $690.00 $1,000.00 $326,584.88 $733,304.88 $558.92 5 Manke Lumber Co. Inc. 
 DF High Quality B Sort 12"+ SED 
 102898 TAYLOR DOWNHILL SORT 02 128 $550.00 $1,000.00 $12,111.54 $69,711.54 $544.62 3 Manke Lumber Co. Inc. 
 DF Sawlog 20"+ SED 
 102899 TAYLOR DOWNHILL SORT 03 1,245 $600.00 $1,000.00 $186,751.74 $684,751.74 $550.00 5 Manke Lumber Co. Inc. 
 DF Sawlog 12" to 19" SED 
 102900 TAYLOR DOWNHILL SORT 04 1,776 $600.00 $1,000.00 $218,876.73 $929,276.73 $523.24 5 Manke Lumber Co. Inc. 
 DF Sawlog 5" to 11" SED 
 102901 TAYLOR DOWNHILL SORT 05 363 $1,100.00 $1,726.00 $239,090.46 $466,328.46 $1,284.65 3 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 RC Camprun 5"+ 
 102902 TAYLOR DOWNHILL SORT 06 207 $450.00 $518.00 $660.62 $14,736.62 $71.19 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 Whitewood Sawlog 5" to 11" SED 
 102903 TAYLOR DOWNHILL SORT 07 164 $500.00 $622.00 $11,191.59 $31,199.59 $190.24 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 Whitewood Sawlog 12" + SED 
 102904 TAYLOR DOWNHILL SORT 08 29 $443.10 $489.66 $375.11 $1,725.11 $59.49 2 Port Angeles Hardwood 
 Hardwood Sawlog 5" + SED 
 102905 TAYLOR DOWNHILL SORT 09 21 $252.00 $290.34 ($1,267.74) ($462.60) ($22.03) 1 Evergreen Fibre 
 Conifer Pulp 2"+ SED 


