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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 December 2014 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 91827 RUSTY TAILGATE Clallam Ol 3195 $695,000.00 $1,018,754.00 $318.86 47% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 91425 KINGDOM SORTS Clark PC 546 $160,764.24 $160,764.24 $294.44 0% 1.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 91373 CHICKEN  Cowlitz PC 3486 $1,246,000.00 $2,314,339.12 $663.90 86% 5.00 McFarland Cascade Holdings Inc. 
 SANDWICH 
 91583 APPLE TREE SORTS  Grays Harbor SP 2254 $906,841.47 $1,053,488.19 $467.39 16% 2.70 See Sort Sales Results 
 91780 GOAT TRAIL Jefferson Ol 2836 $659,000.00 $1,052,846.00 $371.24 60% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 90724 DIVIDED Mason SP 2177 $468,000.00 $713,243.80 $327.63 52% 1.00 Murphy Company 
 90725 * THIN MINTS Mason SP 3188 $832,000.00 $1,819,877.00 $570.85 119% 3.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 
 90751 NORTH STOUT Pacific PC 1417 $316,000.00 $531,101.00 $374.81 68% 4.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 91408 MCWALVILLE Pacific, Lewis PC 5382 $1,585,000.00 $2,763,465.19 $513.46 74% 4.00 Murphy Company 
 90890 ALGER FLATS Skagit NW 3665 $1,070,000.00 $1,552,383.00 $423.57 45% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 90945 WADDELL VIEW Thurston SP 3318 $1,093,000.00 $1,500,997.00 $452.38 37% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2014 11 11 0 0 31,464 31,464 0 0 100% $9,031,605.71 $14,481,258.54 $460.25 60% 2.70 
YTD FY 2015 40 40 0 0 150,147 149,581 0 566 100% $38,493,037.39 $55,284,911.89 $369.60 44% 2.79 
  
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 91054 TORODA CACHE Okanogan NE 1775 $199,000.00 $266,897.94 $150.37 34% 3.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products,  
 92065 CHILIWIST FIRE  Okanogan NE 4004 $247,000.00 $256,160.80 $63.98 4% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 SALVAGE 
 90907 SIBERIA VDT & VRH Snohomish NW 1121 $221,000.00 $221,306.68 $197.42 0% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2014 3 3 0 0 6,900 6,900 0 0 100% $667,000.00 $744,365.42 $107.88 12% 1.67 
YTD FY 2015 10 9 0 1 16,042 12,621 0 3,421 79% $1,542,000.00 $1,886,161.23 $149.45 22% 2.11  
  

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2014 14 14 0 0 38,364 38,364 0 0 100% $9,698,605.71 $15,225,623.96 $396.87 57% 2.48 
YTD FY 2015 50 49 0 1 166,189 162,202 0 3,987 98% $40,035,037.39 $57,171,073.12 $352.47 43% 2.67 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 December 2014 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 91429 KINGDOM SORT 4 546 $500.00 $500.00 $160,764.24 $160,764.24 $294.44 1 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 91584 APPLE TREE SORT 01 89 $520.00 $544.00 $30,741.49 $32,877.49 $369.41 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 91585 APPLE TREE SORT 02 161 $625.00 $655.00 $66,839.15 $71,669.15 $445.15 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 91586 APPLE TREE SORT 03 686 $645.00 $671.00 $296,983.12 $314,819.12 $458.92 4 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 91587 APPLE TREE SORT 04 612 $575.00 $600.00 $185,925.60 $201,225.60 $328.80 1 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 91588 APPLE TREE SORT 05 379 $675.00 $740.00 $175,260.97 $199,895.97 $527.43 5 Olympic Panel Products, LLC 
 91589 APPLE TREE SORT 06 43 $525.00 $568.50 $12,957.62 $14,828.12 $344.84 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 91590 APPLE TREE SORT 07 117 $1,000.00 $1,585.00 $89,027.64 $157,472.64 $1,345.92 4 Reichert Shake & Fencing, Inc 
 91591 APPLE TREE SORT 08 85 $698.24 $781.27 $40,661.90 $47,720.12 $561.41 2 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 91592 APPLE TREE SORT 09 38 $252.00 $288.00 $4,757.22 $6,125.22 $161.19 1 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 91593 APPLE TREE SORT 10 44 $234.00 $306.00 $3,686.76 $6,854.76 $155.79 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 


