

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

August 2022

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
103161		RIO	Clallam	OLY	1898	\$697,000.00	\$905,489.68	\$477.08	30%	3.00	Murphy Company
102084		ZUKE	Grays Harbor	SP	3275	\$1,133,000.00	\$1,374,221.00	\$419.61	21%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
102121		HAWKEYE	Grays Harbor	PC	4005	\$1,472,000.00	\$1,526,196.72	\$381.07	4%	3.00	Murphy Company
102046		T3 Maple Bar	Jefferson	OLY	7333	\$1,514,000.00	\$1,678,578.58	\$228.91	11%	2.00	Willis Enterprises
102261		PENNY WISE	Jefferson	OLY	5128	\$1,907,000.00	\$2,851,780.00	\$556.12	50%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
97373	*	PEACHY	Lewis	SP	2727	\$1,001,000.00	\$1,157,641.52	\$424.51	16%	1.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101980		Q MUDDY BASIN	Pend Oreille	NE	9618	\$2,212,000.00	\$2,638,420.00	\$274.32	19%	1.00	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
102815		SHOELACES	Skagit	NW	1955	\$668,000.00	\$993,848.00	\$508.36	49%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
August 2022	8	8	0	0	35,939	35,939	0	0	100%	\$10,604,000.00	\$13,126,175.50	\$365.23	24%	2.38
YTD FY 2023	17	16	0	1	78,931	74,236	0	4,695	94%	\$24,373,000.00	\$29,693,877.74	\$399.99	22%	2.25

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
103899		MAHI MAHI CEDAR SALVAGE	Jefferson	OLY	60	\$80,000.00	\$746,250.00	\$12,437.50	833%	6.00	Perez Shingle LLC
102509		Q NORTH WENAS	Kittitas, Yakima	SE	2279	\$143,876.00	\$308,439.50	\$135.34	114%	2.00	Timbered Rangeland Management, LLC
102758		RUE 32	Pacific	PC	1123	\$246,000.00	\$302,773.16	\$269.61	23%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
103422		Q NILE FIRE SALVAGE	Yakima	SE	1122	\$46,000.00	\$47,326.30	\$42.18	3%	1.00	Gibson and Son Road Building, Inc.

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
August 2022	4	4	0	0	4,584	4,584	0	0	100%	\$515,876.00	\$1,404,788.96	\$306.45	172%	2.75
YTD FY 2023	4	4	0	0	4,584	4,584	0	0	100%	\$515,876.00	\$1,404,788.96	\$306.45	172%	2.75

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
August 2022	12	12	0	0	40,523	40,523	0	0	100%	\$11,119,876.00	\$14,530,964.46	\$358.59	31%	2.50
YTD FY 2023	21	20	0	1	83,515	78,820	0	4,695	94%	\$24,888,876.00	\$31,098,666.70	\$394.55	25%	2.35

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)