

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

April 2021

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
98103		WILLEY RIDGE VRH VDT	Clallam	OLY	8797	\$573,000.00	\$630,000.00	\$71.62	10%	1.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
101613		Q DRUMMER	Ferry	NE	5230	\$1,104,000.00	\$2,279,088.00	\$435.77	106%	2.00	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
101242		Q HOG RANCH SORTS	Kittitas, Yakima	SE	3210	\$160,180.28	\$957,685.15	\$298.34	498%	2.00	See Sort Sales Results
100023		FRANCES 40 SORTS	Pacific	PC	105	\$2,423.71	\$2,423.71	\$23.08	0%	1.00	See Sort Sales Results
100819		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORTS	Pacific	PC	6148	\$2,309,188.70	\$3,010,918.70	\$489.74	30%	2.18	See Sort Sales Results
100356		GOODFELLERS	Snohomish	NW	4201	\$1,079,000.00	\$1,943,501.01	\$462.63	80%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101502		Q PARKER MTN	Stevens	NE	4269	\$954,000.00	\$1,984,860.15	\$464.95	108%	2.00	Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
101614		Q CHAMOKANE HILL	Stevens	NE	3630	\$663,000.00	\$1,401,509.64	\$386.09	111%	4.00	Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
100457		BELL BOY Sorts	Whatcom	NW	4503	\$1,963,540.47	\$2,774,648.07	\$616.18	41%	1.92	See Sort Sales Results

**SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>April 2021</b>	9	9	0	0	40,093	39,674	0	419	100%	\$8,807,702.63	\$14,984,634.43	\$377.69	70%	2.01
<b>YTD FY 2021</b>	92	91	0	1	457,910	453,014	0	4,896	99%	\$133,164,289.86	\$183,994,395.43	\$406.16	38%	2.45

**SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>April 2021</b>	9	9	0	0	40,093	39,674	0	419	100%	\$8,807,702.63	\$14,984,634.43	\$377.69	70%	2.01
<b>YTD FY 2021</b>	97	95	0	2	467,163	462,021	0	5,142	99%	\$133,730,289.86	\$185,540,025.73	\$401.58	39%	2.45

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

April 2021

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)				
				MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
100030		FRANCES 40 SORT 7	105	\$250.00	\$250.00	\$2,423.71	\$2,423.71	\$23.08	1	Lower Columbia Fish Enhancement Group
100820		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORT 1	1,232	\$650.00	\$778.75	\$444,853.70	\$603,473.70	\$489.83	2	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
100821		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORT 2	963	\$700.00	\$805.00	\$417,328.13	\$518,443.13	\$538.36	2	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
100822		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORT 3	575	\$700.00	\$735.00	\$252,754.21	\$272,879.21	\$474.57	1	Stimson Lumber Company, Inc.
100823		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORT 4	1,342	\$750.00	\$1,005.00	\$603,433.72	\$945,643.72	\$704.65	3	Canyon Lumber Company, Inc.
100824		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORT 5	774	\$575.00	\$575.00	\$209,229.65	\$209,229.65	\$270.32	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
100825		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORT 6	605	\$600.00	\$600.00	\$219,168.84	\$219,168.84	\$362.26	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
100826		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORT 7	287	\$600.00	\$750.00	\$102,715.16	\$145,765.16	\$507.89	2	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
100827		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORT 8	126	\$700.00	\$875.00	\$59,215.28	\$81,265.28	\$644.96	2	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
100828		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORT 9	83	\$260.00	\$351.00	(\$6,072.90)	\$1,480.10	\$17.83	3	MTS Enterprises
100829		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORT 10	84	\$364.00	\$364.00	(\$806.19)	(\$806.19)	(\$9.60)	2	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
100830		DASHINGLY QUIRKY SORT 11	77	\$390.00	\$481.00	\$7,369.10	\$14,376.10	\$186.70	3	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
101152		BELL BOY Sort 01	136	\$750.00	\$980.00	\$63,131.11	\$94,411.11	\$694.20	2	Canyon Lumber Company, Inc.
101153		BELL BOY Sort 02	493	\$750.00	\$900.00	\$228,850.27	\$302,800.27	\$614.20	3	Canyon Lumber Company, Inc.
101154		BELL BOY Sort 03	444	\$650.00	\$700.00	\$183,851.22	\$206,051.22	\$464.08	1	Great Western Lumber Co.
101155		BELL BOY Sort 04	672	\$650.00	\$728.00	\$260,681.79	\$313,097.79	\$465.92	1	Sierra Pacific Industries
101156		BELL BOY Sort 05	318	\$650.00	\$728.00	\$117,888.75	\$142,692.75	\$448.72	1	Sierra Pacific Industries
101157		BELL BOY Sort 06	404	\$500.00	\$608.00	\$95,250.81	\$138,882.81	\$343.77	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
101158		BELL BOY Sort 07	792	\$450.00	\$609.00	\$134,354.35	\$260,282.35	\$328.64	1	Sierra Pacific Industries
101159		BELL BOY Sort 08	382	\$1,600.00	\$2,425.00	\$399,976.66	\$715,126.66	\$1,872.06	4	Columbia Cedar, Inc.
101160		BELL BOY Sort 09	175	\$950.00	\$1,062.00	\$117,622.63	\$137,222.63	\$784.13	2	The Oeser Company
101161		BELL BOY Sort 10	225	\$1,800.00	\$2,200.00	\$335,104.60	\$425,104.60	\$1,889.35	2	Stella-Jones Corporation
101162		BELL BOY Sort 11	105	\$650.00	\$710.00	\$37,816.73	\$44,116.73	\$420.16	2	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
101163		BELL BOY Sort 12	196	\$200.00		(\$5,343.09)			0	NO BIDS
101164		BELL BOY Sort 13	68	\$162.00	\$220.50	(\$9,118.85)	(\$5,140.85)	(\$75.60)	2	Swanson Bark and Wood Products, Inc
101165		BELL BOY Sort 14	93	\$225.00		\$3,473.49			0	NO BIDS
101243		Q HOG RANCH SORT 1	1,913	\$490.00	\$735.00	\$207,463.21	\$676,148.21	\$353.45	3	Yakama Forest Products
101244		Q HOG RANCH SORT 2	790	\$395.00	\$711.00	(\$21,685.63)	\$227,954.37	\$288.55	2	Yakama Forest Products
101245		Q HOG RANCH SORT 3	249	\$410.04	\$738.07	(\$6,493.82)	\$75,186.18	\$301.95	2	Yakama Forest Products
101246		Q HOG RANCH SORT 4	130	\$405.00		\$2,500.13			0	NO BIDS
101247		Q HOG RANCH SORT 5	128	\$225.00	\$225.00	(\$21,603.61)	(\$21,603.61)	(\$168.78)	1	Gibson and Son Road Building, Inc.

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

\* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)