

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
TIMBER AUCTION RESULTS - SEPTEMBER 2023

BOARD SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
104033		TINES UP	Clark	PC	4,461	\$1,128,000.00	\$1,781,326.92	\$399.31	58%	5.00	Murphy Company
103485		LARGE MARGE	Lewis	PC	1,120	\$340,000.00	\$514,024.00	\$458.95	51%	7.00	Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
104207		Q CHILLAXIN	Okanogan	NE	4,722	\$412,000.00	\$787,434.72	\$166.76	91%	1.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
104298		DEER TRAIL	Stevens	NE	5,687	\$1,147,000.00	\$1,530,734.65	\$269.16	33%	4.00	IFG Timber, LLC
104599		Q GLASCO	Stevens	NE	6,893	\$1,099,000.00	\$1,282,483.76	\$186.06	17%	1.00	Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
102287		Q BLOWHOLE	Yakima	SE	3,680	\$504,000.00	\$677,429.00	\$184.08	34%	1.00	Woodgrain Lumber

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALE	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE/ MFB	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
September 2023	6	6	0	0	26,563	26,563	0	0	100%	\$4,630,000.00	\$6,573,433.05	\$247.47	42%	3.17
YTD FY 2024	16	16	0	0	61,220	61,059	0	161	100%	\$12,988,242.32	\$20,434,186.30	\$334.66	57%	3.22

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
102057		ELFENDAHL PASS DAYLIGHTING	Mason	SP	165	\$36,000.00	\$65,759.00	\$398.54	83%	2.00	Erickson Logging, Inc.

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALE	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE/ MFB	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
September 2023	1	1	0	0	165	165	0	0	100%	\$36,000.00	\$65,759.00	\$398.54	83%	2.00
YTD FY 2024	6	5	0	1	10,618	5,924	0	4,694	56%	\$657,000.00	\$1,100,268.55	\$185.73	67%	2.20

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALE	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE/ MFB	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
September 2023	7	7	0	0	26,728	26,728	0	0	100%	\$4,666,000.00	\$6,639,192.05	\$248.40	42%	3.00
YTD FY 2024	22	21	0	1	71,838	66,983	0	4,855	93%	\$13,645,242.32	\$21,534,454.85	\$321.49	58%	2.98

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)