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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 May 2020 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 91527 LONE SPRUCE Clallam OLY 3649 $841,000.00 $881,233.50 $241.50 5% 3.00 Webster Logging 
 98878 SPRUCED UP Clallam OLY 7672 $1,189,000.00 $1,922,487.00 $250.58 62% 2.00 Harbor Timber 
 99241 WHISKEY CREEK  Clallam OLY 9692 $2,132,000.00 NO BIDS 
 LIMIT 
 99196 OL STRINGER Jefferson OLY 4921 $631,000.00 $691,095.00 $140.44 10% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 99253 CITY SKIDDER Jefferson OLY 6925 $1,751,000.00 $2,700,000.00 $389.89 54% 3.00 Bekkevar Logging and Trucking Inc. 
 95917 * DINGO DANCE Lewis SP 1570 $280,000.00 $361,780.50 $230.43 29% 3.00 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 99922 ICONIC SORTS Pacific, Lewis PC 3861 $1,174,926.32 $1,502,675.01 $389.19 28% 3.80 See Sort Sales Results 
 98120 Q YONCK SORTS Pend Oreille NE 851 $85,032.11 $85,525.76 $100.50 1% 1.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 98033 COPPERHEAD Skagit NW 3343 $540,000.00 $575,202.03 $172.06 7% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 99598 TRANSYLVANIA  Skamania PC 3899 $1,350,992.53 $1,317,392.53 $337.88 -2% 2.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 VRH RMZ SORTS 
 99712 Q OLD SPRINGDALE Stevens NE 5230 $684,000.00 $818,502.88 $156.50 20% 3.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 99855 Q COMSTOCK SORTS Stevens NE 4771 ($419,713.47) ($457,096.47) ($95.81) 9% 1.57 See Sort Sales Results 
 98217 Q SHERRY RIDGE Stevens, Pend  NE 5544 $661,000.00 $726,847.76 $131.11 10% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 Oreille 
 98886 CARRACK Whatcom NW 928 $309,000.00 $362,760.00 $390.91 17% 5.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2020 14 13 0 1 62,856 52,639 0 10,217 85% $8,861,267.49 $11,488,405.50 $218.25 30% 2.34 
YTD FY 2020 111 104 0 7 517,708 482,346 0 35,362 94% $111,251,454.70 $143,714,306.98 $297.95 29% 2.51  

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 97154 SADIE HAWKINS Clallam OLY 302 $53,000.00 $76,000.00 $251.66 43% 1.00 Oakes Logging LLC 
 99415 TACOMA CREEK  Jefferson OLY 326 $50,000.00 $60,100.00 $184.36 20% 2.00 Clayci Properties LLC 
 PIT EXPANSION 
 99491 Q BEAR GAP Klickitat SE 182 $29,000.00 $31,000.00 $170.33 7% 2.00 Mountain Logging, Inc 
 100080 Q BLACK  Okanogan NE 1939 $148,000.00 $269,351.31 $138.91 82% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 DIAMOND 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2020 4 4 0 0 2,749 2,749 0 0 100% $280,000.00 $436,451.31 $158.77 56% 1.75 
YTD FY 2020 8 8 0 0 8,409 8,409 0 0 100% $925,000.00 $1,418,157.39 $168.65 53% 2.25 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2020 18 17 0 1 65,605 55,388 0 10,217 85% $9,141,267.49 $11,924,856.81 $215.30 30% 2.20 
YTD FY 2020 119 112 0 7 526,117 490,755 0 35,362 95% $112,176,454.70 $145,132,464.37 $295.73 29% 2.50 

 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 99923 ICONIC SORT 1 370 $510.00 $618.01 $99,981.71 $139,945.41 $378.23 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 99924 ICONIC SORT 2 649 $580.00 $640.00 $235,944.50 $274,884.50 $423.55 4 Murphy Company 
 99925 ICONIC SORT 3 712 $500.00 $635.00 $199,389.08 $295,509.08 $415.04 6 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 99926 ICONIC SORT 4 630 $580.00 $640.00 $235,822.13 $273,622.13 $434.32 8 Murphy Company 
 99927 ICONIC SORT 5 736 $580.00 $755.00 $250,571.82 $379,371.82 $515.45 7 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 99928 ICONIC SORT 6 137 $440.00 $504.27 $27,439.85 $36,244.84 $264.56 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 99929 ICONIC SORT 7 370 $330.20 $451.84 $46,306.43 $91,310.43 $246.78 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 99930 ICONIC SORT 8 155 $540.00 $83,700.00 0 NO BIDS 
 99931 ICONIC SORT 9 41 $364.00 $468.00 $2,155.81 $6,419.81 $156.58 3 DaPaul Chip 
 99932 ICONIC SORT 10 9 $364.00 $468.00 $473.23 $1,409.23 $156.58 3 DaPaul Chip 
 99933 ICONIC SORT 11 52 $260.00 $468.00 ($6,858.24) $3,957.76 $76.11 3 Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC 
 100066 TRANSYLVANIA VRH RMZ SORTS 2 2,760 $530.00 $530.00 $959,682.19 $959,682.19 $347.71 4 Western Forest Products 
 100067 TRANSYLVANIA VRH RMZ SORTS 3 1,049 $515.00 $515.00 $354,206.33 $354,206.33 $337.66 1 Western Forest Products 
 100069 TRANSYLVANIA VRH RMZ SORTS 5 84 $400.00 $33,600.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100069 TRANSYLVANIA VRH RMZ SORTS 5 84 $450.00 $37,800.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100072 TRANSYLVANIA VRH RMZ SORTS 8 6 $800.00 $800.00 $3,504.01 $3,504.01 $584.00 1 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 100081 Q COMSTOCK SORT 01 572 $402.00 $432.00 ($30,184.73) ($13,024.73) ($22.77) 3 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100082 Q COMSTOCK SORT 02 354 $400.00 $400.00 $5,986.31 $5,986.31 $16.91 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 100083 Q COMSTOCK SORT 03 889 $316.15 $359.61 ($142,485.57) ($103,850.57) ($116.82) 2 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100084 Q COMSTOCK SORT 04 915 $317.97 $318.03 ($394,623.19) ($394,563.19) ($431.22) 1 IFG Timber, LLC 
 100085 Q COMSTOCK SORT 05 606 $791.88 $800.68 $280,630.58 $285,962.58 $471.89 1 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 100086 Q COMSTOCK SORT 06 1,049 $319.92 $320.02 ($187,500.53) ($187,400.53) ($178.65) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100087 Q COMSTOCK SORT 07 100 $225.00 $225.00 ($50,206.34) ($50,206.34) ($502.06) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100088 Q COMSTOCK SORT 08 286 $345.00 $98,670.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100193 Q YONCK SORT 04 621 $291.47 $292.27 $46,701.40 $47,195.05 $76.00 1 IFG Timber, LLC 
 100195 Q YONCK SORT 06 131 $296.79 $296.79 $5,148.88 $5,148.88 $39.30 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 100196 Q YONCK SORT 07 99 $549.49 $549.49 $33,181.83 $33,181.83 $335.17 1 Bell Timber, Inc. 
 


