

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

January 2021

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
98103		WILLEY RIDGE VRH VDT	Clallam	OLY	8797	\$1,293,000.00					NO BIDS
100852		FOR WHAT IT'S WORTH	Clallam	OLY	5100	\$1,152,000.00	\$1,188,166.07	\$232.97	3%	2.00	Harbor Timber
100885		TOMAUDER	Clallam	OLY	1853	\$463,000.00					NO BIDS
100856		DUTCH VRH THIN RMZ	Cowlitz	PC	8475	\$1,903,000.00	\$3,091,722.21	\$364.80	62%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
100910		GOT WOOD SORTS	Cowlitz	PC	4079	\$1,517,297.95	\$2,206,455.02	\$540.93	45%	3.33	See Sort Sales Results
92521	*	SOONER	King	SP	4728	\$1,877,000.00	\$2,587,237.62	\$547.22	38%	4.00	Murphy Company
100735		FIRE ROAD VRH RMZ	Lewis	PC	983	\$354,000.00	\$446,796.00	\$454.52	26%	3.00	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
98216	*	SNAKE FARM VRH & WMZ THIN	Mason	SP	7512	\$3,274,000.00	\$4,385,588.27	\$583.81	34%	3.00	Murphy Company
100498		COME ON DOWN	Mason	SP	2718	\$1,299,000.00	\$1,702,289.11	\$626.30	31%	4.00	Stella-Jones Corporation
100257		REPEATER	Pacific	PC	3210	\$872,000.00	\$887,441.00	\$276.46	2%	1.00	Stimson Lumber Company, Inc.
100357		YELLOW BEAR	Skagit	NW	6224	\$2,305,000.00	\$2,806,442.00	\$450.91	22%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
100058		BLUEGRASS	Snohomish	NW	5662	\$2,660,000.00	\$3,616,792.84	\$638.78	36%	3.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
100353		MADERA Sorts	Snohomish	NW	4053	\$1,521,640.79	\$2,138,835.36	\$527.72	41%	2.64	See Sort Sales Results
100427		BRONCO	Whatcom	NW	4566	\$1,708,000.00	\$1,854,352.00	\$406.12	9%	1.00	Sierra Pacific Industries

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
January 2021	14	12	0	2	67,960	57,231	0	10,729	84%	\$20,439,793.31	\$26,912,117.50	\$470.24	32%	2.75
YTD FY 2021	67	63	0	4	324,039	300,079	0	23,960	93%	\$89,733,522.21	\$125,409,057.76	\$417.92	40%	2.54

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
January 2021	14	12	0	2	67,960	57,231	0	10,729	84%	\$20,439,793.31	\$26,912,117.50	\$470.24	32%	2.75
YTD FY 2021	71	66	0	5	330,015	305,809	0	24,206	93%	\$90,068,522.21	\$126,225,731.31	\$412.76	40%	2.55

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

January 2021

Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)			# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
				MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF		
100911		GOT WOOD SORT 1	1,671	\$610.00	\$792.50	\$636,460.93	\$941,418.43	\$563.39	5	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
100912		GOT WOOD SORT 2	310	\$650.00	\$850.00	\$119,944.04	\$181,944.04	\$586.92	4	High Cascade, Inc.
100913		GOT WOOD SORT 3	952	\$675.00	\$846.25	\$444,751.79	\$607,781.79	\$638.43	6	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
100914		GOT WOOD SORT 4	247	\$900.00	\$1,040.00	\$168,324.63	\$202,904.63	\$821.48	2	Bell Timber, Inc.
100915		GOT WOOD SORT 5	350	\$475.00	\$625.00	\$54,784.19	\$107,284.19	\$306.53	4	High Cascade, Inc.
100916		GOT WOOD SORT 6	411	\$500.00	\$625.00	\$79,161.70	\$130,536.70	\$317.61	3	High Cascade, Inc.
100917		GOT WOOD SORT 7	2	\$900.00	\$900.00	\$1,341.77	\$1,341.77	\$670.89	1	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
100918		GOT WOOD SORT 8	24	\$475.00	\$725.00	\$5,682.63	\$11,682.63	\$486.78	2	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
100919		GOT WOOD SORT 9	13	\$364.00		\$4,732.00			0	NO BIDS
100920		GOT WOOD SORT 10	99	\$364.00	\$560.43	\$2,114.27	\$21,560.84	\$217.79	3	Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC
101137		MADERA Sort 01	304	\$775.00	\$1,035.00	\$93,741.75	\$172,781.75	\$568.36	3	Western Forest Products
101138		MADERA Sort 02	555	\$775.00	\$1,035.00	\$171,140.36	\$315,440.36	\$568.36	5	Western Forest Products
101139		MADERA Sort 03	602	\$650.00	\$753.00	\$213,186.87	\$275,192.87	\$457.13	3	Buse Timber & Sales, Inc.
101140		MADERA Sort 04	752	\$700.00	\$760.00	\$304,921.72	\$350,041.72	\$465.48	4	Fritch Forest Products, Inc.
101141		MADERA Sort 05	435	\$650.00	\$788.00	\$125,123.84	\$185,153.84	\$425.64	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
101142		MADERA Sort 06	170	\$650.00	\$650.00	\$52,691.67	\$52,691.67	\$309.95	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
101143		MADERA Sort 07	342	\$600.00	\$644.00	\$80,729.45	\$95,777.45	\$280.05	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
101144		MADERA Sort 08	252	\$1,400.00	\$2,002.00	\$249,719.65	\$401,423.65	\$1,592.95	4	Alta Forest Products, LLC
101145		MADERA Sort 09	250	\$950.00	\$1,025.00	\$156,362.75	\$175,112.75	\$700.45	2	Stella-Jones Corporation
101146		MADERA Sort 10	40	\$1,700.00	\$2,250.00	\$55,018.04	\$77,018.04	\$1,925.45	3	Stella-Jones Corporation
101147		MADERA Sort 11	103	\$600.00	\$630.00	\$28,794.78	\$31,884.78	\$309.56	2	Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC
101148		MADERA Sort 12	138	\$300.00	\$400.00	(\$2,683.96)	\$11,116.04	\$80.55	2	Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC
101149		MADERA Sort 13	24	\$150.00	\$180.00	(\$4,066.78)	(\$3,346.78)	(\$139.45)	2	Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC
101150		MADERA Sort 14	66	\$198.00		(\$1,586.57)			0	NO BIDS
101151		MADERA Sort 15	20	\$198.00	\$198.00	(\$1,452.78)	(\$1,452.78)	(\$72.64)	1	MTS Enterprises

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)