

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
TIMBER AUCTION RESULTS - MARCH 2024**

**BOARD SALE RESULTS**

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
105580		GUNDERS THUNDER	Clallam	OLY	3444	\$670,000.00	\$1,079,854.00	\$313.55	61%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
105473		DEPOT STOVE	Grays Harbor	PC	4226	\$1,022,000.00	\$1,356,662.00	\$321.03	33%	3.00	Western Timber, Inc.
104775		FREEDOM	Pacific	PC	8866	\$1,867,000.00	\$3,068,602.00	\$346.11	64%	6.00	Stimson Lumber Company, Inc.
105556		Q SOUTH SELKIRK	Spokane, Pend Oreille	NE	5011	\$890,000.00	\$1,357,888.00	\$270.98	53%	4.00	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
87001		STAIRWAY TO HEMLOCK	Wahkiakum	PC	8900	\$1,207,000.00	\$2,885,222.00	\$324.18	139%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
102819		BOWMAN HILL	Whatcom	NW	2759	\$618,000.00	\$1,031,971.00	\$374.04	67%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries

**SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>March 2024</b>	6	6	0	0	33,206	33,206	0	0	100%	\$6,274,000.00	\$10,780,199.00	\$324.65	72%	3.33
<b>YTD FY 2024</b>	67	67	0	0	282,309	281,880	0	429	100%	\$70,255,670.46	\$102,611,540.57	\$364.03	46%	3.21

**REGIONAL SALE RESULTS**

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
104813		LAUREL LANE	Klickitat	SE	2560	\$168,000.00	\$175,332.50	\$68.49	4%	1.00	Woodgrain Lumber
101630		Q HARVARD	Okanogan	NE	2599	\$30,000.00	\$235,741.04	\$90.70	686%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
104659		BOMBUR VRH VDT	Skagit	NW	1031	\$248,000.00	\$407,140.72	\$394.90	64%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries

**SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>March 2024</b>	3	3	0	0	6,190	6,190	0	0	100%	\$446,000.00	\$818,214.26	\$132.18	83%	2.00
<b>YTD FY 2024</b>	13	12	0	1	24,764	24,450	0	314	99%	\$1,721,000.00	\$3,103,968.69	\$126.95	80%	2.33

**SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>March 2024</b>	9	9	0	0	39,396	39,396	0	0	100%	\$6,720,000.00	\$11,598,413.26	\$294.41	73%	2.89
<b>YTD FY 2024</b>	80	79	0	1	307,073	306,330	0	743	100%	\$71,976,670.46	\$105,715,509.26	\$345.10	47%	3.07

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time  
\* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)