

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

March 2023

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
102080		CORKEY	Grays Harbor	SP	9025	\$3,184,000.00	\$4,494,057.00	\$497.96	41%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
102252		T3 C-1400 VRH VDT	Jefferson	OLY	10847	\$1,010,000.00	\$1,025,000.00	\$94.50	1%	1.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
102253		T3 C-2800	Jefferson	OLY	3132	\$339,000.00	\$526,651.00	\$168.15	55%	3.00	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
102109	*	SCHOOL	Mason, Pierce	SP	5085	\$1,824,000.00	\$3,152,888.00	\$620.04	73%	4.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
102769		GREAT DIVIDE	Pacific	PC	5006	\$760,000.00	\$1,223,093.00	\$244.33	61%	3.00	Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
103377		UPTICK	Pacific	PC	2097	\$584,000.00	\$765,467.00	\$365.03	31%	3.00	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
101720		CADDIS Sorts	Skagit	NW	1860	\$665,247.42	\$721,959.11	\$388.15	9%	2.00	See Sort Sales Results
103173		NORTH CAVANAUGH VRH VDT	Skagit	NW	4967	\$668,000.00	\$1,934,306.00	\$389.43	190%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
102085	*	BUTTERCUP	Thurston	SP	6232	\$2,416,000.00	\$2,447,699.06	\$392.76	1%	1.00	Murphy Company
92626		WILSON	Wahkiakum	PC	2663	\$491,000.00	\$1,049,966.00	\$394.28	114%	3.00	Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
103222		FIR REALS SORTS	Wahkiakum	PC	129	(\$9,008.80)	(\$8,170.30)	(\$63.34)	-9%	1.00	See Sort Sales Results

**SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>March 2023</b>	11	11	0	0	51,043	51,043	0	0	100%	\$11,932,238.62	\$17,332,915.87	\$339.57	45%	2.45
<b>YTD FY 2023</b>	73	73	0	0	324,010	324,010	0	0	101%	\$93,511,699.16	\$131,214,412.12	\$404.97	40%	2.91

**REGIONAL SALE RESULTS**

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
103771		WILD WEST	Clallam	OLY	1216	\$158,000.00	\$259,883.00	\$213.72	64%	5.00	Port Angeles Hardwood
103890		DAISY CHAIN	Clallam	OLY	1043	\$187,000.00	\$271,150.00	\$259.97	45%	3.00	Webster Logging
103967		BIRD CAGE	Clallam	OLY	611	\$59,000.00	\$73,690.00	\$120.61	25%	2.00	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
104699		BLYN SALVAGE	Jefferson, Clallam	OLY	241	\$93,000.00	\$123,423.12	\$512.13	33%	2.00	C & C Timber, Inc.
102791		RAINY PASS	Pacific	PC	1066	\$227,000.00	\$319,962.00	\$300.15	41%	3.00	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
103172		DROP TINE	Skagit	NW	2725	\$236,000.00	\$676,156.41	\$248.13	187%	3.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.

**SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>March 2023</b>	6	6	0	0	6,902	6,902	0	0	100%	\$960,000.00	\$1,724,264.53	\$249.82	80%	3.00
<b>YTD FY 2023</b>	18	16	0	2	21,120	20,894	0	226	99%	\$2,251,890.00	\$4,632,774.01	\$221.73	106%	2.75

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

\* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES**

March 2023

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
March 2023	17	17	0	0	57,945	57,945	0	0	100%	\$12,892,238.62	\$19,057,180.40	\$328.88	48%	2.65
YTD FY 2023	91	89	0	2	345,130	344,904	0	226	101%	\$95,763,589.16	\$135,847,186.13	\$393.87	42%	2.88

**SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	Delivered Values			Stumpage Determination (Projected)				
			VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
102606		CADDIS Sort 01 DF Sawlog 20"+	407	\$650.00	\$767.67	\$168,324.34	\$216,216.03	\$531.24	3	Fritch Forest Products, Inc.
102607		CADDIS Sort 02 DF Sawlog 12"-19"	318	\$740.00	\$755.00	\$173,714.91	\$178,484.91	\$561.27	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
102608		CADDIS Sort 03 DF Sawlog 5"-11"	69	\$690.00	\$690.00	\$34,728.62	\$34,728.62	\$503.31	1	Sierra Pacific Industries
102610		CADDIS Sort 05 WW Sawlog 12"-19"	694	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$211,165.68	\$211,165.68	\$304.27	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
102611		CADDIS Sort 06 WW Sawlog 5"-11"	282	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$85,805.07	\$85,805.07	\$304.27	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
102614		CADDIS Sort 09 Conifer Utility	90	\$180.00	\$225.00	(\$8,491.20)	(\$4,441.20)	(\$49.35)	2	Willis Enterprises
103233		FIR REALS SORT 11 Conifer Pulp 2"+	115	\$377.00	\$383.50	(\$8,031.10)	(\$7,283.60)	(\$63.34)	1	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
103234		FIR REALS SORT 12 Hardwood Pulp 2"+	14	\$377.00	\$383.50	(\$977.70)	(\$886.70)	(\$63.34)	1	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.