

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

April 2017

AGREEMENT FSC	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
94511	NO NAME CARPENTER VDT VRH	Clallam	OLY	6005	\$704,000.00	\$902,930.86	\$150.36	28%	1.00	Interfor U.S., Inc.
94994	BUCK SNORT SORTS	Cowlitz	PC	3737	\$1,192,264.60	\$1,436,391.91	\$384.37	20%	2.70	See Sort Sales Results
94684	LINK	Lewis	PC	7444	\$2,130,000.00	\$2,738,401.00	\$367.87	29%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
94796	SHAGGY SORTS	Lewis	PC	5695	\$1,823,984.94	\$2,416,953.30	\$424.40	33%	2.88	See Sort Sales Results
94236	ELK STUMP	Pacific	PC	9280	\$3,147,000.00	\$3,262,306.00	\$351.54	4%	1.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
94488	PIEROGI	Pacific	PC	2047	\$663,000.00	\$940,510.00	\$459.46	42%	2.00	Columbia Vista Corporation
95000	TRUFFLE SHUFFLE	Pacific	PC	6357	\$2,030,000.00	\$2,573,327.07	\$404.80	27%	5.00	Murphy Company
92944	* BENNY BEAVER VDT & VRH	Pierce	SP	5522	\$1,523,000.00	\$1,992,543.08	\$360.84	31%	4.00	Murphy Company
94737	CINNAMON ROLL	Snohomish	NW	1974	\$589,000.00	\$808,275.00	\$409.46	37%	3.00	Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC
93254	* EARL GRAY	Thurston	SP	10185	\$3,682,000.00	\$4,793,052.44	\$470.60	30%	3.00	Murphy Company

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
April 2017	10	10	0	0	58,246	58,246	0	0	100%	\$17,484,249.54	\$21,864,690.66	\$375.39	25%	2.76
YTD FY 2017	103	102	0	1	414,153	413,560	0	593	100%	\$109,938,538.00	\$143,995,711.79	\$348.19	31%	2.76

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
April 2017	10	10	0	0	58,246	58,246	0	0	100%	\$17,484,249.54	\$21,864,690.66	\$375.39	25%	2.76
YTD FY 2017	103	102	0	1	414,153	413,560	0	593	100%	\$109,938,538.00	\$143,995,711.79	\$348.19	31%	2.76

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

April 2017

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	Delivered Values			Stumpage Determination (Projected)				APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
			VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	# OF BIDS	
94797		SHAGGY SORT 1	670	\$550.00	\$620.87	\$225,386.43	\$272,869.33	\$407.27	5	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94798		SHAGGY SORT 2	1,081	\$575.00	\$675.00	\$373,018.14	\$481,118.14	\$445.07	4	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
94799		SHAGGY SORT 3	383	\$525.00	\$607.00	\$114,209.70	\$145,615.70	\$380.20	3	Buse Timber & Sales, Inc.
94800		SHAGGY SORT 4	1,217	\$650.00	\$728.08	\$480,079.32	\$575,102.68	\$472.56	4	Columbia Vista Corporation
94801		SHAGGY SORT 5	825	\$425.00	\$559.30	\$157,919.57	\$268,717.07	\$325.72	4	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94802		SHAGGY SORT 6	218	\$450.00	\$558.95	\$49,906.23	\$73,657.33	\$337.88	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94803		SHAGGY SORT 7	307	\$460.00	\$558.95	\$74,173.55	\$104,551.20	\$340.56	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94804		SHAGGY SORT 8	108	\$1,200.00	\$1,480.00	\$102,245.51	\$132,485.51	\$1,226.72	1	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
94805		SHAGGY SORT 9	484	\$625.00	\$776.00	\$188,202.27	\$261,286.27	\$539.85	2	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
94806		SHAGGY SORT 10	106	\$725.00	\$875.00	\$53,273.23	\$69,173.23	\$652.58	2	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
94807		SHAGGY SORT 11	28	\$425.00	\$512.00	\$5,431.93	\$7,867.93	\$281.00	2	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
94808		SHAGGY SORT 12	85	\$200.00	\$201.01	(\$1,268.40)	(\$1,182.55)	(\$13.91)	2	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
94809		SHAGGY SORT 13	30	\$364.00	\$455.00	\$818.63	\$3,548.63	\$118.29	2	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
94810		SHAGGY SORT 14	39	\$364.00	\$442.00	\$1,064.22	\$4,106.22	\$105.29	2	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
94811		SHAGGY SORT 15	58	\$364.00	\$520.00	\$3,565.70	\$12,613.70	\$217.48	4	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
94812		SHAGGY SORT 16	56	\$260.00	\$429.00	(\$4,041.09)	\$5,422.91	\$96.84	5	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
94885		WRIGHT FIT SORT 01	1,247	\$410.00	\$519.55	\$69,651.17	\$206,260.02	\$165.40	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94886		WRIGHT FIT SORT 02	508	\$402.00	\$535.02	(\$8,405.91)	\$59,168.25	\$116.47	3	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94887		WRIGHT FIT SORT 03	185	\$320.00	\$494.91	(\$18,912.16)	\$13,446.56	\$72.68	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94888		WRIGHT FIT SORT 04	48	\$375.00	\$479.02	(\$6,727.21)	(\$1,734.01)	(\$36.13)	3	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94889		WRIGHT FIT SORT 05	42	\$330.00	\$410.58	(\$2,366.53)	\$1,017.62	\$24.23	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94890		WRIGHT FIT SORT 06	18	\$198.00	\$207.45	(\$3,572.52)	(\$3,402.42)	(\$189.02)	4	Double A Logging
94928		CORDUROY FIT SORT 01	1,953	\$410.00	\$482.00	\$239,168.55	\$379,784.55	\$194.46	2	Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
94929		CORDUROY FIT SORT 02	1,389	\$402.00	\$478.50	\$89,551.64	\$195,810.14	\$140.97	3	Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
94930		CORDUROY FIT SORT 03	595	\$349.74	\$353.88	\$66,575.08	\$69,038.12	\$116.03	2	Oroville Reman & Reload
94931		CORDUROY FIT SORT 04	186	\$353.34	\$355.63	\$15,169.29	\$15,595.90	\$83.85	3	Oroville Reman & Reload
94932		CORDUROY FIT SORT 05	509	\$319.94	\$345.64	(\$27,783.42)	(\$14,701.42)	(\$28.88)	2	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
94933		CORDUROY FIT SORT 06	186	\$150.00	\$300.39	(\$17,477.98)	\$10,494.56	\$56.42	2	C & C Timber, Inc.
94934		CORDUROY FIT SORT 07	246	\$198.00	\$198.00	(\$24,319.14)	(\$24,319.14)	(\$98.86)	2	JKCK Resources, Inc.
95022		CORDUROY FIT SORT 08	93	\$240.00	\$456.00	(\$368.99)	\$19,719.01	\$212.03	2	Edgewood Log Homes
95053		BUCK SNORT SORT 1	807	\$550.00	\$625.00	\$222,741.69	\$283,266.69	\$351.01	3	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
95054		BUCK SNORT SORT 2	658	\$575.00	\$675.00	\$203,757.60	\$269,557.60	\$409.66	4	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
95055		BUCK SNORT SORT 3	317	\$525.00	\$555.00	\$81,558.40	\$91,068.40	\$287.28	3	C&D Lumber
95056		BUCK SNORT SORT 4	371	\$650.00	\$697.07	\$139,162.85	\$156,625.82	\$422.17	5	Columbia Vista Corporation
95057		BUCK SNORT SORT 5	1,003	\$680.00	\$700.00	\$419,155.72	\$439,215.72	\$437.90	4	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
95058		BUCK SNORT SORT 6	295	\$650.00	\$790.00	\$88,512.39	\$129,812.39	\$440.04	3	Canyon Lumber Company, Inc.
95059		BUCK SNORT SORT 7	15	\$1,000.00	\$1,490.00	\$10,857.78	\$18,207.78	\$1,213.85	1	RSG Forest Products, Inc.
95060		BUCK SNORT SORT 8	142	\$525.00	\$680.77	\$27,918.91	\$50,038.25	\$352.38	2	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
95061		BUCK SNORT SORT 9	60	\$364.00	\$364.00	\$600.12	\$600.12	\$10.00	1	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
95062		BUCK SNORT SORT 10	69	\$325.00	\$325.00	(\$2,000.86)	(\$2,000.86)	(\$29.00)	1	Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS**

April 2017

NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	TREATMENT ACRES	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)	
					TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	TOTAL REVENUE	NET \$ / MBF
CORDUROY FIT SORTS	Okanogan	NE	580	5,157	\$1,894,705.00	\$2,205,611.69	\$651,421.72	\$126.32
WRIGHT FIT SORTS	Okanogan	NE	737	2,048	\$810,110.00	\$1,055,199.18	\$274,756.02	\$134.16

	PROJECTS OFFERED	PROJECTS AWARDED	NOT AWARDED	TREATMENT ACRES	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME AWARDED
April 2017	2	2	0	1,317	7,205	7,205
YTD FY 2017	4	4	0	2,666	14,845	14,805