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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 March 2015 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 90288 INDIAN CREEK  Clallam Ol 1312 $223,237.78 $233,347.78 $177.86 5% 1.75 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 91662 WEST  Clark PC 7674 $2,605,000.00 $3,097,065.57 $403.58 19% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 KLOOCHMAN 
 91540 TRI TIP Cowlitz PC 5691 $1,644,000.00 $2,171,131.94 $381.50 32% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 91064 NORTH INCLINE Cowlitz, PC 9433 $3,432,000.00 $3,462,589.60 $367.07 1% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
   Wahkiakum 
 91440 SHELTON CREEK  Grays Harbor SP 5501 $2,036,000.00 $2,362,694.00 $429.50 16% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 VRH & VDT 
 91894 NATIVE DANCER Lewis PC 5050 $2,087,000.00 $2,682,700.76 $531.23 29% 1.00 Murphy Company 
 91855 TWEENER Skagit NW 1571 $548,000.00 $659,854.18 $420.02 20% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 91536 SOUTH ROCK VRH  Skamania PC 4037 $919,000.00 NO BIDS 
 VDT 
 91793 CRAWFORD 15 Thurston SP 7955 $3,200,000.00 $3,266,920.17 $410.68 2% 2.00 Murphy Company 
 91809 MIMA CREEK VRH  Thurston SP 5673 $2,314,000.00 $2,749,496.00 $484.66 19% 2.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 
 & VDT 
 90436 WEST  Whatcom NW 3593 $693,000.00 $759,001.24 $211.24 10% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 CLEARWATER VRH 
  and VDT 
 91811 BLUEBELL Whatcom NW 2593 $1,041,000.00 $1,126,288.00 $434.36 8% 4.00 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

March 2015 12 11 0 1 60,083 56,046 0 4,037 93% $19,823,237.78 $22,571,089.24 $402.72 14% 2.07 
YTD FY 2015 75 72 0 3 313,097 295,985 0 17,112 95% $86,603,693.35 $114,686,552.37 $387.47 32% 2.76 
   
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

None Offered 

YTD FY 2015 11 9 0 2 15,835 12,621 0 3,214 80% $1,542,000.00 $1,886,161.23 $149.45 22% 2.11 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

March 2015 12 11 0 1 60,083 56,046 0 4,037 93% $19,823,237.78 $22,571,089.24 $402.72 14% 2.07 
YTD FY 2015 86 81 0 5 328,932 308,606 0 20,326 95% $88,145,693.35 $116,572,713.60 $377.74 32% 2.69 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 March 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 91123 INDIAN CREEK SORT 14 120 $950.00 $990.00 $50,451.88 $55,251.88 $460.43 1 Bell Timber, Inc. 
 91127 INDIAN CREEK SORT 18 833 $490.00 $495.00 $139,712.69 $143,877.69 $172.72 3 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 91128 INDIAN CREEK SORT 19 130 $490.00 $490.00 $8,404.80 $8,404.80 $64.65 1 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 91131 INDIAN CREEK SORT 22 229 $430.00 $435.00 $24,668.41 $25,813.41 $112.72 2 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92365 SNAG SALVAGE FIT SORT 9 556 $500.00 $550.00 $83,067.58 $110,867.58 $199.40 3 Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc. 
 92366 SNAG SALVAGE FIT SORT 10 520 $500.00 $550.00 $101,151.76 $127,151.76 $244.52 4 Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc. 
 


