

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

February 2015

AGREEMENT FSC	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
90288	INDIAN CREEK SORTS	Clallam	OI	4358	\$1,308,478.18					Project Pending - See Sort Sales Results
91489	THURSTON CREEK VRH & VDT	Grays Harbor	SP	4334	\$1,565,000.00	\$2,048,394.20	\$472.63	31%	3.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
91492	OLD IRONSIDES VRH & VDT	Grays Harbor	SP	6461	\$2,161,000.00	\$2,761,326.80	\$427.38	28%	4.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
90936	BIRDSTONE	Lewis	PC	3557	\$982,000.00	\$1,100,799.46	\$309.47	12%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
90731	* RUNNING ELF	Mason	SP	2612	\$944,000.00	\$1,277,810.95	\$489.21	35%	7.00	Murphy Company
91387	FIVE POINT	Pacific	PC	8085	\$2,575,000.00					NO BIDS
91688	EUROPA	Skagit	NW	3655	\$1,363,000.00	\$1,803,343.28	\$493.39	32%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
91388	BUNNY HILL VRH VDT	Skamania	PC	4386	\$1,189,000.00	\$1,352,934.69	\$308.47	14%	5.00	McFarland Cascade Holdings, Inc.
91170	BEAR CLAW	Snohomish	NW	4221	\$1,183,000.00	\$1,697,238.00	\$402.09	43%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
91392	HOT SHOT	Snohomish	NW	3161	\$1,113,000.00	\$1,327,722.00	\$420.03	19%	1.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
91617	PRATHER	Thurston	SP	3962	\$1,524,000.00	\$1,708,873.50	\$431.32	12%	3.00	Murphy Company
91635	LOWER DOAKS	Whatcom	NW	1866	\$577,000.00	\$758,497.66	\$406.48	31%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
February 2015	12	10	1	1	50,658	38,215	4,569	7,874	75%	\$12,601,000.00	\$15,836,940.54	\$414.42	26%	3.10
YTD FY 2015	64	61	2	1	254,326	236,185	9,138	9,003	93%	\$66,189,662.39	\$91,440,703.15	\$387.16	38%	2.90

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT FSC	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
90940	N-1100 VDT	Jefferson	OI	3167	\$84,000.00					NO BIDS

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
February 2015	1	0	0	1	3,167	0	0	3,167	0%	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	0%	
YTD FY 2015	10	9	0	1	15,788	12,621	0	3,167	80%	\$1,542,000.00	\$1,886,161.23	\$149.45	22%	2.11

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
February 2015	13	10	1	2	53,825	38,215	4,569	11,041	71%	\$12,601,000.00	\$15,836,940.54	\$414.42	26%	3.10
YTD FY 2015	74	70	2	2	270,114	248,806	9,138	12,170	93%	\$67,731,662.39	\$93,326,864.38	\$375.10	38%	2.80

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

February 2015

Delivered Values

Stumpage Determination (Projected)

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
91123		INDIAN CREEK SORT 14	120	\$950.00		\$114,000.00			0	NO BIDS
91124		INDIAN CREEK SORT 15	111	\$600.00	\$720.00	\$11,731.85	\$25,051.85	\$225.69	1	Olympic Panel Products, LLC
91125		INDIAN CREEK SORT 16	447	\$625.01	\$720.00	\$60,346.57	\$102,806.57	\$229.99	2	Olympic Panel Products, LLC
91126		INDIAN CREEK SORT 17	1,210	\$550.00	\$550.00	\$274,527.61	\$274,527.61	\$226.88	1	Interfor U.S., Inc.
91127		INDIAN CREEK SORT 18	833	\$550.00		\$458,150.00			0	NO BIDS
91128		INDIAN CREEK SORT 19	130	\$590.00		\$76,700.00			0	NO BIDS
91129		INDIAN CREEK SORT 20	145	\$950.00	\$955.00	\$70,612.44	\$71,337.44	\$491.98	1	Marys River Lumber Co.
91130		INDIAN CREEK SORT 21	349	\$490.00	\$490.00	\$59,236.58	\$59,236.58	\$169.73	1	Interfor U.S., Inc.
91131		INDIAN CREEK SORT 22	229	\$490.00		\$112,210.00			0	NO BIDS
91132		INDIAN CREEK SORT 23	186	\$450.00	\$450.00	\$23,546.17	\$23,546.17	\$126.59	2	Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC
91133		INDIAN CREEK SORT 24	72	\$725.00	\$725.00	\$16,368.65	\$16,368.65	\$227.34	1	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
91134		INDIAN CREEK SORT 25	151	\$233.97	\$361.80	\$8,881.19	\$28,182.99	\$186.64	3	Evergreen Fibre
91135		INDIAN CREEK SORT 26	375	\$234.00	\$234.00	\$22,167.12	\$22,167.12	\$59.11	2	Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC