

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
TIMBER AUCTION RESULTS - FEBRUARY 2024**

**BOARD SALE RESULTS**

| AGREEMENT | FSC® | NAME OF SALE        | COUNTY         | REGION | VOLUME OFFERED MBF | MINIMUM BID    | BID PRICE      | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | # OF BIDS | APPARENT HIGH BIDDER                 |
|-----------|------|---------------------|----------------|--------|--------------------|----------------|----------------|------------|--------|-----------|--------------------------------------|
| 104795    |      | OH BRIAN            | Clallam        | OLY    | 3028               | \$664,000.00   | \$973,793.00   | \$321.60   | 47%    | 1.00      | Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.           |
| 104805    |      | CHARLIE CREEK       | Clallam        | OLY    | 4623               | \$704,000.00   | \$706,403.00   | \$152.80   | 0%     | 1.00      | Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.           |
| 104119    |      | PUNCH BOWL VRH THIN | Clark          | PC     | 2743               | \$605,000.00   | \$789,839.76   | \$287.95   | 31%    | 4.00      | High Cascade, Inc.                   |
| 104816    |      | RED ROCKET          | Jefferson      | OLY    | 4802               | \$1,019,000.00 | \$1,791,678.00 | \$373.11   | 76%    | 3.00      | Sierra Pacific Industries            |
| 105190    |      | DEEP DIVE           | Pacific, Lewis | PC     | 6715               | \$2,599,000.00 | \$3,434,429.00 | \$511.46   | 32%    | 8.00      | Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. |
| 105172    |      | BACKYARD            | Snohomish      | NW     | 1192               | \$665,000.00   | \$793,893.00   | \$666.02   | 19%    | 5.00      | Nielsen Brothers, Inc.               |
| 104586    |      | POLLO LOCHO SORTS   | Wahkiakum      | PC     | 5954               | \$2,001,771.63 | \$2,342,114.53 | \$393.37   | 17%    | 2.50      | See Sort Sales Results               |
| 104520    |      | RED TRUCK VRH VDT   | Whatcom        | NW     | 2927               | \$668,000.00   | \$839,185.10   | \$286.70   | 26%    | 4.00      | Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.             |

**SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES**

|                      | SALES OFFERED | SALES SOLD | SALES PENDING | SALES NO BID | VOLUME OFFERED | VOLUME SOLD | VOLUME PENDING | VOLUME NO BID | % VOL SOLD | TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES | BID PRICE SOLD SALES | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | AVG # BIDS |
|----------------------|---------------|------------|---------------|--------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|---------------|------------|--------------------------|----------------------|------------|--------|------------|
| <b>February 2024</b> | 8             | 8          | 0             | 0            | 31,984         | 31,984      | 0              | 0             | 100%       | \$8,925,771.63           | \$11,671,335.39      | \$364.91   | 31%    | 3.56       |
| <b>YTD FY 2024</b>   | 61            | 61         | 0             | 0            | 249,103        | 248,674     | 0              | 429           | 101%       | \$63,981,670.46          | \$91,831,341.57      | \$369.28   | 44%    | 3.19       |

**SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES**

|                      | SALES OFFERED | SALES SOLD | SALES PENDING | SALES NO BID | VOLUME OFFERED | VOLUME SOLD | VOLUME PENDING | VOLUME NO BID | % VOL SOLD | TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES | BID PRICE SOLD SALES | PRICE /MBF | % OVER | AVG # BIDS |
|----------------------|---------------|------------|---------------|--------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|---------------|------------|--------------------------|----------------------|------------|--------|------------|
| <b>February 2024</b> | 8             | 8          | 0             | 0            | 31,984         | 31,984      | 0              | 0             | 100%       | \$8,925,771.63           | \$11,671,335.39      | \$364.91   | 31%    | 3.56       |
| <b>YTD FY 2024</b>   | 72            | 70         | 0             | 2            | 272,371        | 266,934     | 0              | 5,437         | 99%        | \$65,256,670.46          | \$94,117,096.00      | \$352.59   | 44%    | 3.10       |

**SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

| AGREE-<br>MENT | FSC | NAME OF SALE                           | VOLUME<br>OFFERED<br>MBF | Delivered Values     |                    | Stumpage Determination (Projected) |                    |               | # OF<br>BIDS | APPARENT<br>HIGH BIDDER        |
|----------------|-----|--|--------------------------|----------------------|--------------------|------------------------------------|--------------------|---------------|--------------|--------------------------------|
|                |     |  |                          | MINIMUM<br>BID / MBF | BID<br>PRICE / MBF | TOTAL<br>MINIMUM<br>BID            | TOTAL BID<br>PRICE | PRICE<br>/MBF |              |                                |
| 104766         |     | POLLO LOCHO SORT 1<br>DF 5"-11"        | 1,421                    | \$700.00             | \$717.50           | \$687,277.19                       | \$712,144.69       | \$501.16      | 3            | RSG Forest Products, Inc.      |
| 104767         |     | POLLO LOCHO SORT 2<br>DF 12"+          | 1,154                    | \$750.00             | \$750.00           | \$627,334.50                       | \$627,334.50       | \$543.62      | 3            | RSG Forest Products, Inc.      |
| 104768         |     | POLLO LOCHO SORT 3<br>DF HQ 12"+       | 227                      | \$825.00             | \$825.00           | \$132,208.75                       | \$132,208.75       | \$582.42      | 3            | Western Forest Products US LLC |
| 104769         |     | POLLO LOCHO SORT 4<br>RA 5"+           | 32                       | \$525.00             | \$525.00           | \$10,047.28                        | \$10,047.28        | \$313.98      | 1            | Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.      |
| 104770         |     | POLLO LOCHO SORT 5<br>WW 5"-11"        | 878                      | \$500.00             | \$612.75           | \$122,996.75                       | \$221,991.25       | \$252.84      | 4            | Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.       |
| 104771         |     | POLLO LOCHO SORT 6<br>WW 12"-19"       | 1,729                    | \$525.00             | \$649.78           | \$339,501.98                       | \$555,246.60       | \$321.14      | 3            | Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.       |
| 104772         |     | POLLO LOCHO SORT 7<br>WW 20"+          | 466                      | \$480.00             | \$481.58           | \$82,187.22                        | \$82,923.50        | \$177.95      | 2            | Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.       |
| 104773         |     | POLLO LOCHO SORT 8<br>Conifer Pulp 2"+ | 47                       | \$325.00             | \$325.00           | \$217.96                           | \$217.96           | \$4.64        | 1            | Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.   |