
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 September 2016 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92037 * MUFFET Kitsap SP 4565 $1,277,000.00 $1,850,664.99 $405.40 45% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 93073 SAWTOOTH Pacific PC 2552 $414,000.00 $758,287.00 $297.13 83% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 91740 GONE DRY Stevens NE 1416 $155,000.00 $163,637.53 $115.56 6% 1.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92349 SACKIT SUMMIT Stevens NE 4592 $894,000.00 $1,108,500.00 $241.40 24% 3.00 Potlatch Land & Lumber, LLC 
 92255 COUGAR CREEK Whatcom NW 3617 $391,000.00 $403,086.00 $111.44 3% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93007 49TH PARALLEL  Whatcom NW 1984 $369,000.00 $466,119.14 $234.94 26% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 VRH & VDT 
 94392 VALLEY REVIEW Whatcom NW 132 $35,000.00 $40,745.77 $308.68 16% 3.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2016 7 7 0 0 18,858 18,858 0 0 100% $3,535,000.00 $4,791,040.43 $254.06 36% 2.43 
YTD FY 2017 18 18 0 0 62,032 62,032 0 0 100% $14,069,187.25 $19,032,270.80 $306.81 35% 2.60   

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2016 7 7 0 0 18,858 18,858 0 0 100% $3,535,000.00 $4,791,040.43 $254.06 36% 2.43 
YTD FY 2017 18 18 0 0 62,032 62,032 0 0 100% $14,069,187.25 $19,032,270.80 $306.81 35% 2.60 


