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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 July 2022 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 99076 SAUERKRAUT Grays Harbor SP 8886 $4,020,000.00 $4,585,188.00 $516.00 14% 3.00 Chehalis Valley Timber, Inc. 
 100663 BEAVER VALLEY Jefferson OLY 4133 $1,933,000.00 $2,177,825.27 $526.94 13% 3.00 Western Forest Products US LLC 
 102023 T3 BACKWATER Jefferson OLY 5465 $1,242,000.00 $1,455,158.77 $266.27 17% 1.00 Harbor Timber 
 102256 T3 H-1500 Jefferson OLY 4695 $714,000.00 NO BIDS 
 103129 Q GROUSE POWER Pend Oreille NE 5899 $1,912,000.00 $1,993,794.60 $337.99 4% 1.00 IFG Timber, LLC 
 101417 MARBLE RYE Skagit NW 3841 $1,109,000.00 $1,725,152.00 $449.14 56% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 101206 GRANTS CREEK Skagit, Snohomish NW 4817 $2,054,000.00 $2,423,531.00 $503.12 18% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 101870 RED GOLD VRH VDT Snohomish, Skagit NW 1486 $609,000.00 $912,552.60 $614.10 50% 3.00 Bell Timber, Inc. 
 102974 Q REIDEL CREEK Stevens NE 3770 $890,000.00 $1,294,500.00 $343.37 45% 3.00 PotlatchDeltic Land & Lumber, LLC 
  
 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2022 9 8 0 1 42,992 38,297 0 4,695 89% $13,769,000.00 $16,567,702.24 $432.61 20% 2.13 
YTD FY 2023 9 8 0 1 42,992 38,297 0 4,695 89% $13,769,000.00 $16,567,702.24 $432.61 20% 2.13  
  

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 
 103422 Q NILE FIRE  Yakima SE 1879 $64,000.00 NO BIDS 
 SALVAGE 
 
 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2022 1 0 0 1 1,879 0 0 1,879 0% $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 
YTD FY 2023 1 0 0 1 1,879 0 0 1,879 0% $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 
 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2022 10 8 0 2 44,871 38,297 0 6,574 85% $13,769,000.00 $16,567,702.24 $432.61 20% 2.13 
YTD FY 2023 10 8 0 2 44,871 38,297 0 6,574 85% $13,769,000.00 $16,567,702.24 $432.61 20% 2.13 


