
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 July 2016 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 93144 STEARNSVILLE Grays Harbor Ol 3718 $432,000.00 $862,687.89 $232.03 100% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93499  GREENWOOD FINAL Grays Harbor Ol 760 $219,000.00 $302,203.32 $397.64 38% 2.00 Double Mountain Development, LLC
 91808 * BALER Lewis SP 2863 $638,000.00 $736,251.00 $257.16 15% 3.00 A & W Timber Brokers, Inc. 
 92530 WALNUT VDT and  Skagit NW 82 $19,588.23 $22,536.23 $274.83 15% 1.50 See Sort Sales Results 
 VRH Sorts 
 92255 COUGAR CREEK Whatcom NW 3617 $495,000.00 NO BIDS 
 93007 49TH PARALLEL  Whatcom NW 1984 $437,000.00 NO BIDS 
 VRH & VDT 
 93091 EL DORADO VRH  Whatcom NW 1957 $509,000.00 $564,499.34 $288.45 11% 2.00 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 & VDT 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2016 7 5 0 2 14,981 9,380 0 5,601 63% $1,817,588.23 $2,488,177.78 $265.26 37% 2.30 
YTD FY 2017 7 5 0 2 14,981 9,380 0 5,601 63% $1,817,588.23 $2,488,177.78 $265.26 37% 2.30  
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2016 7 5 0 2 14,981 9,380 0 5,601 63% $1,817,588.23 $2,488,177.78 $265.26 37% 2.30 
YTD FY 2017 7 5 0 2 14,981 9,380 0 5,601 63% $1,817,588.23 $2,488,177.78 $265.26 37% 2.30 
  

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 93663 Walnut Sort 08 18 $207.00 $225.00 ($111.04) $212.96 $11.83 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 94310 Walnut Sort 09 64 $560.00 $601.00 $19,699.27 $22,323.27 $348.80 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 


