
 Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 January 2023 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 103761 BIG MACK Clallam OLY 3003 $714,000.00 $1,060,659.00 $353.20 49% 3.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 103763 BURNT ENDS Clallam OLY 4428 $1,414,000.00 $2,851,944.64 $644.07 102% 4.00 Stella-Jones Corporation 
 103093 * TREE TIP King SP 4525 $1,601,000.00 $1,760,802.00 $389.13 10% 4.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 
 102176 * PUPPERS Lewis SP 3818 $1,397,000.00 $1,530,592.83 $400.89 10% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 103914 MCCANNON Lewis, Pacific PC 6415 $2,214,000.00 $2,807,175.34 $437.60 27% 6.00 Murphy Company 
 102769 GREAT DIVIDE Pacific PC 5006 $1,155,000.00 NO BIDS 
 103079 EASTSIDE Skagit NW 1549 $320,000.00 $488,134.00 $315.13 53% 3.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 
 103408 SILVER TRAIL Stevens NE 4085 $843,000.00 $1,088,926.89 $266.57 29% 1.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 103694 IRONTOOTH Wahkiakum PC 3998 $724,000.00 $1,644,331.99 $411.29 127% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2023 9 8 0 1 36,827 31,821 0 5,006 86% $9,227,000.00 $13,232,566.69 $415.84 43% 3.25 
YTD FY 2023 57 55 0 2 239,717 230,016 0 9,701 96% $69,838,078.34 $97,456,070.62 $423.69 40% 2.98 
  
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

YTD FY 2023 11 9 0 2 12,541 12,315 0 226 98% $1,096,890.00 $2,397,229.48 $194.66 119% 2.44 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2023 9 8 0 1 36,827 31,821 0 5,006 86% $9,227,000.00 $13,232,566.69 $415.84 43% 3.25 
YTD FY 2023 68 64 0 4 252,258 242,331 0 9,927 96% $70,934,968.34 $99,853,300.10 $412.05 41% 2.90 


