
 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 April 2015 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 88341 CLALLAM  Clallam Ol 4998 $627,000.00 $701,603.00 $140.38 12% 1.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 SCATTERED 
 90743 RIB ROAST VRH Cowlitz PC 2877 $328,000.00 $753,816.12 $262.01 130% 3.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 91999 URBAN FICTIONARY Cowlitz PC 6888 $1,659,000.00 NO BIDS 

 88352 SHALE EYE Jefferson Ol 2754 $473,000.00 $515,770.00 $187.28 9% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 90732 * GREEN LAKE Kitsap SP 1758 $552,000.00 $808,566.00 $459.94 46% 2.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 

 91387 FIVE POINT Pacific PC 8085 $1,511,000.00 $1,521,333.00 $188.17 1% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 91536 SOUTH ROCK VRH  Skamania PC 4037 $849,000.00 NO BIDS 
 VDT 
 89646 MOONBEAM VDT  Snohomish NW 2707 $366,000.00 $442,957.40 $163.63 21% 2.00 Pulley Corporation 
 & VRH 
 89859 COOPERATION Snohomish NW 4956 $1,297,000.00 $1,897,568.80 $382.88 46% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 90886 SONI Snohomish NW 1200 $300,000.00 $369,392.00 $307.83 23% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 89414 XENA Thurston SP 6389 $1,836,000.00 $2,354,157.00 $368.47 28% 3.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92099 MILLSTONE SORTS Wahkiakum PC 3446 $846,080.09 $1,106,399.62 $321.07 31% 1.89 See Sort Sales Results 

 91634 SCHOOL BELL Whatcom NW 2500 $687,000.00 $894,970.00 $357.99 30% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

April 2015 13 11 0 2 52,595 41,670 0 10,925 79% $8,823,080.09 $11,366,532.94 $272.77 29% 2.08 
YTD FY 2015 86 83 0 3 353,570 337,655 0 15,915 96% $95,426,773.44 $126,053,085.31 $373.32 32% 2.68  

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 91998 GOUDA THIN Clark PC 936 $60,000.00 $181,104.48 $193.49 202% 3.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 91887 NOLAN ESTATES  Jefferson Ol 1674 $205,000.00 NO BIDS 
 VDT 
 91913 MAYFIELD  Lewis PC 2021 $203,000.00 $442,603.22 $219.00 118% 5.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 THINNING 
 91892 ABIDE Snohomish NW 3219 $248,000.00 $617,583.08 $191.86 149% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 

  

 

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501). 



 
 

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 

April 2015 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

April 2015 4 3 0 1 7,850 6,176 0 1,674 79% $511,000.00 $1,241,290.78 $200.99 143% 3.67 
YTD FY 2015 15 12 0 3 23,685 18,797 0 4,888 79% $2,053,000.00 $3,127,452.01 $166.38 52% 2.50  

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

April 2015 17 14 0 3 60,445 47,846 0 12,599 79% $9,334,080.09 $12,607,823.72 $263.51 35% 2.42 
YTD FY 2015 101 95 0 6 377,255 356,452 0 20,803 95% $97,479,773.44 $129,180,537.32 $362.41 33% 2.66 

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501). 



 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 April 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC® NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92100 MILLSTONE SORT 1 61 $455.00 $458.43 $18,146.89 $18,356.12 $300.92 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92101 MILLSTONE SORT 2 117 $510.00 $600.00 $42,297.84 $52,827.84 $451.52 2 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 92102 MILLSTONE SORT 3 81 $490.00 $490.00 $28,162.89 $28,162.89 $347.69 2 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 92103 MILLSTONE SORT 4 171 $375.58 $443.43 $14,604.83 $26,206.93 $153.26 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92104 MILLSTONE SORT 5 537 $449.16 $560.58 $157,519.29 $217,350.75 $404.75 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92105 MILLSTONE SORT 6 1,858 $450.10 $536.24 $433,447.02 $593,500.94 $319.43 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92106 MILLSTONE SORT 7 582 $425.22 $440.01 $132,346.76 $140,954.58 $242.19 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92107 MILLSTONE SORT 8 22 $950.00 $1,300.00 $17,425.32 $25,125.32 $1,142.06 4 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 92131 GOLDEN HALO FH FIT SORT #01 2,414 $350.00 $485.75 ($113,800.24) $213,900.26 $88.61 3 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92132 GOLDEN HALO FH FIT SORT #02 428 $360.00 $480.90 ($40,399.93) $11,345.27 $26.51 3 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92133 GOLDEN HALO FH FIT SORT #03 80 $288.00 $288.00 ($16,018.93) ($16,018.93) ($200.24) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92134 GOLDEN HALO FH FIT SORT #04 37 $261.49 $261.49 ($7,104.41) ($7,104.41) ($192.01) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92135 GOLDEN HALO FH FIT SORT #05 22 $216.00 $216.00 ($4,213.75) ($4,213.75) ($191.53) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92302 MILLSTONE SORT 9 17 $375.00 $480.00 $2,129.25 $3,914.25 $230.25 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501). 



 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS 
 April 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    TREATMENT  VOLUME TOTAL     
 NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION ACRES OFFERED MINIMUM  TOTAL BID PRICETOTAL REVENUE NET $ / MBF 
  MBF BID 

 GOLDEN HALO FH FIT Ferry, Okanogan NE 544 2,981 $1,036,447.00 $1,415,892.70 $197,908.44 $66.39 
 PROJECTS  PROJECTS  NOT  TREATMENT  VOLUME  VOLUME  
 OFFERED AWARDED AWARDED ACRES OFFERED AWARDED 

April 2015 1 1 0 544 2,981 2,981 
YTD FY 2015 5 5 0 3,997 23,487 23,487 

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501). 


