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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
BOARD SALE RESULTS 

October 2017

VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 

 MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

95565 BEAR LINE SORTS Clallam OLY 1575 $436,893.10 $535,042.99 $339.71 22% 1.92 See Sort Sales Results
95429 LUCKY Clark PC 5394 $1,741,000.00 $2,835,965.96 $525.76 63% 5.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
94405 ONE HORN Grays Harbor SP 10374 $4,066,000.00 $5,029,671.59 $484.83 24% 3.00 Murphy Company
93649 CHIMIBOB Jefferson OLY 5825 $2,198,000.00 $3,385,849.24 $581.26 54% 2.00 Murphy Company
94688 ISKRA VDT VRH Jefferson OLY 5445 $1,167,000.00 $1,854,023.48 $340.50 59% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
95107 SHALEDOWN Jefferson OLY 559 $94,000.00 $158,252.00 $283.10 68% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
95095 DERBY Lewis PC 1511 $723,000.00 $1,014,790.00 $671.60 40% 6.00 WT Timber, LLC
95456 SUGARFOOT Lewis PC 9881 $3,985,000.00 $5,581,095.00 $564.83 40% 5.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
93061 * COUGAR Mason SP 2261 $662,000.00 $1,107,950.40 $490.03 67% 2.00 Murphy Company
94686 HEADRIG Pacific PC 3451 $901,000.00 $1,547,777.00 $448.50 72% 3.00 Harbor Timber
95282 WILEY HANGOUT Skagit NW 4958 $1,115,000.00 $1,908,032.42 $384.84 71% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries

VDT RMZ 
94677 * KOMBUCHA Thurston SP 6727 $2,805,000.00 $3,789,958.92 $563.40 35% 4.00 Murphy Company
94608 BACON ISLAND Yakima SE 3125 $780,000.00 $964,991.81 $308.80 24% 3.00 WyEast Timber Services, LLC.

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

October 2017 13 13 0 0 61,086 61,086 0 0 100% $20,673,893.10 $29,713,400.81 $486.42 44% 3.15
YTD FY 2018 25 25 0 0 96,611 96,611 0 0 100% $28,658,455.14 $42,294,375.15 $437.78 48% 2.85 

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

October 2017 13 13 0 0 61,086 61,086 0 0 100% $20,673,893.10 $29,713,400.81 $486.42 44% 3.15
YTD FY 2018 25 25 0 0 96,611 96,611 0 0 100% $28,658,455.14 $42,294,375.15 $437.78 48% 2.85
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 October 2017 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 95656 BEAR LINE SORT 1 86 $815.00 $885.00 $44,632.77 $50,652.77 $588.99 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 95657 BEAR LINE SORT 2 200 $780.00 $840.00 $93,861.14 $105,861.14 $529.31 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 95658 BEAR LINE SORT 3 316 $550.00 $650.00 $72,767.13 $104,367.13 $330.28 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 95659 BEAR LINE SORT 4 140 $520.00 $579.00 $30,119.00 $38,379.00 $274.14 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 95660 BEAR LINE SORT 5 309 $570.00 $600.00 $81,299.67 $90,569.67 $293.11 2 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 95661 BEAR LINE SORT 6 254 $620.00 $680.31 $81,365.27 $96,684.01 $380.65 3 Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC 
 95662 BEAR LINE SORT 7 74 $640.00 $690.00 $24,649.82 $28,349.82 $383.11 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 95663 BEAR LINE SORT 8 45 $495.80 $592.00 $10,796.57 $15,125.57 $336.12 2 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 95664 BEAR LINE SORT 9 2 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $1,611.63 $1,611.63 $805.82 1 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 95665 BEAR LINE SORT 10 23 $350.00 $351.51 $1,305.84 $1,340.57 $58.29 2 Evergreen Fibre 
 95666 BEAR LINE SORT 11 34 $225.00 $351.63 ($1,264.95) $3,040.47 $89.43 1 Evergreen Fibre 
 95667 BEAR LINE SORT 12 92 $216.00 $252.00 ($4,250.79) ($938.79) ($10.20) 3 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 


