
 Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 

 November 2020 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 98103 WILLEY RIDGE  Clallam OLY 8797 $1,669,000.00 NO BIDS 
 VRH VDT 

 100885 TOMAUDER Clallam OLY 1853 $578,000.00 NO BIDS 
 100846 DREAMER VRH Clark PC 3209 $1,454,000.00 $1,579,530.44 $492.22 9% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 97966 SALTY VRH RMZ Cowlitz PC 5259 $1,746,000.00 $2,055,861.00 $390.92 18% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 100233 STANDING  Grays Harbor PC 4635 $1,830,000.00 $1,957,427.28 $422.31 7% 2.00 Murphy Company 
 ELEVATION 

 99047 COAL DAY VRH &  King SP 3665 $1,010,000.00 $1,322,250.57 $360.78 31% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 RMZ THIN 

 99066 * CROW BAIT Lewis SP 4342 $1,728,000.00 NO BIDS 
 99314 GUNNAR Lewis PC 3721 $1,741,000.00 $2,017,235.00 $542.12 16% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100613 Q BUCK MTN Okanogan NE 5108 $783,000.00 $1,401,077.19 $274.29 79% 2.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 100612 Q MIDDLE CREEK Pend Oreille NE 4113 $999,000.00 $1,208,966.00 $293.94 21% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100161 MIDDLE MAY Snohomish NW 9577 $2,502,000.00 $3,148,048.56 $328.71 26% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 99053 SMUGGLER VRH &  Thurston SP 8371 $4,273,000.00 $4,274,415.70 $510.62 0% 1.00 Murphy Company 
 RMZ 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2020 12 9 0 3 62,650 47,658 0 14,992 76% $16,338,000.00 $18,964,811.74 $397.94 16% 1.67 
YTD FY 2021 47 43 0 4 222,996 199,115 0 23,881 89% $55,008,612.01 $81,736,670.99 $410.50 49% 2.52 
  
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

None Offered 

YTD FY 2021 4 3 0 1 5,976 5,730 0 246 96% $335,000.00 $816,673.55 $142.53 144% 2.67 

  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2020 12 9 0 3 62,650 47,658 0 14,992 76% $16,338,000.00 $18,964,811.74 $397.94 16% 1.67 
YTD FY 2021 51 46 0 5 228,972 204,845 0 24,127 90% $55,343,612.01 $82,553,344.54 $403.00 49% 2.53 
 

 


