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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 June 2023 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102018 ON THE LINE Clallam OLY 4944 $1,526,000.00 $2,103,204.23 $425.41 38% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 103559 LOST AND FOUND  Clallam OLY 6130 $1,561,014.47 $2,301,644.97 $371.59 47% 2.23 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 104272 BOJACK SORTS Cowlitz PC 3805 $1,143,371.83 $1,560,061.27 $410.00 36% 1.63 See Sort Sales Results 
 101652 CEDARVILLE SORTS Grays Harbor PC 621 ($87,732.10) ($60,972.10) ($98.18) -31% 1.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 102083 NUGGETS Grays Harbor,  SP 5163 $1,649,000.00 $2,480,341.13 $480.41 50% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 Thurston 
 102173 * HODAG King SP 10036 $751,000.00 $2,350,674.48 $234.22 213% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 102108 * PLUMB BOB Mason SP 3378 $1,264,000.00 $2,141,013.31 $633.81 69% 3.00 Stella-Jones Corporation 
 101630 Q HARVARD Okanogan NE 4694 $456,000.00 NO BIDS 
 103843 Q SOUTH ROBBINS Stevens NE 2549 $611,000.00 $758,095.27 $297.41 24% 2.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 103927 Q NARDOM SORTS Stevens NE 6893 $1,283,820.97 $1,965,792.01 $285.19 53% 1.89 See Sort Sales Results 
 104000 Q NORTH  Stevens NE 57 $2,481.83 $2,481.83 $43.54 0% 1.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 WILLIAMS SORTS 
 104032 Q COUSINS SORTS  Stevens NE 161 ($2,227.14) ($2,227.14) ($13.83) 0% 1.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 PART 2 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2023 12 11 0 1 48,495 43,801 0 4,694 90% $9,701,729.86 $15,600,109.26 $356.16 61% 2.16 
YTD FY 2023 98 97 0 1 445,669 440,902 0 4,767 100% $123,549,136.05 $179,142,878.89 $406.31 45% 2.91 
  
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102258 T3 KALALOCH EAST Jefferson OLY 4670 $40,000.00 $490,546.61 $105.04 1126% 3.00 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 102259 T3 KALALOCH  Jefferson OLY 2758 $42,000.00 $83,597.87 $30.31 99% 1.00 Harbor Timber 
 WEST 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2023 2 2 0 0 7,428 7,428 0 0 100% $82,000.00 $574,144.48 $77.29 600% 2.00 
YTD FY 2023 26 22 0 4 38,527 36,050 0 2,477 94% $2,748,890.00 $6,661,597.17 $184.79 142% 2.64  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2023 14 13 0 1 55,923 51,229 0 4,694 92% $9,783,729.86 $16,174,253.74 $315.72 65% 2.13 
YTD FY 2023 124 119 0 5 484,196 476,952 0 7,244 99% $126,298,026.05 $185,804,476.06 $389.57 47% 2.86 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 June 2023 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102486 CEDARVILLE SORT 5 165 $400.00 $400.00 ($13,973.59) ($13,973.59) ($84.69) 1 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 WW 5"+ 
 102489 CEDARVILLE SORT 8 446 $240.00 $300.00 ($72,572.43) ($45,812.43) ($102.72) 1 Port Angeles Hardwood 
 MA 8"+ 
 102496 CEDARVILLE SORT 15 10 $325.00 $325.00 ($1,186.08) ($1,186.08) ($118.61) 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 WH Pulp 2"+ 
 104074 Q COUSINS PART 2 SORT 07 161 $225.00 $225.00 ($2,227.14) ($2,227.14) ($13.83) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 all conifer species except WRC 2"+ dib 
 104366 BOJACK SORT 1 2,079 $600.00 $717.50 $586,102.99 $830,385.49 $399.42 3 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 DF 5"-11" 
 104367 BOJACK SORT 2 680 $650.00 $730.00 $232,339.56 $286,739.56 $421.68 1 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 DF 12"+ 
 104368 BOJACK SORT 3 336 $900.00 $1,075.00 $181,835.08 $240,635.08 $716.18 2 Bell Timber, Inc. 
 DF Poles 30'+ 
 104369 BOJACK SORT 4 374 $750.00 $895.00 $162,318.18 $216,548.18 $579.01 3 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 DF HQ 12"+ 
 104370 BOJACK SORT 5 181 $500.00 $500.00 ($21,941.58) ($21,941.58) ($121.22) 1 Port Angeles Hardwood 
 RA 5"+ 
 104371 BOJACK SORT 6 109 $500.00 $545.66 $3,837.43 $8,814.37 $80.87 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 WW 5"+ 
 104372 BOJACK SORT 7 38 $364.00 $364.00 ($925.08) ($925.08) ($24.34) 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 Conifer Pulp 2"+ 
 104373 BOJACK SORT 8 8 $364.00 $364.00 ($194.75) ($194.75) ($24.34) 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 Hardwood Pulp 2"+ 
 104422 Q NORTH WILLIAMS SORT 08 57 $225.00 $225.00 $2,481.83 $2,481.83 $43.54 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 All conifer species except WRC  2"+  
 104588 Q NARDOM SORT 01 1,398 $480.00 $559.98 $304,246.86 $416,058.90 $297.61 3 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 DF/WL 7-10" dib  
 104589 Q NARDOM SORT 02 1,473 $500.00 $570.00 $403,130.77 $506,240.77 $343.68 3 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 DF/WL 11"+ dib  
 104590 Q NARDOM SORT 03 874 $415.42 $626.53 ($22,490.78) $162,026.17 $185.38 3 PotlatchDeltic Land & Lumber, LLC 
 ES/GF/LP/WH & non-chuckable  
 104591 Q NARDOM SORT 04 592 $424.05 $424.05 $64,073.79 $64,073.79 $108.23 1 IFG Timber, LLC 
 ES/GF/LP/WH & non-chuckable  
 104592 Q NARDOM SORT 05 107 $390.24 $389.76 ($3,987.26) ($4,039.26) ($37.75) 1 IFG Timber, LLC 
 PP 6-10" dib 
 104593 Q NARDOM SORT 06 59 $413.14 $411.86 $5,168.52 $5,093.52 $86.33 1 IFG Timber, LLC 
 PP 11"+ dib 
 104594 Q NARDOM SORT 07 807 $704.04 $1,046.16 $400,695.39 $676,785.64 $838.64 3 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 WRC 5"+ dib 
 104595 Q NARDOM SORT 08 1,283 $332.79 $337.91 $95,669.65 $102,238.45 $79.69 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 DF/WL/ES/GF/LP/WH 5-6" dib 
 104596 Q NARDOM SORT 09 300 $225.00 $225.00 $37,314.03 $37,314.03 $124.38 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 All conifer species except WRC 2"+  
 104777 LOST AND FOUND SORT 02 1,139 $600.11 $730.00 $317,130.46 $465,080.46 $408.32 2 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 DF Sawlog 5" to 11" dib 
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 June 2023 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 104778 LOST AND FOUND SORT 03 981 $649.73 $725.00 $218,251.37 $292,086.37 $297.74 4 Murphy Company 
 DF Sawlog 12" to 19" dib 
 104779 LOST AND FOUND SORT 04 302 $600.60 $759.00 $72,005.72 $119,843.72 $396.83 2 Fritch Forest Products, Inc. 
 DF Sawlog 20" + dib 
 104780 LOST AND FOUND SORT 05 703 $1,100.00 $1,450.00 $483,764.88 $729,814.88 $1,038.14 2 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 RC Camprun 5"+dib 
 104781 LOST AND FOUND SORT 06 641 $425.00 $455.00 $476.58  $19,706.58   $30.74 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 Whitewood Sawlog 5" to 11" dib 
 104782 LOST AND FOUND SORT 07 481 $425.00 $425.00 ($2,297.50)  ($2,297.50)           ($4.78) 4 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 Whitewood Sawlog 12" + dib 
 104783 LOST AND FOUND SORT 08 214 $500.23 $550.00 $39,869.73 $50,519.73 $236.07 1 Port Angeles Hardwood 
 Red Alder Sawlog 6" + dib 
 104784 LOST AND FOUND SORT 09 64 $225.00 $227.34 ($5,378.34) ($5,228.58) ($81.70) 1 Evergreen Fibre 
 Conifer Pulp 2"+ dib 
 104785 LOST AND FOUND SORT 10 103 $225.00 $337.77 ($15,283.81) ($3,668.50) ($35.62) 2 C & C Logging 
 Hardwood Pulp 2" + dib 
 104786 LOST AND FOUND SORT 11 50 $1,200.00 $2,601.77 $31,879.67 $101,968.17 $2,039.36 2 Bell Timber, Inc. 
 Red Cedar Poles 35' + 
 104787 LOST AND FOUND SORT 12 50 $900.00 $1,075.88 $21,085.67 $29,879.67 $597.59 1 Stella-Jones Corporation 
 Douglas Fir Poles 35' + 
 105489 LOST AND FOUND SORT 01 1,402 $700.05 $820.00 $404,888.38 $573,058.38 $408.74 1 Murphy Company 
 DF High Quality B Sort 12" to 19"  dib 
 


