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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 June 2014 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 90288 INDIAN CREEK  Clallam Ol 2057 $539,778.74 Project Pending - See Sort Sales  
 SORTS Results 
 90312 WEST HAGEN  Clark PC 10397 $2,653,000.00 $2,950,771.82 $283.81 11% 2.00 High Cascade, Inc. 
 CREEK 
 90696 UPPER OLE CK  Clark PC 4265 $1,088,000.00 $1,726,857.99 $404.89 59% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 VRH 
 90889 LOWER LARCH Clark PC 3471 $914,000.00 $1,105,489.00 $318.49 21% 4.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 90743 RIB ROAST VRH  Cowlitz PC 5113 $1,066,000.00 NO BIDS 
 AND THIN 
 90761 GOOD SPREAD  Jefferson,  Ol 7909 $1,144,000.00 $1,220,020.37 $154.26 7% 1.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 VDT VRH Clallam 
 88187 * NUTHATCH Lewis SP 3042 $774,000.00 $1,009,672.00 $331.91 30% 5.00 A & W Timber Brokers, Inc. 
 90654 NASHVILLE THIN  Lewis PC 2180 $457,000.00 $582,828.30 $267.35 28% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 AND VRH 
 90668 HORNET Okanogan NE 3381 $374,000.00 $952,235.52 $281.64 155% 3.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 89556 TRIO SORTS Skagit NW 885 $223,463.79 $240,644.79 $271.92 8% 2.25 See Sort Sales Results 
 90634 RYE BREAD Skagit NW 4377 $1,499,000.00 $1,976,036.00 $451.46 32% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 90590 FIFTEEN MILE  Stevens NE 5475 $1,331,416.72 $1,525,974.62 $278.72 15% 1.67 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 90888 EAST JOHNSON Thurston PC 10015 $3,142,000.00 $4,151,290.74 $414.51 32% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 90746 * NORTH ZONE THIN Thurston, Grays  PC 2513 $650,000.00 NO BIDS 
 Harbor 
 90777 HILLARD AND  Whatcom NW 1232 $349,000.00 $377,520.00 $306.43 8% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 CRONK 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2014 15 12 1 2 66,312 56,629 1,523 8,160 85% $13,948,880.51 $17,819,341.15 $314.67 28% 2.66 
YTD FY 2014 118 115 1 2 483,503 473,816 1,523 8,164 99% $118,796,075.29 $172,985,827.64 $365.09 46% 3.00 
   
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 89570 NORTH TEXAS  Clallam Ol 381 $37,000.00 NO BIDS 
 BLOWDOWN 
 90940 N-1100 VDT Jefferson Ol 3421 $204,000.00 NO BIDS 
 90528 CAMO Okanogan NE 3344 $248,000.00 $802,618.85 $240.02 224% 3.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
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SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2014 3 1 0 2 7,146 3,344 0 3,802 47% $248,000.00 $802,618.85 $240.02 224% 3.00 
YTD FY 2014 18 15 0 3 27,392 22,196 0 5,196 81% $2,101,489.32 $4,056,217.03 $182.75 93% 2.21 
   
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2014 18 13 1 4 73,458 59,973 1,523 11,962 82% $14,196,880.51 $18,621,960.00 $310.51 31% 2.69 
YTD FY 2014 136 130 1 5 510,895 496,012 1,523 13,360 98% $120,897,564.61 $177,042,044.67 $356.93 46% 2.91 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 June 2014 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 91006 TRIO SORT 03 195 $600.00 $680.00 $73,257.17 $88,857.17 $455.68 2 Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc. 
 91007 TRIO SORT 04 31 $450.00 $501.00 $6,615.02 $8,196.02 $264.39 3 Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc. 
 91008 TRIO SORT 05 552 $500.00 $500.00 $144,258.45 $144,258.45 $261.34 2 Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc. 
 91009 TRIO SORT 06 107 $243.00 $243.00 ($666.85) ($666.85) ($6.23) 2 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 91110 INDIAN CREEK SORT 01 16 $950.00 $950.00 $8,079.91 $8,079.91 $504.99 1 McFarland Cascade Holdings Inc. 
 91111 INDIAN CREEK SORT 02 77 $725.06 $735.00 $17,767.72 $18,532.72 $240.68 1 Olympic Panel Products, LLC 
 91112 INDIAN CREEK SORT 03 145 $725.00 $725.00 $34,072.77 $34,072.77 $234.98 1 Olympic Panel Products, LLC 
 91113 INDIAN CREEK SORT 04 678 $590.00 $590.00 $180,941.01 $180,941.01 $266.87 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 91114 INDIAN CREEK SORT 05 459 $565.00 $259,335.00 0 NO BIDS 
 91115 INDIAN CREEK SORT 06 40 $600.00 $600.00 $7,262.99 $7,262.99 $181.57 1 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 91116 INDIAN CREEK SORT 07 49 $950.00 $950.00 $29,539.88 $29,539.88 $602.85 2 Marys River Lumber Co. 
 91117 INDIAN CREEK SORT 08 94 $550.00 $550.00 $21,594.12 $21,594.12 $229.72 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 91118 INDIAN CREEK SORT 09 75 $475.00 $35,625.00 0 NO BIDS  
 91119 INDIAN CREEK SORT 10 96 $450.00 $450.00 $12,152.13 $12,152.13 $126.58 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 91120 INDIAN CREEK SORT 11 34 $725.00 $725.00 $7,729.38 $7,729.38 $227.33 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 91121 INDIAN CREEK SORT 12 174 $234.00  ($59,230.53)   0 NO BIDS 
 91122 INDIAN CREEK SORT 13 120 $234.00 $234.00 ($15,090.64) ($15,090.64) ($125.76) 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 91157 FIFTEEN MILE SORT 01 801 $420.00 $511.20 $135,963.24 $209,014.44 $260.94 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 91158 FIFTEEN MILE SORT 02 713 $400.00 $430.00 $130,366.25 $151,756.25 $212.84 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 91159 FIFTEEN MILE SORT 03 414 $403.03 $409.23 $55,899.44 $58,466.44 $141.22 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 91160 FIFTEEN MILE SORT 04 606 $333.92 $344.52 ($155.51) $6,268.49 $10.34 2 IFG Timber, LLC 
 91161 FIFTEEN MILE SORT 05 1,508 $747.98 $769.98 $832,825.44 $866,000.44 $574.27 1 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 91162 FIFTEEN MILE SORT 06 238 $879.83 $1,077.79 $143,677.68 $190,792.68 $801.65 3 Bell Timber, Inc. 
 91163 FIFTEEN MILE SORT 07 558 $351.98 $351.98 $43,069.99 $43,069.99 $77.19 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 91164 FIFTEEN MILE SORT 08 92 $225.00 $298.35 ($17,010.63) ($10,262.43) ($111.55) 3 Ponderay Newsprint Company 
 91165 FIFTEEN MILE SORT 09 545 $150.00 $157.50 $6,780.82 $10,868.32 $19.94 1 Home Fires Wood Company 


