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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 January 2016 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 90289 BOUNDARY  Clallam Ol 6331 $635,000.00 $839,413.00 $132.59 32% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 BASCULE 
 92869 COTTAGE SORTS Clark PC 10545 $3,253,673.44 $3,557,721.70 $337.38 9% 2.17 See Sort Sales Results 
 92644 MIXED GRAVY  Cowlitz PC 8317 $1,321,000.00 $2,365,429.16 $284.41 79% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 VRH THIN 
 92836 SNAHAPISH RISE Jefferson Ol 4537 $515,000.00 $995,648.00 $219.45 93% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92537 SPRINGBOARD Lewis PC 4704 $1,164,000.00 $1,803,423.00 $383.38 55% 5.00 Western Timber Inc. 
 91801 * PARK BENCH VDT  Pierce SP 8457 $1,799,000.00 $3,303,332.96 $390.60 84% 7.00 Bell Timber, Inc. 
 & VRH 
 92229 NEWMAN VRH &  Skagit NW 4897 $859,000.00 NO BIDS 
 VDT 
 92545 YAKIMA VALLEY  Snohomish NW 1594 $65,000.00 $116,553.76 $73.12 79% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 VDT 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2016 8 7 0 1 49,382 43,942 0 5,440 90% $8,376,130.09 $12,981,521.58 $295.42 55% 3.45 
YTD FY 2016 59 55 0 4 215,093 207,704 0 7,389 97% $44,124,119.06 $62,731,494.95 $302.02 42% 2.67  

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 
None Offered 

YTD FY 2016 6 6 0 0 8,642 8,642 0 0 100% $626,000.00 $1,099,737.99 $127.26 76% 1.83  

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2016 8 7 0 1 49,382 43,942 0 5,440 90% $8,376,130.09 $12,981,521.58 $295.42 55% 3.45 
YTD FY 2016 65 61 0 4 223,735 216,346 0 7,389 97% $44,750,119.06 $63,831,232.94 $295.04 43% 2.59 
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 January 2016 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92870 COTTAGE SORT 1 471 $440.00 $554.08 $90,493.23 $144,224.91 $306.21 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92871 COTTAGE SORT 2 1,361 $500.00 $623.32 $309,268.74 $503,107.26 $369.66 3 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92872 COTTAGE SORT 3 3,119 $525.00 $560.66 $1,003,351.11 $1,114,574.65 $357.35 3 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92873 COTTAGE SORT 4 1,628 $490.00 $592.75 $356,580.84 $523,857.84 $321.78 1 Swanson Brothers Lumber  
 Company, Inc. 
 92874 COTTAGE SORT 5 1,738 $575.00 $645.45 $677,820.00 $800,262.10 $460.45 4 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 92875 COTTAGE SORT 6 488 $600.00 $620.20 $206,243.44 $216,101.04 $442.83 2 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 92876 COTTAGE SORT 7 199 $600.00 $610.00 $74,537.44 $76,527.44 $384.56 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92877 COTTAGE SORT 8 194 $400.00 $415.00 ($32,867.48) ($29,957.48) ($154.42) 3 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 92878 COTTAGE SORT 9 613 $450.00 $451.09 $164,308.52 $164,976.69 $269.13 3 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 92879 COTTAGE SORT 10 543 $950.00 $376,543.35 0 NO BIDS 
 92880 COTTAGE SORT 11 94 $364.00 $455.00 $8,798.40 $17,352.40 $184.60 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 92881 COTTAGE SORT 12 32 $338.00 $455.00 $2,163.20 $5,907.20 $184.60 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 93282 COUGAR FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORT 1 78 $365.00 $490.00 $14,317.64 $24,067.64 $308.56 2 SDS Lumber Company 
 93283 COUGAR FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORT 2 1,400 $300.00 $320.00 ($162,359.87) ($134,359.87) ($95.97) 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93284 COUGAR FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORT 3 472 $400.00 $500.00 $38,958.34 $86,158.34 $182.54 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
 93285 COUGAR FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORT 4 1,117 $330.00 $367.00 $123,875.67 $165,204.67 $147.90 2 High Cascade, Inc. 
 93286 COUGAR FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORT 5 579 $400.00 $437.00 $124,342.68 $145,765.68 $251.75 1 High Cascade, Inc. 
 93287 COUGAR FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORT 6 200 $144.00 $153.00 ($34,540.74) ($32,740.74) ($163.70) 1 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 93443 COTTAGE SORT 13 65 $700.00 $767.00 $16,432.65 $20,787.65 $319.81 1 McFarland Cascade Holdings, Inc. 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS 
 January 2016 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    TREATMENT  VOLUME TOTAL     
 NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION ACRES OFFERED MINIMUM  TOTAL BID PRICETOTAL REVENUE NET $ / MBF 
  MBF BID 

 COUGAR FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORTS Yakima SE 907 3,846 $1,266,280.00 $1,415,782.00 $254,095.72 $66.07 

 PROJECTS  PROJECTS  NOT  TREATMENT  VOLUME  VOLUME  
 OFFERED AWARDED AWARDED ACRES OFFERED AWARDED 

January 2016 1 1 0 907 3,846 3,846 
YTD FY 2016 3 3 0 1,778 6,928 6,928 


