
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 February 2021 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100653 SALTY VIEW Clallam OLY 8628 $2,180,000.00 $2,387,841.45 $276.75 10% 1.00 Murphy Company 
 100654 TEXAS SHOWDOWN Clallam OLY 6055 $1,908,422.75 $2,640,667.75 $436.11 38% 2.50 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 100783 CHARLOTTE VRH  Grays Harbor PC 8079 $3,181,000.00 $3,215,988.01 $398.07 1% 1.00 Western Forest Products 
 RMZ 
 100661 FIRSURE Jefferson OLY 3766 $727,000.00 $738,425.00 $196.08 2% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 98354 LIBERATOR Lewis PC 9157 $3,498,000.00 $4,458,539.01 $486.90 27% 3.00 Western Forest Products 
 100023 FRANCES 40 SORTS Pacific PC 3320 $1,366,312.44 $1,694,788.84 $510.48 24% 2.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 81248 * HYDE VDT & VRH Pierce SP 5329 $1,476,000.00 $2,306,819.88 $432.88 56% 4.00 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 100419 THORIN NORTH Skagit NW 2587 $1,023,000.00 $1,219,852.00 $471.53 19% 2.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 
 101388 THORIN SOUTH Skagit NW 835 $413,000.00 $639,280.00 $765.60 55% 3.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 
 100353 MADERA Sorts Snohomish NW 66 ($7,170.17) ($5,982.17) ($90.64) -17% 4.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 99056 * LEESIDE Thurston SP 8708 $3,383,000.00 $3,697,893.00 $424.65 9% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

February 2021 11 11 0 0 56,530 56,425 0 105 100% $19,117,065.02 $22,994,112.77 $407.52 20% 2.23 
YTD FY 2021 76 72 0 4 380,503 356,504 0 23,999 94% $108,850,587.23 $148,403,170.53 $416.27 36% 2.49  

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 101381 Q CONGER Okanogan NE 3277 $231,000.00 $728,956.75 $222.45 216% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

February 2021 1 1 0 0 3,277 3,277 0 0 100% $231,000.00 $728,956.75 $222.45 216% 2.00 
YTD FY 2021 5 4 0 1 9,253 9,007 0 246 97% $566,000.00 $1,545,630.30 $171.60 173% 2.50 

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

February 2021 12 12 0 0 59,807 59,702 0 105 100% $19,348,065.02 $23,723,069.52 $397.36 23% 2.21 
YTD FY 2021 81 76 0 5 389,756 365,511 0 24,245 94% $109,416,587.23 $149,948,800.83 $410.24 37% 2.50 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 February 2021 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100024 FRANCES 40 SORT 1 99 $675.00 $700.00 $42,429.71 $44,904.71 $453.58 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100025 FRANCES 40 SORT 2 377 $700.00 $855.00 $162,555.98 $220,990.98 $586.18 2 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 100026 FRANCES 40 SORT 3 1,201 $750.00 $902.00 $601,392.29 $783,944.29 $652.74 4 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 100027 FRANCES 40 SORT 4 89 $1,700.00 $2,002.00 $128,477.10 $155,355.10 $1,745.56 2 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 100028 FRANCES 40 SORT 5 187 $575.00 $658.90 $47,384.48 $63,073.78 $337.29 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 100029 FRANCES 40 SORT 6 1,151 $600.00 $657.77 $342,391.37 $408,884.64 $355.24 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 100030 FRANCES 40 SORT 7 105 $300.00 $31,500.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100031 FRANCES 40 SORT 8 38 $561.84 $609.21 $12,076.21 $13,876.21 $365.16 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 100032 FRANCES 40 SORT 9 49 $312.00 $352.95 ($1,051.89) $954.66 $19.48 2 MTS Enterprises 
 100034 FRANCES 40 SORT 11 24 $390.00 $541.97 ($842.81) $2,804.47 $116.85 3 Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC 
 101150 MADERA Sort 14 66 $162.00 $180.00 ($7,170.17) ($5,982.17) ($90.64) 4 Swanson Bark and Wood Products,  
 Inc 
 101616 TEXAS SHOWDOWN SORT 1 764 $730.00 $900.00 $202,012.14 $331,892.14 $434.41 3 Western Timber, Inc. 
 101617 TEXAS SHOWDOWN SORT 2 1,710 $650.00 $730.00 $582,791.59 $719,591.59 $420.81 2 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 101618 TEXAS SHOWDOWN SORT 3 578 $650.00 $750.00 $155,877.23 $213,677.23 $369.68 3 Murphy Company 
 101619 TEXAS SHOWDOWN SORT 4 627 $1,500.00 $1,975.00 $753,762.97 $1,051,587.97 $1,677.17 4 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 101620 TEXAS SHOWDOWN SORT 5 1,298 $450.00 $450.00 $90,968.77 $90,968.77 $70.08 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 101621 TEXAS SHOWDOWN SORT 6 509 $475.00 $565.00 $47,379.65 $93,189.65 $183.08 3 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 101622 TEXAS SHOWDOWN SORT 7 120 $600.00 $750.00 $35,430.46 $53,430.46 $445.25 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 101623 TEXAS SHOWDOWN SORT 8 159 $180.00 $180.00 ($26,891.07) ($26,891.07) ($169.13) 1 Evergreen Fibre 
 101624 TEXAS SHOWDOWN SORT 9 220 $225.00 $288.00 ($27,307.76) ($13,447.76) ($61.13) 2 Evergreen Fibre 
 101795 TEXAS SHOWDOWN SORT 10 70 $1,800.00 $2,261.00 $94,398.77 $126,668.77 $1,809.55 4 Stella-Jones Corporation 


