
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 February 2016 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92346 SIEBERT SPLIT  Clallam Ol 2775 $827,023.31 $1,082,696.55 $390.16 31% 2.09 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 92837 CASSIVANT SORTS Clallam Ol 3843 $1,066,002.36 $1,490,607.86 $387.88 40% 2.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 92632 BLACK WIDOW  Grays Harbor PC 7830 $3,771,821.75 $4,292,307.65 $548.19 14% 2.29 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 92039 UP TOP Grays Harbor,  SP 7927 $1,323,000.00 $1,989,633.27 $250.99 50% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 Thurston 
 92942 SPAWNER Jefferson Ol 3337 $495,000.00 $707,189.00 $211.92 43% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92716 FLASH Lewis PC 7932 $2,224,000.00 $2,317,745.21 $292.20 4% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93222 TOWER FIRE  Pend Oreille NE 8484 $1,308,000.00 $1,915,374.40 $225.76 46% 2.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 SALVAGE 
 92211 LIKE IKE VRH &  Skagit NW 7766 $2,117,000.00 $3,136,780.00 $403.91 48% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 VDT 
 92000 EAST BLOODY RUN  Thurston SP 2478 $718,000.00 $1,161,006.00 $468.53 62% 5.00 A & W Timber Brokers, Inc. 
 92529 MIZZEN Whatcom NW 4212 $1,316,000.00 $1,543,423.00 $366.43 17% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

February 2016 10 10 0 0 56,584 56,444 0 140 100% $15,072,768.41 $19,636,762.94 $347.90 30% 2.24 
YTD FY 2016 68 65 0 3 266,780 264,148 0 2,632 99% $59,196,887.47 $82,368,257.89 $311.83 39% 2.61 

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

None Offered 

YTD FY 2016 6 6 0 0 8,642 8,642 0 0 100% $626,000.00 $1,099,737.99 $127.26 76% 1.83 
 
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

February 2016 10 10 0 0 56,584 56,444 0 140 100% $15,072,768.41 $19,636,762.94 $347.90 30% 2.24 
YTD FY 2016 74 71 0 3 275,422 272,790 0 2,632 99% $59,822,887.47 $83,467,995.88 $305.98 40% 2.54 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 February 2016 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92852 BLACK WIDOW SORT 1 220 $400.00 $521.12 $82,115.00 $108,761.40 $494.37 2 Manke Lumber Co. Inc. 
 92853 BLACK WIDOW SORT 2 712 $490.00 $508.00 $329,834.00 $342,650.00 $481.25 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92854 BLACK WIDOW SORT 3 1,816 $510.00 $563.00 $877,582.00 $973,830.00 $536.25 2 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 92855 BLACK WIDOW SORT 4 1,646 $490.00 $525.00 $762,509.50 $820,119.50 $498.25 2 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 92856 BLACK WIDOW SORT 5 1,028 $575.00 $675.00 $563,601.00 $666,401.00 $648.25 3 Olympic Panel Products, LLC 
 92857 BLACK WIDOW SORT 6 1,186 $575.00 $670.00 $650,224.50 $762,894.50 $643.25 2 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 92858 BLACK WIDOW SORT 7 15 $400.00 $6,000.00 0 NO BIDS 
 92859 BLACK WIDOW SORT 8 193 $297.41 $361.22 $52,237.25 $64,553.65 $334.47 3 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92860 BLACK WIDOW SORT 9 358 $500.00 $665.00 $169,423.50 $228,493.50 $638.25 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92861 BLACK WIDOW SORT 10 113 $650.00 $762.70 $70,427.25 $83,162.35 $735.95 3 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92862 BLACK WIDOW SORT 11 157 $400.00 $425.00 $58,600.25 $62,525.25 $398.25 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92863 BLACK WIDOW SORT 12 161 $425.00 $450.00 $64,118.25 $68,143.25 $423.25 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92864 BLACK WIDOW SORT 13 17 $900.00 $1,495.00 $14,845.25 $24,960.25 $1,468.25 2 Alta Forest Products LLC 
 92865 BLACK WIDOW SORT 14 55 $338.00 $403.00 $18,590.00 $22,165.00 $403.00 2 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 93424 BLACK WIDOW SORT 15 153 $338.00 $416.00 $51,714.00 $63,648.00 $416.00 3 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92972 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 01 125 $950.00 $87,079.01 0 NO BIDS 
 92973 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 02 515 $600.00 $690.00 $152,140.99 $198,490.99 $385.42 4 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 92974 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 03 85 $500.00 $575.00 $17,153.80 $23,528.80 $276.81 2 Fritch Mill 
 92975 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 04 163 $525.00 $562.00 $26,963.36 $32,994.36 $202.42 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92976 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 05 686 $475.00 $509.00 $151,344.90 $174,668.90 $254.62 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92977 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 06 445 $1,000.00 $1,575.00 $300,250.13 $556,125.13 $1,249.72 3 Alta Forest Products LLC 
 92978 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 07 292 $375.00 $375.00 $35,393.14 $35,393.14 $121.21 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92979 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 08 246 $420.00 $420.00 $27,854.43 $27,854.43 $113.23 1 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 92980 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 09 54 $625.00 $635.00 $20,056.65 $20,596.65 $381.42 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 92981 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 10 59 $425.00 $430.00 $10,080.11 $10,375.11 $175.85 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 92982 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 11 69 $234.00 $290.25 ($636.91) $3,244.34 $47.02 2 Evergreen Fibre 
 92983 SIEBERT SPLIT SORT 12 36 $225.00 $227.25 ($656.30) ($575.30) ($15.98) 3 Evergreen Fibre 
 93043 CASSIVANT SORT 01 271 $600.00 $668.00 $87,268.00 $105,696.00 $390.02 4 Fritch Mill 
 93044 CASSIVANT SORT 02 277 $500.00 $560.00 $62,932.23 $79,552.23 $287.19 3 Fritch Mill 
 93045 CASSIVANT SORT 03 566 $525.00 $562.00 $121,227.10 $142,169.10 $251.18 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93046 CASSIVANT SORT 04 1,495 $475.00 $529.00 $346,334.92 $427,064.92 $285.66 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 93047 CASSIVANT SORT 05 488 $1,000.00 $1,575.00 $354,547.69 $635,147.69 $1,301.53 1 Alta Forest Products LLC 
 93048 CASSIVANT SORT 06 60 $420.00 $420.00 $8,295.13 $8,295.13 $138.25 1 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 93049 CASSIVANT SORT 07 328 $375.00 $375.00 $44,933.43 $44,933.43 $136.99 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 93050 CASSIVANT SORT 08 96 $593.75 $602.19 $36,223.01 $37,033.01 $385.76 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 93052 CASSIVANT SORT 09 109 $234.00 $290.25 $2,337.20 $8,468.45 $77.69 2 Evergreen Fibre 
 93053 CASSIVANT SORT 10 153 $225.00 $227.25 $1,903.65 $2,247.90 $14.69 3 Evergreen Fibre 
 93364 ALEC FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORT 01 752 $335.00 $335.00 $57,721.85 $57,721.85 $76.76 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93365 ALEC FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORT 02 2,010 $339.00 $342.00 $47,393.13 $53,423.13 $26.58 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 93366 ALEC FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORT 03 180 $280.50 $280.50 ($1,895.72) ($1,895.72) ($10.53) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 93367 ALEC FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORT 04 700 $230.40 $230.40 ($73,173.08) ($73,173.08) ($104.53) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS 
 February 2016 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    TREATMENT  VOLUME TOTAL     
 NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION ACRES OFFERED MINIMUM  TOTAL BID PRICETOTAL REVENUE NET $ / MBF 
  MBF BID 

 ALEC FIRE SALVAGE FIT SORTS Ferry NE 873 3,642 $1,145,080.00 $1,151,110.00 $36,076.18 $9.91 
 PROJECTS  PROJECTS  NOT  TREATMENT  VOLUME  VOLUME  
 OFFERED AWARDED AWARDED ACRES OFFERED AWARDED 

February 2016 1 1 0 873 3,642 3,642 
YTD FY 2016 4 4 0 2,651 10,570 10,570 

 


