
 Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 December 2022 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100840 BALTIMORE PLOT Lewis PC 9907 $2,975,000.00 $4,179,089.66 $421.83 40% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 102792 THYME MACHINE Lewis PC 8030 $2,946,000.00 $4,167,642.29 $519.01 41% 4.00 Murphy Company 
 103185 BELL OF THE BALL Lewis PC 1962 $581,000.00 $994,579.00 $506.92 71% 7.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
 102816 FANGORN Skagit NW 2280 $773,000.00 $1,488,835.00 $653.00 93% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 103351 BEAR BONES Skagit NW 1478 $266,000.00 $485,725.00 $328.64 83% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 102160 V Twin Snohomish NW 4898 $496,000.00 $1,257,185.45 $256.67 153% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 103275 BOX OF RAIN Whatcom NW 1518 $434,000.00 $696,015.00 $458.51 60% 4.00 Frank Harkness Trucking and Logging 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2022 7 7 0 0 30,073 30,073 0 0 100% $8,471,000.00 $13,269,071.40 $441.23 57% 3.86 
YTD FY 2023 49 47 0 2 207,151 198,195 0 8,956 96% $60,611,078.34 $84,223,503.93 $424.95 39% 2.93 
   
 
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2022 7 7 0 0 30,073 30,073 0 0 100% $8,471,000.00 $13,269,071.40 $441.23 57% 3.86 
YTD FY 2023 60 56 0 4 219,692 210,510 0 9,182 96% $61,707,968.34 $86,620,733.41 $411.48 40% 2.85 
 


