
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 December 2015 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92312 RIDGE WALKER  Cowlitz PC 106 $5,957.20 $11,212.15 $105.78 88% 2.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 92822 WILLY THINNER Jefferson Ol 3390 $121,000.00 $255,450.50 $75.35 111% 3.00 Ryfield Properties, Inc. 
 92609 DIAMOND JIM Lewis PC 6485 $1,782,000.00 $2,312,049.51 $356.52 30% 5.00 Murphy Company 
 91844 TRAP DOOR VRH & Mason SP 5203 $1,307,000.00 $2,411,023.00 $463.39 84% 4.00 Murphy Company 
  VDT 
 92040 * TWIN GOATS Mason SP 3427 $860,000.00 $1,469,081.91 $428.68 71% 2.00 Murphy Company 
 93171 9 MILE FIRE  Okanogan NE 1183 $75,000.00 $76,153.31 $64.37 2% 2.00 Double A Logging 
 SALVAGE 
 92557 BACKWOODS VRH  Skagit NW 3506 $885,000.00 $1,340,057.57 $382.22 51% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 & VDT 
 92577 SKAARUP VIEW  Skagit NW 1908 $218,000.00 $250,459.20 $131.27 15% 1.00 Pulley Corporation 
 VRH & VDT 
 91137 PILCHUCK  Snohomish NW 4343 $467,000.00 $778,832.68 $179.33 67% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 REUNION VRH &  
 VDT 
 93159 GOLD HILL FIRE  Stevens NE 659 $118,000.00 $146,745.45 $222.68 24% 2.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 SALVAGE 
 93160 WINDY GAP  Stevens NE 906 $87,000.00 $87,809.20 $96.92 1% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 BLOWDOWN SALV 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2015 11 11 0 0 31,116 31,116 0 0 100% $5,925,957.20 $9,138,874.48 $293.70 54% 2.36 
YTD FY 2016 52 48 0 4 172,728 163,762 0 8,966 95% $35,747,988.97 $49,749,973.37 $303.79 39% 2.55  
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92344 GOODMAN PLUS  Jefferson, Clallam Ol 2096 $86,000.00 $113,677.00 $54.24 32% 1.00 Ryfield Properties, Inc. 
 DEMO VDT 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2015 1 1 0 0 2,096 2,096 0 0 100% $86,000.00 $113,677.00 $54.24 32% 1.00 
YTD FY 2016 6 6 0 0 8,642 8,642 0 0 100% $626,000.00 $1,099,737.99 $127.26 76% 1.83 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2015 12 12 0 0 33,212 33,212 0 0 100% $6,011,957.20 $9,252,551.48 $278.59 54% 2.25 
YTD FY 2016 58 54 0 4 181,370 172,404 0 8,966 95% $36,373,988.97 $50,849,711.36 $294.95 40% 2.47 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 December 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92323 RIDGE WALKER SORT 11 106 $262.50 $312.08 $5,957.20 $11,212.15 $105.78 2 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 


