
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 August 2016 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 93218 TRIBUTE Grays Harbor SP 10381 $3,070,000.00 $3,323,107.00 $320.11 8% 2.00 Murphy Company 
 93869 GOLD FISH Jefferson Ol 5416 $959,000.00 $1,531,645.00 $282.80 60% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93165 KARISTAN King SP 2283 $267,000.00 $382,683.69 $167.62 43% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93545 LUNCH LADY Lewis PC 9809 $2,777,000.00 $4,070,195.00 $414.94 47% 4.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92990 FLY NET Mason SP 2176 $346,000.00 $811,013.00 $372.71 134% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 93491 RENDEZVOUS  Skagit NW 3729 $1,297,599.02 $1,634,408.90 $438.30 26% 2.33 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

August 2016 6 6 0 0 33,794 33,794 0 0 100% $8,716,599.02 $11,753,052.59 $347.79 35% 3.06 
YTD FY 2017 13 11 0 2 48,775 43,174 0 5,601 89% $10,534,187.25 $14,241,230.37 $329.86 35% 2.71 
 
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

August 2016 6 6 0 0 33,794 33,794 0 0 100% $8,716,599.02 $11,753,052.59 $347.79 35% 3.06 
YTD FY 2017 13 11 0 2 48,775 43,174 0 5,601 89% $10,534,187.25 $14,241,230.37 $329.86 35% 2.71 
  

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 94161 RENDEZVOUS Sort 01 537 $650.00 $737.00 $233,177.28 $279,896.28 $521.22 3 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 94162 RENDEZVOUS Sort 02 552 $540.00 $617.00 $190,479.81 $232,983.81 $422.07 2 Great Western Lumber Co. 
 94163 RENDEZVOUS Sort 03 1,464 $540.00 $605.17 $508,098.95 $603,507.83 $412.23 5 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 94164 RENDEZVOUS Sort 04 484 $500.00 $572.00 $147,374.19 $182,222.19 $376.49 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 94165 RENDEZVOUS Sort 05 355 $450.00 $510.00 $91,509.10 $112,809.10 $317.77 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 94166 RENDEZVOUS Sort 06 155 $1,050.00 $1,650.00 $101,058.78 $194,058.78 $1,251.99 2 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 94167 RENDEZVOUS Sort 07 73 $225.00 $243.00 ($10,106.69) ($8,792.69) ($120.45) 1 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 94168 RENDEZVOUS Sort 08 27 $180.00 $198.00 ($559.65) ($73.65) ($2.73) 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 94169 RENDEZVOUS Sort 09 82 $700.00 $715.00 $36,567.25 $37,797.25 $460.94 2 The Oeser Company 


